Jeremy B. Yamaguchi
Mayor

Craig S. Green
Mayor Pro Tem

Scott W. Nelson
Council Member

Constance M. Underhill
Council Member

Chad P. Wanke
Council Member

Patrick J. Melia
City Clerk

Kevin A. Larson
City Treasurer

Damien R. Arrula
City Administrator

Christian L. Bettenhausen

City Attorney

City of Placentia

401 E. Chapman Avenue

Placentia, CA 92870

Phone: (714) 993-8117

Fax: (714) 961-0283
Email:

administration@placentia.org
Website: www.placentia.org

Regular Meeting Agenda
December 6, 2016
Placentia City Council
Placentia City Council as Successor to the Placentia
Redevelopment Agency
Placentia Industrial Commercial
Development Authority

Migsion Statement
The City Councils iy committed to-keeping Placentio o pleasant place
by providing a safe famiy atmosphere, superior public services and
policies that promote the highest stondardy of community life.

Visiow Statement
The City of Placentia will maintain anopen, honest, responsive and
innovative government that delivery quality servicey inv v fair and
equitable manner while optimiging ovaidable resources.

Copies of all agenda materials are available for public review in the Office of the
City Clerk, online at www.placentia.org, and at the Placentia Library Reference
Desk. Persons who have questions concerning any agenda item may call the City
Clerk’s Office, (714) 993-8231, to make inquiry concerning the nature of the
item described on the agenda.

Pro ressin ard Mem

Any person who wishes to speak regarding an item on the agenda or on a subject
within the City’s jurisdiction during the “Oral Communications” portion of the
agenda should fill out a "Speaker Request Form” and give it to the City Clerk
BEFORE that portion of the agenda is called. Testimony for Public Hearings will
only be taken at the time of the hearing. Any person who wishes to speak on a
Public Hearing item should fill out a "Speaker Request Form” and give it to the
City Clerk BEFORE the item is called.

The Council and Board members encourage free expression of all points of view.
To allow all persons the opportunity to speak, please keep your remarks brief.
If others have already expressed your position, you may simply indicate that you
agree with a previous speaker. If appropriate, a spokesperson may present the
views of an entire group. To encourage all views, the Council and Board
discourage clapping, booing or shouts of approval or disagreement from the
audience.

PLEASE SILENCE ALL PAGERS, CELL PHONES, AND OTHER ELECTRONIC
EQUIPMENT WHILE COUNCIL AND BOARD MEMBERS ARE IN SESSION.

Special Accommodations

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you need special
assistance to participate in this meeting, please contact the City Clerk’s Office at
(714) 993-8231. Notification 48 hours prior to the meeting will generally enable
City Staff to make reasonable arrangements to ensure accessibility.

(28 CFR 35.102.35.104 ADA Title II)

In compliance with California Government Code § 54957.5, any writings or
documents provided to a majority of the City Council regarding any item on this
agenda that are not exempt from disclosure under the Public Records Act will be
made available for public inspection at the City Clerk’s Office at City Hall, 401
East Chapman Avenue, Placentia, during normal business hours.

Study Sessions are open to the public and held in the City Council Chambers or
City Hall Community Room. Executive Sessions are held in the Council Caucus
Room. While the public may be in attendance during oral announcements
preceding Executive Sessions, Executive Sessions are not open to the public.

Placentia City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agenda, December 6, 2016 Page 1 of 7



PLACENTIA CITY COUNCIL
PLACENTIA CITY COUNCIL AS SUCCESSOR TO THE
PLACENTIA REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
PLACENTIA INDUSTRIAL COMMERCIAL DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY
REGULAR MEETING AGENDA- CLOSED SESSION
December 6, 2016
5:30 p.m. - City Council Chambers
401 E. Chapman Avenue, Placentia, CA

CALL TO ORDER:

ROLL CALL: Councilmember/Board Member Nelson
Councilmember/Board Member Underhill
Councilmember/Board Member Wanke
Mayor Pro Tem/Board Vice Chair Green
Mayor/Board Chair Yamaguchi

ORAL COMMUNICATIONS:

At this time the public may address the City Council and Boards of Directors concerning any
items on the Closed Session Agenda only. There is a five (5) minute time limit for each individual
addressing the City Council and Boards of Directors.

The City Council and Boards of Directors will recess to the City Council Caucus Room for the
purpose of conducting their Closed Session proceedings.

CITY COUNCIL:

1. Pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(d)(4):
CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL - POTENTIAL LITIGATION
Number of Cases: 5

2. Pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(d)(2):
CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL - POTENTIAL LITIGATION
Number of Cases: 2

3. Pursuant to Government Code Section 54957.6
CONFERENCE WITH LABOR NEGOTIATOR
Agency Designated Representatives: Damien R. Arrula, City Administrator
Steve Pischel, Director of Administrative Services
Employee Organizations: Placentia City Employees Association (PCEA), Placentia Police
Officers Association (PPOA), Placentia Police Management Association (PPMA), and
Unrepresented Employees

CITY COUNCIL/SUCCESSOR AGENCY:

4. Pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.8:
CONFERENCE WITH REAL PROPERTY NEGOTIATOR
Property: 110 S. Bradford APN: 339-052-24 & 312 S. Melrose APN: 339-393-10
City/Agency Negotiator: Damien R. Arrula, City Administrator/Executive Director
Negotiating Parties: City and Successor Agency to former Redevelopment Agency
Under Negotiation: Price and Terms of Payment

RECESS: The City Council and Boards of Directors will recess to their 7:00 p.m. Regular
Meeting.

Placentia City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agenda, December 6, 2016 Page 2 of 7



PLACENTIA CITY COUNCIL
PLACENTIA CITY COUNCIL AS SUCCESSOR TO THE
PLACENTIA REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
PLACENTIA INDUSTRIAL COMMERCIAL DEVELOPMENT AUTHORITY
REGULAR MEETING AGENDA
December 6, 2016
7:00 p.m. - City Council Chambers
401 E. Chapman Avenue, Placentia, CA

CALL TO ORDER:

ROLL CALL: Councilmember/Board Member Nelson
Councilmember/Board Member Underhill
Councilmember/Board Member Wanke
Mayor Pro Tem/Board Vice Chair Green
Mayor/Board Chair Yamaguchi

INVOCATION: Police Chaplain Ken Milhander
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE: John Wesley Thomas, Boy Scout Troop #99
PRESENTATIONS:

a. Employee of the Quarter- Sworn- Officer Matthew Herren
Presenters: Mayor Yamaguchi and Chief Lenyi

CLOSED SESSION REPORT:
CITY ADMINISTRATOR REPORT:

ORAL COMMUNICATIONS:

At this time the public may address the City Council and Boards of Directors concerning any
agenda item, which is not a public hearing item, or on matters within the jurisdiction of the City
Council and Boards of Directors. There is a five (5) minute time limit for each individual
addressing the City Council and Boards of Directors.

CITY COUNCIL/BOARD MEMBER COMMENTS:

1. CONSENT CALENDAR (Items 1.a. through 1.k.):

All items on the Consent Calendar are considered routine and are enacted by one motion
approving the recommended action listed on the Agenda. Any Member of the City Council and
Boards of Directors or City Administrator may request an item be removed from the Consent
Calendar for discussion. All items removed shall be considered immediately following action on
the remaining items.

l.a. Consideration to Waive Reading in Full of all Ordinances and Resolutions

Fiscal Impact: None
Recommended Action: Approve.

1.b. City Fiscal Year 2016-17 Register for December 6, 2016
Check Register

Fiscal Impact: $377,000.20

Electronic Disbursement Register

Fiscal Impact: $550,207.49

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:
1) Receive and file.

Placentia City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agenda, December 6, 2016 Page 3 of 7




l.c. Second Reading of Ordinance No. 0-2016-07, Adopting State Mandated

Building and Fire Codes

Fiscal Impact: No Fiscal Impacts are Anticipated with this Ordinance as All Costs

will be Recovered Through the Plan Check and Inspection Process.

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Waive Full Reading, by Title Only, and Adopt Ordinance 0-2016-07, An
Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Placentia, California, Repealing
Chapter 18.04 of Title 18 and Chapters 20.03, 20.04, 20.08, 20.12, 20.16,
20.20 and 20.56 of Title 20 of the Placentia Municipal Code and adopting by
reference, the California Fire Code, 2016 Edition, the California Building Code,
2016 Edition, the California Residential Code, 2016 Edition, the California
Plumbing Code, 2016 Edition, the California Electrical Code, 2016 Edition, the
California Mechanical Code, 2016 Edition, and the California Green Building
Standards Code, 2016 Edition, Including All Appendices, with Certain
Amendments, Additions and Deletions Thereto, Including Fees and Penalties.

1.d. Measure M (M2) Expenditure Report for Fiscal Year 2015-16
Fiscal Impact: None
Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:
1) Adopt Resolution No. R-2016-63, A Resolution of the City Council of the City
of Placentia, California, Concerning the Measure M2 Expenditure Report for the
City of Placentia for the Fiscal Year ending June 30, 2016.

l.e. Acceptance of Grant Deed Agreements with the Orange County
Transportation Authority for the Orangethorpe Avenue and Chapman
Avenue Grade Separation Project
Fiscal Impact: Expense: None
Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Accept the four (4) right-of-way grant deeds, one (1) footing easement deed,
and one (1) wall easement deed for the Project; and

2) Authorize the Mayor to sign the Certificate of Acceptance for the grant deeds,
and easement deeds on behalf of the City; and

3) Direct the City Clerk to endorse the grant deeds and public utility easement
deeds which embodies the acceptance of said right-of-ways and easements,
and cause the documents to be submitted to the Orange County Clerk Recorder
for recording of the documents.

1.f. Professional Services Agreement for Real Estate Advisory Services for

207-209 W. Crowther Avenue

Fiscal Impact: Expense: $49,900

Revenue: $35,000 Economic Development Professional
Services
$14,900 General Government Contingency

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Award a Professional Services Agreement to Keyser Marston for Real Estate
Advisory Services for 207-209 W. Crowther Avenue in the amount of $49,900;
and

2) Authorize the City Administrator and/or his designee to execute all necessary
documents, in a form approved by the City Attorney.

1.g. Consideration of Participation in the Open PACE and Ygrene Property
Assessed Clean Energy (PACE) Financing Programs
Fiscal Impact: Expense: $0
Revenue: $10,000 Deposit for City Staff Time
Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:
1) Adopt Resolution R-2016-64, A Resolution of the City Council of the City of
Placentia, California, Consenting to the Inclusion of Properties within the

Territory of the City of Placentia in the CSCDA Open PACE Programs;
Placentia City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agenda, December 6, 2016 Page 4 of 7




Authorizing the California Statewide Communities Development Authority to
Accept Applications from Property Owners, Conduct Contractual Assessments
Proceedings and Levy Contractual Assessments with the Territory of the City
of Placentia; and Authorizing Related Actions; and

2) Adopt Resolution R-2016-65, A Resolution of the City Council of the City of
Placentia, California, Consenting to Inclusion of Properties within the City’s
Jurisdiction in the California Home Finance Authority Community Facilities
District No. 2014-01 (Clean Energy) to Finance Renewable Energy
Improvements, Energy Efficiency and Water Conservation Improvements and
Electric Vehicle Charging Infrastructure and Approving Associate Membership
in the Joint Exercise of Powers Authority Related Thereto; and

3) Adopt Resolution R-2016-66, A Resolution of the City Council of the City of
Placentia, California, Consenting to Inclusion of Properties within the City’s
Jurisdiction in the California Home Finance Authority, Program to Finance
Renewable Energy Generation, Energy and Water Efficiency Improvements
and Electrical Vehicle Charging Infrastructure and Approving Associate
Membership in the Joint Exercise of Powers Authority Related Thereto; and

4) Authorize the City Administrator or designee to execute all necessary
documents, in a form approved by the City Attorney.

1.h. Purchase of Replacement Police Service Rifles, 40MM “Less-Than-Lethal”

Launchers, Ballistic Safety Equipment, and Associated Training

Fiscal Impact: Expense: Expenditure of Assets Forfeiture Funds Not-To-

Exceed $190,000.00 to Purchase Equipment
(Account No.: 213041-6840)

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Adopt Resolution R-2016-67, A Resolution of the City Council of the City of
Placentia, California, authorizing a budget amendment in Fiscal Year 2016-17
increasing the expenditure budget in the asset forfeiture fund in the amount
of $190,000.00 in compliance with City Charter §§ 1206 and 1209 pertaining
to appropriations for actual expenditures; and

2) Approve the purchase of fifty (50) Sig Sauer MCX rifles from Adamson
Industries for an amount-not-to exceed $105,000.00; and

3) Approve the purchase of eight (8) Safaril and Def-Tec LMT 40MM “Less-Than-
Lethal” launcher kits from Aardvark Tactical for an amount not-to-exceed
$10,000; and

4) Approve the purchase of fifty (50) Airframe ATX Ballistic Helmets from Crye
Precision, LLC for an amount not-to-exceed $42,500.00; and

5) Approve the purchase of one hundred (100) Ballistic Plates (50 Front and 50
Back plates) from Longfri Technologies for an amount not-to-exceed
$12,000.00; and

6) Approve the purchase of fifty (50) 5.11 Ballistic Plate carriers from Galls, Inc.
for an amount not-to-exceed $7,000.00; and

7) Approve the purchase of P.O.S.T. certified Rifle Training for sworn personnel
from National Training Concepts for an amount not-to-exceed $13,500.00; and

8) Authorize the City Administrator or his designee to execute all necessary
documents to effectuate these actions.

1.i. Eagle Scout Service Project for Police Department Motor Barn and Waiver

of City Plan Check and Permit Fees

Fiscal Impact: None: All Funds for the Project are Raised through Private

Donations; Waiver of Plan Check and Permit Fees and In-House Staff Support

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Approve the Eagle Scout Service Project for Police Department Motor Barn
Improvements; and

2) Waive all plan check and permit fees and authorize in-house staff support for
this youth project; and

3) Authorize the City Administrator and/or his designee to execute all necessary

documents, subject to City Attorney approval.
Placentia City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agenda, December 6, 2016 Page 5 of 7



1.j. Temporary Parking Permit Program on the Corner of Crowther Avenue
and Melrose Street

Fiscal Impact: There is a minimal fiscal impact associated with the recommended

action. The estimated cost to purchase and install the parking restriction street

signs is approximately $800. The cost to enforce the parking restrictions will be
offset by parking citation revenues collected.

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Adopt Resolution No. R-2016-68, A Resolution of the City Council of the City
of Placentia, California, Prohibiting Vehicle Parking and Authorizing the
Establishment of Temporary Preferential Parking Privileges on Crowther
Avenue and Melrose Street.

SUCCESSOR AGENCY:

1.k. Amended Long Range Property Management Plan for the Successor

Agency to the Former Redevelopment Agency

Fiscal Impact: None

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council acting in its sole

capacity as the Successor Agency to the Redevelopment Agency of the City of

Placentia, take the following action:

1) Adopt Resolution RSA-2016-02, A Resolution of the Successor Agency to the
Redevelopment Agency of the City of Placentia, California, Approving the
Amended Long Range Property Management Plan Pursuant to Health and
Safety Code Section 34191.5.

2. PUBLIC HEARING: None

3. REGULAR AGENDA:

3.a. September 2016 (Preliminary) Treasurer’s Report
Fiscal Impact: None
Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:
1) Receive and file the September 2016 (Preliminary) Treasurer’s Report. -

3.b. Selection of Ad-Hoc Committee to Review Request for Proposals for

Banking Services

Fiscal Impact: None

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Appoint two (2) members of the City Council and the City Treasurer to be
members of an Ad-Hoc committee charged with the review of proposals and
recommendation to the City Council for selection of banking services for the
City.

3.c. Old Town Placentia (Old Town) District Revitalization Plan, Development

Standards and Public Realm Standards (Study Session 1 of 2)

Fiscal Impact: No Fiscal Impacts are Associated with this Study Session.

Potential Significant Economic Benefit to the Local Placentia Economy, Including

Jobs, Public & Private Investments, and Annual/ One-Time Revenue

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Receive and file the report and presentation; and

2) Solicit public comment regarding the proposed Old Town District Revitalization
Plan and Development Standards, Public Realm Design Standards, and
supporting documentation; and

3) Provide direction to Staff, as appropriate, regarding all of the Old Town Plan
documents; and

4) Schedule the second study session regarding the Old Town Plan for the January
17, 2017 City Council meeting.

Placentia City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agenda, December 6, 2016 Page 6 of 7




3.d. Ordinances Prohibiting AIl Marijuana Related Uses and Activities

Including Recreational Marijuana

Fiscal Impact: Cost Related to Enforcement

Recommended Action: It is recommended that the City Council:

1) Approve Urgency Ordinance No. 0-2016-08, An Urgency Ordinance of the City
Council of the City of Placentia, California, Repealing Chapter 8.42 of Title 8 of
the City of Placentia Municipal Code and Replacing it with a New Chapter 8.42
to Prohibit Marijuana-Related Uses and Activities; and

2) Approve Interim Urgency Ordinance No. 0-2016-09, An Urgency Interim
Ordinance of the City Council of the City of Placentia, California, Amending
Provisions of Title 23 (The Zoning Code) Prohibiting the Development of
Marijuana Related Uses.

CITY COUNCIL/BOARD MEMBERS REQUESTS:

Council/Board Members may make requests or ask questions of Staff. If a Council/Board Member
would like to have formal action taken on a requested matter, it will be placed on a future Council
or Board Agenda.

ADJOURNMENT:
The City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agency Board of Directors will adjourn to

Tuesday, December 13, 2016 at 7:00 p.m.

TENTATIVE AGENDA FORECAST
The Tentative Agenda Forecast is subject to change up until the posting of the Agenda for the
Council Meeting listed below:

e Transit Oriented Development (TOD) Study Session 2 of 2

e Certification of Election Results

e Oath of Office for Newly Elected Officials

e City Council Reorganization

CERTIFICATION OF POSTING

I, Rosanna Ramirez, Chief Deputy City Clerk of the City of Placentia and Assistant Secretary of the Industrial Commercial
Development Authority and Successor Agency, hereby certify that the Agenda for the December 6, 2016 meetings of
the City Council, Successor Agency, and Industrial Commercial Development Authority was posted on December 1, 2016.

Rosanna Ramirez, Chief Deputy City Clerk

Placentia City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agenda, December 6, 2016 Page 7 of 7



dWML: ZI:TT91
Aed: 9107/87/T1

SUIYJEA - ISIT JUeIre | :dV <00"€> N0V IdV
uosinury HaJ,

December 6, 2016

L
\\\ 0Z°000°LLE eI, YOI b
1
S9°6TETL (v00) susoda(q rewads-10L
90°'TILY (0$00) Judurd3RUEA HSTH-S09
9F°'188°01T (6£00) 2I7IMA. » PEoH d24o[dmF-109
8T'TEI (L£00) TonenSIMIMPY 3STYIY-10S
6T9ST'8E (€£00) s12foag rende) D108
L6'SEETE (800) 22UrTIIMELN JOMIS-S/ T
0S°79L (6700) ueuaurey sdedsspue -s97
SELLY6T (8200) 32s1q SUDYSrY 193115-097
00°00T (I700) 21nz10g 19SSV-STT
9597’8 (8100) JAl 2AnSE3N-0T1Z
0S°8S6°€E (#S00) 3190 19y LUy 1553985-802
0T°000°LLE HLALABIEEL o) 8S°STHIET (0100) puny [e1UID-1Q[
000 :[BIOL, PIOA —pun{ AqSEIOL 0T oweN puny
00°0 do
000 dI
000 dq
0T°000°LLE dv
I AQ STEI0L. 990D
0T000°LLE ‘[e30), puer)
e JIPRYD #NUD #0d #3010AU] JUNOWY a1 gareg uondrLdsa(punoddy uwondrrdsa(g (I/ouWe)N I0PUd A adLj,

9102/90/21 104
I3SIBY NIy
enuadeld Jo A1)



ammy: ZI1:TT:91

SUIYSEIA - IST'T WELe M 1JV :<00'e> W00V 1dV

sprodoy

1 :98eq
Ae(: 9107/8T/11 uosinwy 110], :I3s()
H/A\ SIUQWYsSHuIes) £I8¥00A
IT0T/FI/TT STLT6000 £C0T09T/00LT 0S°TT €T09TAd 961¢-6700 S/TI/1T ALvVA Add 91/5/11 dd dLVLS VINYOJAITVD HO MIN
H/A\ Siuswysiurer) £18v00A
ITOT/VI/TIT STLT6000 €701091/00LT ST°9% £T09TAd 961T-L£00 OI/II/IT ALVA dd 91/5/11 4d JLVLS VINJOII'TVD HO MIN
H/M sjusurysturery £18100A
9T0T/PT/1T STLTE6000 €C01091/00LT €S°1V6 €T091Ad 9617-0100 IV/II/IT A1lvVA ad 91/¢/11 dd HIVLS VINJOAITVO HO MIN
00°€s ‘(B0 L MI¥YD
Sururer], jgeig $90800A
9102/60/1T $TLT6000 OTITIT 00°€S 91011 IdV 0ST9-£v0LOHDOAAVID - HDTA ALFIVS HOLVISIA ALNNOD AAISYIATI HO MIN
00°0+8 ‘TEIOL HIRYD
Suiure1], ge1s LY9S00A
910T/60/1T €TLT6000 912011 00°0Ch 910TTIdV 0STo-Tv0L0I  THONYV - DY SNOILVTIYI VIAdN SHLVIDOSSV MINd HO MIN
Sumure1y, ge1s LY9S00A
910¢/60/11 £TLT6000 91T10LT 00°0TF 910ITIdY 052911001 dOID - HTY SNOLLVTHY VIAIN SHLVIDOSSV MINd HO MIN
o Trl [BIOL YD
Sutures], yes £61010A
910T/60/11 TTLT6000 819011 OF°THI 910T11dV 0S29-1+0¢01 HDVATIN ‘STVEN ONINIVIL dd NVIEE ‘AANYANIDIN HO MIN
89°€8T ‘0L ARYDH
Suturer] gels 8T8TO0A
910T/60/1T 1TLT6000 91€01T 89°€81 1011 IdV 0S79-1+0€01 HOVATIN ‘STVAN ONINIVIL dd WVAv 401D HO M
607001 [830L H3YD
Supurel] geis TPEY00A
9107/60/1T 0TLT6000 918011 60°00T 9101114V 0529-e¥0€01 HOVATIA ‘STVAN ONINIVIL dd  ANDIAHLYY MD0david HO MW
00°8€S ‘[BI0L 99D
Sumure1y, ge1s 8LLTOOA
910T/60/1T 61.T6000 9I+0IT 00°8€S SI0ITIdV 0ST9-TP0L0T AHNYHINIION - OFY HAY ¥ LSISALVIOOSSY ¥ HONVNIAVD HO MIN
$0°sST ‘[BI0L M)
Sururexy, geig 988C00A
910¢/60/11 81LT6000 9IV0IT $0°SST 910ITIdV 052913001 HADVATIN ‘STVAN ONINIVIL dd ADAYE “TADNY HO MIN
ANe@ NIPYD  #HPYD #0d #3d10AU] junowry dal 1xeq uondLdsa(gHuneddy wonduisaq dI/oureN I0pusA adLy,
9107/8T/11 104
ISISY HIIYD

enpuade[d Jo A1)



dWlL: ZI:TT:91

QUIYDEBA - ISTTIURIR A 1dV ‘<00°€> 00V IV

aroday

enuadelg Jo A1)

7 :a3ed
aed: 9102/8T/11 US| 9], :I3S(}
910T/PT/IT 6TLT6000 €201091/S19C 01°0 £C091Ad 9LIT-LE00 IU/TL/IT A1VA dd 91/5/1T HD ONVIO HLIMON 0/0 vdADd HO MIN
san( 20ssY VHD0/VADd 6L9000A
S10T/¥1/1T 6TLT6000 £201091/S19C S9°C €T091Ad 9L1T-8100 S/II/IT ALVA dd 91/¢/1T HD 3ONVIO HLION O/0 VAOd HO MIN
san(g 2088V VHDO/VADd 6L9000A
S10T/PT/IT 6CLT6000 €C01091/S19T SH'0L £T091Ad 9L12-0100 S/I/ITHALVA Ad S1/5/T1 33D 4ONVIO HLION 0/0 VA3d HO MIN
sen(g 20ssY VHDO/VIId 6L9000A
910T/V1/IL 6TLT6000 €T01091/S19T 08°0 €091 Ad 9LT1T-6200 ST/TT/IT ALVA dd 91/5/11 3D FONVIO HLION 0/D V30d HO MW
L8'LIY ‘(8101 234
H/A\ SIUSUIySIUIRD) LO0S00A
910T/¥1/IT 8TLT6000 €TOTO9T/PILT LYLIY €C091Ad 9612-0100 IT/T/IT ALVA Ad 91/6/11 dd J4TIFHS ALNNOD ONVIO HO MIN
80°LTE QL2 AR CLL 10
SON(J 208V VHOO/VIDd 669000A
910T/¥T/1T LTLT6000 £201091/019C 0S°ST €T091Ad 9L1T-8%00 I/I/IT d1LvA Ad 91/5/11 dd ALNNOD 3ONVIO HO MIN
SON(J 2085V VHDO/VHDd 669000A
910T/VT/IT LTLT6000 €701091/019C 960 €091 Ad 9LIZ-LEOO IU/TI/ITALvVA Ad 91/5/11 9d ALNNOD dONVIO HO MIA
$an{ 2088y VHOO/VADd 669000A
910T/¥P1/1T LTLT6000 £201091/019C 89°L £T091Ad 9L1T-6200 I/I/IT H1vA dd 91/5/11 dd ALNNOD HONVIO HO MIN
S9N 3088y vHDO/VAId 669000A
910T/v1/1T LTLT6000 £T01091/019C ¥6°C6T £T091Ad 9L1Z-0100 /II/ITA1LVA Ad 91/5/1T dd ALNNOD HONVIO HO MIN
00°09 E0L HRYD
H/A\ SIUSWYSTUIRD Y01r000A
910T/PT/TT 9TLTE000 £T0T09T/0ILT 009 £€T09TAd 961C-6200 IV/I/ITALVA A 9L/S/ITdd @IVOd XV.L ASTHONVIA HO M
H/A\ SIUQWYSTuIen) Y0r000A
910Z/¥1/IT 9TLT6000 €T01091/01LT 009 £T09TAd 9617-8100 I/I/ITALVAAd9l/S/TTdd  @IvVOd XV.L ASTHONVId HO MIN
H/M sjuswysTure P0000A
9T0T/PT/IT 9TLT6000 £201091/01LT 00°8% £709TAd 961C-0100 SV/IV/ITHLVAAd9T/S/ITHd  @IVOLd XVL ASIHONVId HO MIN
90°8VT°‘T ‘[0 34D
H/M siusurysiurer £18700A
910T/¥1/1T STLTE6000 €T0T091/00LT 88'LET £T091Ad 961¢-8100 S/T/IL 41va ad 91/$/11 dd HJLVLS VINJOAITYVD HO MIN
aje( YYD # WD #0d #9010AU] JUnOWy ai yoreg uondLIdsa(Aunoddy uondrLidsa(q @I/PWEN I0PUd A ad4y,
9107/87/11 104
I9)SI89Y YI9YD



amlLy: Z1:ZT:91

SUIYIE - ISI'T WeLB |\ dV :<00'¢> W00V IdV

:poday

¢ :98eg
aed: 9107/8T/11 uosInuy 119, :I3s()
9T0T/LT/IT 9€ELT6000 SI8IIT 80608 SILITIAV 0529-TH0¢€01 SYATTIA - THLOH ONINIVIL dd TALOH ODHAIA NVS ZVANY HO MW
Surure1y geis S61010A
910Z/LT/IT 9¢LT6000 9ILTIT 80608 9ILITIdV 0529-2¥0¢01 VAION - THLOH DNINIVIL dd TALOH ODIIA NVS ZVANY HO MIN
0S°1¢E [BI0L 39D
SadlAla§ [eUOnONLSU] 81€000A
910T/LT/TT $€LT6000 9107 TIVd 05'1¢e 9ILITIAV 0909-1L0%01 LINHNAVd YOLOMILSNI TTVA HOI WIHHVNY HO M
0079 ‘[8I0L I9YD
S9OIAIOG [BUOISSAJOI] Y610T0A
910T/LT/TIT ¥ELT6000 8CLLIEST 00°29 OILITIdV 6609-CIST01 SAS ONILSAL TVNONITIE 01/0ISADIAYES HOVNONVIT VLTV HO MIN
SL'ST0'E [€30L qI9Y)
S901AIRg J0enU0)) 1da(g S00000A
910T/LT/IT £€LT6000 1v601d TI9SY SL'STO°E SILITIdVY 0629-L¥0¢€0T SAS YVND DNISSOYD TT-6/01 INFWADOVNVIN ALID TIV HO MIN
LV 06€°T QLA R CLL 1)
VINDI - 91qeded dwio)) paueje 161L00A
910T/V /1T TELT6000 £C0T091/909C 90°LT €C09TAd 0LIT-LEOO OU/IL/IT 41LVA dd 91/S/1T Hd YHASNVIL LNIOdFDOVINVA HO MIN
VINDI - d1qeded dwop pauajeq 161L00A
910T/PI/TT TELT6000 £201091/909C 6965 €C091Ad 0L1T-8+00 IU/TI/TT ALVA dd 91/S/1T Hd YFASNVIL INIOdFOVINVA HO M
VINDI - aqeied dwo) pawaje( 161L00A
ITOT/PI/IT TELT6000 £201091/909C 80°66T°C £C09TAd 0L1Z-0100 II/T/IT HLVA Ad 91/5/11 d JHISNVEL INIOdIOVINVA HO MIN
VINDI - dqedeq dwiop pauaysq 161L00A
ST0T/VI/IT TELT6000 £€201091/909T #9°v1 £C09TAd 0L1Z-6200 IV/IYITHLVA Ad 91/5/1T 3d dTASNVIL INIOdIOVINVA HO MIN
LT066°C ‘[BI0L 24D
SON(] J0SSY 901[0J BIIUSIR[J 61SE00A
9T0T/PI/TT T€LT6000 £201091/0Z9C LT°066°T £C091Ad 8LI1T-0100 IV/IT/IT dLvVa dd o1/s/11 4d dOI'TOd VILNHOVId HO MIN
[X44) [810L YRYD
San(] USSY JWFN 201104 6£8000A
910Z/¥1/TT 0£LT6000 £201091/529T TSTH6 £C09TAd 081Z-0100 IU/I/IT H1vA Ad 91/5/11T dd HOI'TOd VILNHOV'Id HO MIN
00°FE [BI0L 2D
SIN(Y 2085V VHIO/VHDd 6L9000A
e YIIYD)  #MPYD #0d #3d010AU] jUnoOUry a1 gareg uondLdsaAunoddy uondridsa(g I/°WeN 10pus g adAy
9107/8¢/1T 104
I9)SISY Y294

enuadeld yo 1)



AW TI-TT91

SUIIBJA - ISITIUBLR M, dV '<00'e>NO0P IV

sprodayy

t :a8eq
Aeq: 9107/8T/11 uoSINUyY 9] :I3s()
suoydajay, Pr1v00A
910T/LT/IT1 THLT6000 919011 +9°S0¢€ IILITIAV S179-19596C SOIAVHO ANOHd AON-LDO 1®2LV HO MIN
151 ATe1qIT 9[J/99Y SOV PrIv00A
9T0T/LT/IT TYLT6000 919011 69°¢ IILITIAV 0221-0100 SHOIVHO ANOHd AON-LDO 1®LVY HO M
asuoydayag, PrIv00A
9T0T/LT/TT T¥LT6000 919011 $9°S16°T IILITIdV S1T9-S6S601 SHOYVHO ANOHd AON-LDO 121V HO MIN
18°0S ‘T8I0 MRYD
suoydajay, 9€L800A
910Z/LT/TT 1¥L76000 91 O/1L AON 18°0¢ CIVARAT: A4 S1T9-S6S60T SHOAVHO LANIALNI 9/CT-L/TT 1% 1V HOMIN
00789€°01 ‘[BIOL YYD
S9OTAISS [e39] 1TZ0TOA
910T/LT/TT 0FLT6000 910ZSTIT 00°89£°01 OILITIdV $009-S0010T SAS DNILTNSNOD vav ONI 4004V HO MIN
69°0L0°T [BIOL IRYD
sarjddng jueurreds( [eroads TETHOOA
910T/LT/IT 6€LT6000 910€661¢€S TL7€ST IILITIdV 10€9-¥59¢£01 ONINVHTO LVIN ALI'TIOVA WIOJINM THVINVEY HO MIN
SULIOJIUf) TETYOOA
910T/LT/IT 6£LT6000 ST0E661ES ¥8'PLE 9ILITIdV 09€9-059¢01 SINJOAINN md WAOIINN AVINVIV HO MIN
sar(ddng juounreda(y [eroads TETVOOA
910T/LT/IT 6£LT6000 OvLSL61ES 167CST SILITLIAV 10£9-v59¢01 ONINVHTO LVIN ALITIOVA WAOIINN IVIAVEVY HO MIN
SULIOJIU) CLTYO0A
910Z/LT/TT 6£LT6000 6ELSL6TES £T°68T ILITIAV 09€9-059¢01 SINJOJINN Md WAOAINN AIVINVIV HO MIN
00°96 BL AR ELL )
SOOIAISG [eucnONNSU] 80CT0TOA
910T/LT/IT 8ELT6000 910T TIvd 0096 SILITIAV 0909-1.L0%01 INAWAVd JOLIMILSNI TTVd HIANVIE ‘ONINOY HO MIN
$8°91 [eI0L 294D
Sumurery, gels 988700A
9T0T/LI/TIT LELTE6000 OLITIT $891 IILITIdV 0ST9-T+0€01 ADVATIA ‘STVIAN ONINIVIL dd AOAEL “TADNV HO MW
9T°8T9°T ‘[BIOL HI3YD
Sumure1y, ;ye1s S6T0TO0A
Aeq YYD #HPYD #O0d #9J10AU] jUnOWY a1 yaed uondinsaqHuned»y uondrdsag I/AUIEN I0PUI A adfy,
910¢7/87/T1 104
I9ISIZoY NI

enuadELJ Jo AN



duwmL: Z1:TT91

QUIIEIA - ISITIRIR M dV -<00°¢> INOOY 1AV

aoday

G 3a3eg
Aed: 910¢/8T/T1 uosInUY 9] :X3S[)
uopensIIWpY AMed payL 1T0800A
9T0T/LT/TT 6¥LT6000 6STSLLT 99°1¥S°1 IILITIdV $209-78510F SAS NINAV SIWIVTO ALI'TIVIT.LOO 0D 2 NIIIvVM TIVO HO MIN
05°8¢ T8I0 L HRYD)
ey yuswdinbyg 23130 608800A
OTOT/LT/TT 8¥LT6000 SHPI€9020F 05°8¢ OILITIdV SL19-565601 HOVSN YdId0D 91/T1-LT/MOMIFINY SNOLLNTOS NONVD HO MIN
£€9°v79 8101 H22qD
sariddng jusunreda(q Teroedg LO0OTOA
OTOT/LT/TT L¥LT6000 £SCE6TIL £9VT9 9TLITIdV [10€9-C59¢01 L'TVHdSV ‘00 LVIN'IVD HO MIN
94°S86‘y ‘[eI0L HIRYD
$99IAISS paseyomd Y10 S$S6600A
9T0T/LT/IT 9¥LT6000 9I0ZPIIT 00°6CT 9ILITIdY 6679-200101 ONISILHIAQY TVDHTIOO WddV4ISMIN VINIOAITYD HO M
[BUOTIOWOIJ/SUISTISAPY $S6600A
S10T/LT/TT 9¥LT6000 910CVILIL 08°0SS 9ILIILdV §CT9-T00101 ONISILYFAQVY TVOFTLOO YIdVISMAN VINIOAITVD HO MIN
[EUOTIOWIOLJ/SUISILISAPY §S6600A
9T0T/LT/TIT 9¥LT6000 9I0CPILT 99°S0L SILITIAV STTO-1£5C01 DNISILYHAQY TVOTdTLOO YHIVASMAN VINIOAITVD HO MIA
sapuwo) agejsy §S6600A
910Z/LT/IT 9%LT6000 911001 00°009°€ OILITIdV L90T-T6E6L / LIOT-+H00 ONISILIFAQY TVAILSHA HOVIIGIH YWddVISMEN VINJOAITVD HO MIN
00°1ISTT ‘[e30 L }IIY)
SIDIAISG [BITPIN CETO00A
9TOT/LT/IT S¥LT6000 0601d 91°LZ01 00°1ST'T OILITIdV $509-070¢0T SMVIA aoo1d 100 JISNHYOA VINIOAITVD HO MIN
00301 ‘[8I0L HI?YD
SI0IAIS§ [BUONONLSUT Y00010A
910T/LT/TT ¥¥LT6000 910C TIVd 00'+01 9ILITIdV 0909-1L0v01 INIWNAV JOLOMALSNI TIVA TTHINVA ‘INVAYE HO MmN
8T'8PS'ST 801 YD
S301AIRG eNUO) o CT9900A
910T/LT/IT €¥LT6000 °6801d €LOTELT 81'8¥SST IILITIdV 0629-7S9¢£01 SAS DNIdIIMS 1LIFILS LOO SHOIAYIS SNAHLV HO MIN
€0ET'E LA R CLL e
suoydafa], PrIv00A
910T/LT/IT TLT6000 919011 vy OILITIdV SIT9-6ET19/ STT9-S65601 SHOUYVHO ANOHd AON-1D0 121V HO MIN
Ae HPYD #APYD #0Od #OO10AU] jUNOUIY al yneq wondLdsa(AuN0IdY wondrsaq dI/3WeN J0pud A adAy,
910T/8T/TT 104
II)SIBY NIRYD

enuaded Jo A1)



dwiy: TI-7T9l

QUIYIBA - ISTT ITeLIE M 1V ~<00'¢> 0OV 1dV

snodoy

9 3deg
ed: 910¢/87/11 UoSINUY WO :Ias)
00°001 ‘B30 YD
sure1go1J UOLBAIOY 961010A
9T0T/LT/TIT SSLT6000 200°LLETO0T 007001 91LITIdV 0vEr-81L6L / 0V E-00000¢ FIWNAVIH - ANNJTT LISOddd YHAINNAL VA HO MIN
00°¥8L ‘1830 YD
juswdinbg/urely mmedoy 188800A
910T/LT/TT ¥SLT6000 66801d YrShy HS 00°8L 9ILITIdV LET9-ev0c01 SHOIAYAS INOHd S1VOO0 1LDO dONVYO 40 ALNNOD HO MIN
T€9TLITE S[BIOL YD)
Urexq wios 79 Iomog/N ¥ A CSILOOA
910Z/LT/TT £SLT6000 LT/9T Ad $STLSOE OILTIIdV 0CTI9-9LEV8Y SIXVI ALIAdOdd L1/91 Ad GONVIO 40 ALNNOD HO MIN
saxe], Ayradoig TSTLOOA
910T/LT/IT £SLT6000 L1/91 Ad 8L €SIT SILITIAV 01+9-565601 SHXVI ALYAdOdd L1/9T Ad dONVIO 40 AINNOD HO MIN
98'T01°C -[e301, 339D
souIioeJAurepy 2 medoy £0TS00A
910T/LT/IT TSLT6000 L66V-911 98'10¢ SLLITIdV 0£19-¥59¢01  STTVOINAHD TOOd NALLIHM LddS DILVAOV TVIOAININOD HO M
sonoeAue % eday £0TS00A
910T/LI/IT TSLT6000 8¢v-911 00°009 OILIIIdV 0€19-¥59¢01 INIVIA TO0d ZHWOD HOV  DLLVNAOV TVIOYAWNOD HO MIN
sonoe AR % reday £0TS00A
9TOT/LT/TT TSLT6000 18¢t-911 00°009 SILITIAV 0€T9-PS9L01 INIVIA TOOd NHLLTHM DNV JLLVAOV TVIOYAWINOD HO M
seu[oejAuey 29 Iredoy] £0TS00A
9T0Z/LT/TT TSLT6000 6L9¢-911 007009 SILITIAY 0E19-1759¢€01 INIVIA TOOd ZAWNOD AT JILVNOV TVIDIANINOD HO MIN
00°ST [BI0L YD)
SOOIAIOG USI] LY8SO0A
9I0T/LT/TT 1SLT6000 11601d JS€ET 05°Cl OLLITIdV T819-L¥0C01 SHOIAYAS NAI'T dd 408D LDO SATVS NAIT HDIOHD YVATO HO M
SIVIAISS U] LY8S00A
910Z/LT/IT 1SLT6000 11601d g5¢T 05°Cl 9TILTTIdV 819-LY0€0T SHOIAYAS NAI'T AON SATVS NAIT IJI0OHD IVATO HO MIN
01°8¢ [BI0L 997
[eyuay wewdmby 20130 ¥Z1800A
910T/LT/IT 0SLT6000 68VPESINI 01°8€ 9ILITIdV SLI9-S6S601 SHOVIHAO YdIdOD ¥/11-6/01 490 HO MIN
99°THS‘T HULAR CLlie
e YYD  # W9YD #0d #odloAu] junowry a1 yred uondLsa(AUN0IIYy uoyduiassq aremey opuay  PdAL
9107/8T/11 104
JI93SIZAY HIIYD

enuadRId JO A1)



duwmy: ZI-TT:91

SuIyoe - ISI'T JUeLIE M dV :<00°¢> INOOY 1AV

aroday

L 8eq
Aeq: 910Z/87/11 uosINUY 18T JIIS()
VINDI - d1qeied duo)) pauraje 620010A
910T/LT/IT €9LT6000 I9TPIIT 000 9ILITIdV 0L1Z-6200 I/11 Ad §/1T 3/d dgddd4da LSOAL INFWTILLTY VINOI HO MIN
VINDI - dlqeded dwo)) pausjs 6700TO0A
910Z/LT/TT £9L26000 I9TVITL 00°0F IILITIAV 0L1Z-8100 /1T Ad §/11 3/d dTIHA9d LSOEL INFWHIILTY VINDI HO MIN
VINOI - 2lqeAed duo) pawaja( 6Z0010A
9TOT/LT/TT £9LT6000 I9TFILIT 0S°9ZH1 IILITIdV 0L1Z-0100 1/11 dd §/1T &/d dT39949ad LSOEL INFINTILLTY VINOI HO MIN
8L'9PS‘SI ‘[BIOL {3YD
wewdinby % Arsurysey 0IF600A
9T0T/LT/IT T9LT6000 61v601d 6TLANI 8L°89€°11 SILITIdV 0%89-¢7S101 AHAITS IOM LIN LSO HO M
s901AI04 J0enU0)) 1o 01¥600A
9T0CT/LT/IT TILT6000 LT7601d T89ANI 00°8LIL SILITIAV 06C9-£TSI01 SHOIAYHS LI LDO LSD HO MIN
€891 [BI0L 224D
Suture1], ge1s 8Z8T0O0A
910T/LT/TT 19LT6000 9LITIT $891 IILITIdV 0S29-1¥0¢01 HOVATIN ‘STVAN ONINIVIL dd VAV ‘401D HO MIN
00°bLL *[B30.L 33D
$301A10§ 10BNU0D 1doQ 96900A
9T0T/LT/IT 09LT6000 86T1STO0TII 00°VLL SILITIAV 0629-759¢01 INIVIN YOLVATTA ONI VORIV Dd1IMNd HO MIN
00°sTy ‘[B10L 23D
Surure1], geis [81600A
910T/LT/IT 65SLT6000 9ISIIT 00°STH SILITIdV 0579-T90¢01 DNV ‘STVAN DNINIVIL dd 00V ‘SYATIId HO MIN
00°01 *[€10L, 3D
swrersold uoneaIday 60Z0T0A
9T0T/LT/TT 8SLT6000 T00'18E100T 00°01 SILITLIdV over-81e6L / 0¥ E-000001 ANNATT 9Ad VNILSIIA YA1Xd HO M
00°782°C 18I0, YD)
sure[) 2ouemsu] s94ordwrg €0Z000A
OT0T/LT/IT LSLT6000 912699911 00°78TT SILITIdV SC1S-185H0V HONVINSNI LNHNAO TINANN INHWAOTING HO MIN
00°09Z°1 [BI0L 937D
SIDIAISG [BUOISSIIOI] £C9900A
910T/LT/IT 9SLT6000 19601d  911ADDIOD 00°09T°1 OILITIdV 6609-95¥8y  SHOIAYAS NOILOAdSNI D04 HNV SIDd HO M
e Yooy #HPYD) #0d #odloAU] junouUry al gared uonduds3qAunoddy uondLrsaq dI/3meN J0pud A adAy,
910¢/8¢/11 104
JI33S189Y YI9YD

enuade[d Jo A))



dwmlLy: 71291

SUIIBIA - ISIT JUelle | 1V ~<00°¢> W00V 1AV

:podoy

g :a8eqd
Aed: 910T/8YUY11 uosINUY [19], :JSM)
9T0T/LI/IT L9LT6000 61601d SLL6L 00°L9S C1VARAT: A4 $009-S0010T SHOIAYAS TVDIT 100 FTAVIN % SANOI HO MIN
S201AISG [eSo] CT8600A
910T/LI/TT L9LT6000 61601d VLL6L 0S'TLO'TY SILITIdV $009-S0010T SHOIAYES TvDdT1 100 ATAVIN % SEHNOf HO MmN
S9IAIRG [eSoT TT8600A
910T/LT/TT L9LT6000 61601d 90t6L 00'+6C OILITIdV §009-S00T10T SIOIAYAES TVOAT 1LdHS AHAVIA % SINOL HO MIN
SOIAING [e3o] C¢C8600A
910T/LT/IT L9LT6000 61601d SOP6L 0S°SLI SILITIdV €009-S0010T SHIIAYES TVOHT LdAS YTAVIN % SHNOf HO MIN
S9OIAISG [eSaT CT8600A
910T/LT/TT L9LT6000 61601d YOv6L 05 66L OILITIAV S009-STSLYS SHOIAYAS TvVOdT 100 HJAVIA % SHNOf HO MIN
S901AI5g [BS9] TTR600A
910T/LT/TT L9LT6000 61601d 86£6L 00°665°1 SILITIdV $009-S00101 SHOIAN¥ES TvOdT 100 UTAVIA 22 SHNOI HO MIN
S90TAISG T2 TT8600A
910T/LI/IT L9LT6000 61601d c6e6L 00°1C SILITIdV $009-500101 SHOIAYAES TVOAT LdAS HIAVIA 2 SHNOL HO MIN
$901ATOS [eS0] CTTB600A
910T/LT/TT L9LT6000 61601d [16€6L 00°STS OILITIAV $009-50010T SHOIAYAS TvDIT LddS YIAVIA % SANOI HO MIN
SI0LAISG [239] TTB600A
9T0T/LT/IT L9LT6000 61601d 98€6L 00°LIS‘SE OILITIAV $009-S0010T SHOIAYLS TvDdT 1ddS AFAVINZ SINOI HO MIN
00°¥6¥°T ‘(80 L Y9q)
sanioeJAutely 29 edoy L98600A
9T0T/LT/TT 99LT6000 8LYT 00'v6¥T IILTTIdV 0€19-659¢01 HOIAHA MOTIADVE ‘00 MOTINOVE HOI HO MIN
00°FT0°T ‘(8101 Y29y
[BUOTIOWO1J/SUISILISAPY PES000A
9T0T/LT/TT S9LT6000 YE0619T 00°H10°T 9ILITIdV §TTO-TISION INHNISILIFAQV 90f dTIVIIVAV SO HO MIN
09°6+8 HELA R EEL )
sar[ddng jusunreda(] [eroadg 90S900A
910Z/LT/IT $9LT6000 00-6LSLLLT 867079 SILITIdV 10£9-659¢01 SHITddNS NOILLVORNII AITANIELS TYIRIIdNT HO MIN
sor[ddng jusunreda(y [eroadg 905900A
910¢/LT/IT ¥9LT6000 00-SLLSLLT T9'8CT SILITIdV 10£9-569¢£01 SAITddNS NOILLVORNAI AT TANIEAS TVIIAdNT HO MIN
0S°90S°T (830, }2Rq)
ANeq PRYD  #AWYD #0d #3d10Au] junowry ar yareqg uondLdsa(gauneddy uondrsaq I/auWeN I0pus A adAy,
9T07/8T/11 104
JI3ISIZY NI

enuadRlg Jo A3D



dWLL: TITT:91

QUIOEA - ISI'T JUelle p :dV :<00"¢> N00V IV

spodoy

6 :o8egd
Aaeq: 910¢/8T/11 uosINUY o] :I3s()
sarpddng jusunreds( [eadg SE9000A
9T0T/LT/IT 1LLT6000 S/61¥29T SL'OLT 9ILITIAV 10£9-¥59¢01 S9I'TddNS Md FTVA-NIAAvVd OIN HO MIN
(A4 ‘[e10L qPRY)H
S9OTAISG PaseyaIng I2Y10 819000A
910T/LT/IT 0LLT6000 11¥910C T¢'TI STILTITdV 6679-T0010T SHI'TddNS NOLLDATd 0D NVINAVHO ¥ NILIVIN. HO M
0T LEV'T ‘[B10L HRY)
sao1AlLes J0ENU0)) o 9617600A
910Z/LT/TT 69LT6000 ¥06£8 1TL61T 9ILTTIdV 0679-859¢01 HONVNALNIVIA S TOIHIA ONI HTIHOW dOVNVIN HO AN
$9d1ATeg oenuUo) 1do(q 9617600A
910T/LT/IT 69LT6000 $98€8 68'ELI OILITIdV 0629-859¢€01 HONVNALNIVIA HTOIHIA ONI HTIHOW ddDOVNVIN HO MIN
sa01AI0g J0enU0)) Idoq 961600A
910Z/LT/TT 69LT6000 0v8¢8 0099 OILITIdV 0679-859¢01 HONVNALINIVIN 9 T0IHAA ONI HTIHOW IOVNVIN HO MIN
00°01 ‘[BIOL YIRYD
Sure1301d UoneaIday 6610T0A
9LOT/LT/IT 89LT6000 200°28¢100T 00701 OILITIdV 0vEP-8PE6L / 0FE4-00000T aNNJITd 9Ad ASOl ‘NOIT HO MIN
00+77'T6 ‘[eI0L HRY)
$901AT0g 18397] TTS600A
S10T/LT/IT L9LT6000 61601d ¥6L6L 00°€99 SILITIdV $009-50010T SHOIAYAS TVHAT LOO YHAVIA 2 SANOI HO MIN
SA0IAISS [e3e] TT3600A
9T0T/LT/IT LILT6000 61601d €6L6L 00°6ST°E SILITIAY S009-STSLYS SHOIAYAS TVOAT 1DO AV 2 SHNOf HO MIN
SOIAILG [eS2] CT8600A
9T0T/LT/IT L9LT6000 61601d T6L6L 05°6ST'1 9ILITIdV $009-S0010T SHOIAYAES TVHAT LDO JHIAVIA 2 SHNOf HO MIN
$90[AIRS 1250 TT600A
910T/LT/IT L9LT6000 61601d 98L6L 00°'180°1 9TILITIdV $009-S0010T SHOIAYES TVOHAT.LOO0 JHAVIA 2 SHNOI HO MIN
SOIAISS [B3a] TT3600A
9T0T/LT/IT LILT6000 61601d 18L6L 00°+09°C CIVARSE:\4 §009-50010T SHIOIAYAS TVOdT.LO0 HIAVIN 2 SHNOf HO MIN
$301AIaS [eSo] CT8600A
SI0T/LT/IT L9LT6000 61601d 08L6L 00°L86 9ILTTLIdV $009-S00T10T SHOIAYAS TVvOAT LDO dHAVIA 2 SANOf HO MIN
S9OIAIRG [BSo] CT8600A
B MIIYD  # WD #0d #9d10AU] JUNOWY a1 uneqd uo3dLIdSa(/AuUnoddY uondLIdsa( dI/aWe)N I0PUsA adLy,
9107/8T/T1 fo4
INSISNY N

enRuadeld Jo A1)



duWiL: TI-TT9l

SUIYIRA - ISTT eI -V <00°¢> IN00Y IdV

soday

01 :3%eq
aed: 9107/8¢/11 uosINUY Ua] :I3s()
SOUIJUOY) 29 STUNSIN 1£6600A
910T/LT/IT 08LT6000 919TIT 00°0S SILITIdV SPTO-CISTI01 NOdJHONNT AVAITOH VINDDOO VINODO HO MIN
SIOURIFUOD) 29 STUNS 1£6600A
9T0T/LT/IT 08LT6000 9ISTIT 00°ST¢ SILITIdV SPTo-115101 NOJHONNT AVAI'TOH YINOOO YINOOO0 HO MIN
0006 ‘T8I0 L 3D
SuIRIS01J UOTIeaIoN] €0Z010A
910T/LT/TT 6LLT6000 200'¥9€100T 00°06 9ILITIdV OvEV-81E6L / 0VE-000001 ANNITA SSVTO VONVIL ‘NHANON HO MW
00°01 [8301 MRYD
surer301J UONBIIIYY ZOZOTOA
9T10T/LT/IT 8LLZT6000 200°¥8€100C 00°01 9ILITIAY 0rEr-8Y€6L / 0F€1-000001 aNNgJgyg dAd TANVHV VAVN HO M
ovvLT ‘[BI0L PRy
souRUSUTRA %9 Tedoy S[OTYIA €PL600A
9T10T/LT/IT LLLT6000 oy Ov'vLT 9ILITIdV PE19-859¢€01 A¥dlLvd ddLINO OLON HO MIN
00°001 (8101, 299D
sar[ddng jusunreds(q [esds LO6600A
9T0T/LI/IT 9LLT6000 9I0ZSIIT 00°001 OILITIAV 10€9-11S10T dIHSYVIOHOS AVA SNVIAIFA MIHLLVIA ‘NASNALJIOW HO MIN
00°01 [eI0L HPRYD
swerdo1d uoneaIdsyy T0ZOTO0A
9TOT/LT/TT SLLT6000 200°L8ET00T 00°0T ILITIAV OrEr-81E6L / OVEV-000001 NN gAd FTTIHOIN ‘AJANODINON HO MIN
0v°L8S [BI0L DY)
surie[) uonesusdio) SIoNIoM 098600A
ST10T/LT/IT ¥LLT6000 YOLPT 0V°L88 9ILITLIdV $915-085+0y NOLLVYTVAT DINONODYT UAATNSIM 2 SVIVINOWN HO MIN
00001 ‘[EI0L HPYD)
sar[ddng jusuneda( erads 0I1Z0TOA
910T/LT/IT €LLT6000 9T0ZSTIT 00°001 9ILITIdV 10€9-115101 dIHSYVTOHOS AVA SNVIdLIA VHINVIAVS YATTIN HO MIN
00°00T ‘[830L 2D
$90UIJUOD) 29 STUNIN 0LSE00A
ST0T/LT/TIT TLLT6000 SIPIIT 00°00C OILITIdV SPTI-1P0€IT STVAN ONINIVIL dd IIOTY ‘ATANIIN HO MIA
SLOLT ([BI0L YY)
Ae@ YYD #MNYD #0d #3910AU] juUnOWyY a1 yareg uondrIdsI@Aunoddy uondesaq AI/AWeN I0pusp adAg,
9T0T/8T/TT 104
13)S135Y YD

enuaded Jo 1)



QWILL: ZI:TT:91

SUIYIBA - ISUT JUBLIEM, dV <00'€> W00V 1dV

;podoy

11 :98eq
Aeq: 9107/8¢/11 UOSINUY L] :I3s()
sao1AlRg joenU0) 1do( PLT600A
9T0T/LT/TT S8LT6000 ¥9801d 9T0LITAD 00°090°9 SILITIdV 0629-1£5201 SHOIAYAS ONINNVI 01/1T-1€/01 DNI HONVY NI90Od d9499vVd HO MIN
S2OIAIOG [RUOISSI)01] PLT600A
910T/LI/IT S8LT6000 VIIOTITYED 00708 SILITIdV 6609-LS0SY / 6609-1£5T01 SHOIAYHIS DNINNV I 6/11DNI HONVY NIFOY dgDOvVI HO MIN
€1°0ST HLUAR CLL )
serjddng jusunreds( [eroads £6S600A
910T/LT/TT $8LT6000 61266 €1°0S1 SILITIAV 10€9-110¢€01 HOIAYEIS YHILVM dd LOOADOTONHOAL YALVM HINd HO MIN
£6°CIC ‘18101 }I3YD)
sowrwo)) 8. 0SSTOOA
9I0T/LT/IT €8LT6000 910TSIIT £6°CIT IILITIdV L90T-T6¢6L / LI0T-100 LINAWISINGNITT 9OV LIIH JNVEA ‘ZT9dd HO MIN
00°0v [BIOL YD)
Surure1] jjels 8T9800A
910T/LT/TT TYLT6000 91IZIT 00°0C OILITIdV 05S29-170¢0T TIONY - DIY SSVTO LOVSAITITHS ALNNOD HONVIO HO MIN
Bupure1] yyejg 879800A
9T0T/LT/TIT T8LT6000 910CIT 00°0C SILITIdV 0ST9-1+0¢01 dOTO - DHY SSVTI LOVSJITITHS ALNNOD HONVIO HO MIN
or'vot ‘18301 HRYD
saiddng 2030 LLYLOOA
910T/LT/TIT 18LT6000 081850 0S°LI- SILITIdV ST1€9-0L0t01 LIdID SHIEALSNANI 321110 HO MIN
sarjddng jusurreda] [eroadg LLYLOOA
910T/LT/TT 18LT6000 68¢€8S 88°IV IILITIAV 10£9-055¢€01 SHI'TddNS 21440 SHIALSAANI 301440 HO MIN
soriddng 201310 LLYLOOA
9TOT/LI/IT 18LT6000 LETYS €8°6C SILITIAV S1£9-0L0%01 SHI'TddNS 01140 SHELSNANI 301140 HO MIN
setiddng 20130 LLYLOOA
910T/LT/TT 18LT6000 0318S 68761 9TLITIdV S1€9-0L0F01 SHI'TddS A01JA0 SALSAANI 301440 HO MIN
00°sLy ‘18101 ¥3¥YD)
S90U2I0JU0)) 79 SSUNBIN 1£6600A
9T0T/LT/IT 08LT6000 9I9TIT 0008 SILITIdV SPTO-1€5T01 NOHHONNT AVAI'TOH VINODO VINDOO HO MIN
S90UAIJUOY) 79 SSUTBIIN 1£6600A
9T0Z/LT/IT 08LT6000 919111 00708 9ILITIdV SYTO-¥EST01 NOTHONNTAVAI'TOH VINOOO VINDOO HO MIN
AEQ YYD  # WY #0d #3d10AU] jUNOWY al yaieq uondrLsS3(AuUNoddY uondrdsaq QI/AWeN I0pUdA adAy,
9107/8T/1T 104
I9)SISY {9

ERUE[ JO AND



dwly: TI:TT91

SUIYIBA - ISI'T IWELIR M 1 dV <00'€> W00V IdV

poday

Z1 :23eg
Aeq: 9107/8T/11 UOSIIY LI8] :JAS()
00°s8¢t 18I0 L HRYD
S901AI0g J0enu0)) ol TY8TO0A
910T/LT/IT 68LT6000 v6v¥0CT 0S'TH1 9ILITIdV 0629-759¢01 HONVNALNIVIA NIVINNOA .LDO SOLLVNOV VS HO MIN
18I ATRIQIT 98[d/99Y SOV Cr8TO0A
910T/LT/TIT 68LT6000 vovv0T 0S°ThI SILIIIdV 02Z1-0100 HONVNALNIVIA NIVINNOA 10O SOLLVNOV VS HO MIN
00°01 [BIOL HIRYD
suwreI30I1J UoIeaIday ¥0Z010A
910T/L1/IT 88LT6000 200°88¢100C 00°01 9ILITIdV OvEV-8YE6L / 0VEF-00000T aNNATT dAd VINNASIVI ‘SO HO M
I8°LEL'ST ‘[BI0L 39D
SjustwssMqUISy SUf LT AST P1T800A
9T0T/LT/IT L8LT6000 91 AON % 1DO V0°LIL'S 9ILITIdV 0€Ly-00056€  SINNIANTId HONVINSNI FIIT/ALT AT CIVANVLS IONVITTI HO MIN
souemsu] 17 feaondo Y1Z800A
910T/LT/TT L8LT6000 9T AON 2 1LDO #8796L S9ILITIdV 98120100 SININTId FONVINSNI HAI'T/ALT 41T GIVANV.LS AINVITII HO MIA
SJUDWRSINQUIISY suj 1T ST VIT800A
910T/LT/ET L8LT6000 9T AON % 10O v9°TLES 9ILITIAV STLY-000S56¢  SINNINHY IONVINSNI Al V/ALT 41T MIVANVLS SONVITId HO MIN
SwniuRld souemsuy 1] Y1Z800A
910T/LT/TT L8LT6000 9T AON % 10O SLVPLT 9ILITIdV €916-£8056¢  SIWNINTY HONVINSNI HAIVALT F4I'T QIVANVLS HONVITIIE HO MIN
wniwaid suf gLs Y1Z800A
910T/LT/TT L8LT6000 910C10ZT LI°TSET 9ILITIdV 6915-565601  SIWNINTAd HONVINSNI ALS D90 4I'T QIVANVLS IONVITII HO MIN
umrwaig suf drs Y1Z800A
910T/LT/IT L8LT6000 9TOTIOLT L1°TSEC 9ILITIdV 6916-565601T  SININTYd ONVINSNI ALS AON FAI'T QAVANVLS AONVITII HO MIN
wniwsid suf (LS YIZ800A
9I0T/LT/TT L8LT6000 910T1001 L1°TSET 91LITIdV 6916-56S601  SIWNINTAd HONVINSNI ALS LOO F4I'T QIVANV.LS HONVITII HO MIN
00°0ST [BI0L 224D
surero1J UOTBaIoY 99b600A
9TOT/LT/IT 98LT6000 C00°TLETO0T 00°0ST OTLITTIdV OvEP-8YL6L / 0¥ EF-000001 NALLIHM - ANQ4TA 1ISOdad NVATY ‘QOHIVY HO MIN
00°086°L [810L YD)
$901AI0g Joenuo) da YLT600A
9T0T/LT/IT S8LT6000 ¥9801d 91011T¥D 00°0¥8°l SILITIdY 06279-1£5201 SAS HOHL ONINNVTI 01/TT-1€/0T DNI HONVY NIF0Y dd99vd HO MIN
e YD #IAPYD # Od #J10AU] junowry aI1 yareq uondLnse@AunoddYy uonduasaq dI/PWeN IOPUIA adAy,
9107/8T/11 104
JI9)SIZY HIOY)

enuadel] Jo K1)



WL ZI1:TT91

SUWYIBA - ISIT UL, dV <00'€> NO0P 1AV

:proday

¢1 adeqg
aed: 9107/87/11 ToSINUY 9], :13s()
910T/LI/IT ¥6LT6000 00S£0019TT0IS6 6£°119 9ILITIdV S1T9-565601 SAS AVTId ANV EA dd LOO INIIdS HO MIN
SE6ISEY EI0L NPYD
Aropalg 016000A
9TO0T/LT/TIT £6LT6000 9ISOIT 98°LLI SILTTIdV 0£€9-0F119/0££9-56560T  SHOYVHO TVOTALDATH AON-LDO  VINJOAITYO NJdHLNOS HO MIN
Arooalg 016000A
910T/LT/IT €6L76000 9ISOIT 9L°T¥e 9ILIITIdV 0££9-TPI19/0€€9-S65601  SHOAVHD TVOTILOATI AON-1D0  VINJOJITVD NJFHLNOS HO MW
Kooeg 0T6000A
910Z/LT/IT £6LT6000 91ISOIT TO'LSLTI 9ILITTdV 0£€9-565601  SAOIYVHD TVOIILOATH AON-100  VINYOA4I'TVD NYJHINOS HO MIN
Aromoog 016000A
9T0T/LI/IT £6LT6000 91ISOIT SE€LLI6T SILITIdV 0£€9-09598C  SHOUVHD TVOTILDHITI AON-1D0  VINYOAITYD NJdHINOS HO MIN
A1o1m99[9 0T16000A
9T0Z/LT/TT £6LT6000 91S0IT 8L7091 SLLITIAV 0€€9-8€119/0€€9-56560T  SHOUVHO TVOIILDATA AON-LDO  VINIOAI'TVO NMAHLNOS HO MW
Arotnoag 0T6000A
9T0T/LT/IT £6LT6000 9ISOTT $T'89C SILITIdV 0£€9-19696C  SHOUVHD TVOIILOATH AON-1D0  VINYOAI'TVDI NYIHINOS HO MIN
93ue1Q) Jo Aluno) gV 016000A
9T0T/LT/TT €6LT6000 918011 09°S1 9ILITIdV 8CTI-0100  SHOAVHD TVORALOATIH AON-LD0  VINYOIITVI NYFHLNA0S HO M
Aoinosg 0T6000A
910T/LT/TIT £6LT6000 91S01T 9¢'Sy SILITIdV 0££9-6€119/0€£9-195967  SHOYVHO TVORLLDATA AON-LDO  VINGOATTVO NMAHLNOS HO MIN
WISYRUY JO A)1D)/09Y S109Y 016000A
910T/LT/TIT £6LT6000 9ISOIT LESY SILITIdV CECI-0100  SHOUVHO TVOTILOITA AON-LDO  VINIOAI'TVYO NMAHLNOS HO MIN
0T €T QLA R CLL 10
syuag Sulp[ing 999600A
910T/LT/TIT T6LT6000 [¥01-91d 0TEIT ILITIdV 091+-000001 ANNITT IINJdd OaT1d SNOIdJINVHD dDIAYAS HO MIN
00°001 E0L HRYD
sarjddng jusumreda( feroadg 90T0T0A
9T10Z/LT/TIT 16LT6000 9I0TSTIT 00°001 SILITIdV 10€9-11S101 dIHSYVIOHOS AVA SNVIHIFA VOISSHl ‘VNIQIVS HO MIN
00701 [BI0L MRYD
SWRIS0IJ UOTIBIIdY SOZOTOA
910T/LT/TT 06L26000 200°08£100T 00°0T SILILIdY OvEr-8¥E6L / 0¥ EH-000001 aNNJTd dAd 1NVY ‘SOLNVS HO MIN
e YYD  # MY #0d #Io10AU] JUNOWY a1 yoreg uondrsaqAunodIV uondrdsaq QI/°WeN 10puaA adAL
910T/8T/TT 104
ISISY HY)

enudade[d Jo 1)



awmlLy: ZI1:TT:91

SUIYOEIN - IST'T JUBLIR M 1JV ‘<00"E€> OOV TdV

spoday

$1 :98eq
Ae: 9107/8T/T1 uosINuY 1127, :X3s(]
alqeded SYV/SYVJ 140l dwyg 18L800A
910T/LT/IT T08Z6000 I9IFIIT +1°10€°1 9ILITIAV 1€12-0100 L[I/11 Ad /1T &/d SEV/SAVd 00¥TT09%L9# SUVI ANV S1 HO MIN
00°sTy ‘[e101 HI3Y)
Suturer] yeis 9£6S00A
910Z/LT/IT 10826000 919I1L 00°STh 9TLITIAV 0S79-TH0€0T ONIIVd ‘STVIAN ONINIVIL ad 4SOf ‘V@ddn HO M
S8'I8TT FEI0L M3RYD
saotAleg oenuo) 1da 8ETI00A
9T0T/LT/TT 00876000 9.801d 9S1ST S8'18T°T 9ILITITdV 0629-L¥0£01 ONISSHIO0Ud LID ONINIVA LOO ONI SWHLSAS VILVA OINL HO MIN
00°96T°T ‘[BIOL YD
SI0LAISS JeuonOnNOSUf SL6Y00A
9T0T/LT/IT 66LT6000 910 TIVd 00'96C°1 SILITIAY 0909-TLOV0T INFWAVd YOLOMILSNI T1VA S1Y0dS LLAATIL HO MIN
09°She ‘[eI0L HIRYD)
22NIWUIOY) [EIHOISIH 9LYLOOA
9T10TZ/LT/IT 86LT6000 9TTL 09°SPE 9ILITIdV §90T-¥¥00 HLOTOATAV.LI WNOO TvORIOLSIH HJAILVAYO 300VS dHL HO MIN
8S'8ST°9 ‘18101 YI3q)
9OUBUINUIBIA SIEMYOS L86S00A
OT0T/LT/TT L6LT6000 8S801d 6¥98T1 8S°85T‘9 9ILITIdVY 9€19-€TS101 SHOIAYAS dSV-SO J010dS JI'T1dNd AIVONNS HO M
£€9°b81 JeI0 L, YI3q)
sarddng 221130 £CELOOA
9T0T/LT/TT 96LT6000 ¢S8019IH08 YL TET- IILITIAV S1€9-0L0%01 LIHAD dOVINVAQYV SHTIdVLS HO MIN
sarddng 291530 £TELOOA
9T0T/LT/IT 96LT6000 L8860V1108 67 6¥1 ITLITIAV ST€9-0L010T SAITddNS 21440 dOVINVAQV SATdVLS HO MIN
sorjddng soyy0 €TELOOA
9T10T/LT/TT 96LT6000 IE€ITITIF08 80°891 IILITIAY G1£9-0L0t01 SHI'TddNS 01440 HOVINVAQYV SATdVLS HO MIN
00°06¥ SBIOL YOI YD)
S30IAISG TRUOLISSIJOI] STLIOOA
9TOT/LT/TT S6LT6000 19819 00061 SILITIdV 6609-CISTOI STVOISAHd H4X0TdINA LOO IOVINHH Hd9SOf LS HO MIN
6€TT9 ‘[BIOL HIORYD
suoydajay, 9Z1900A
Ae@HIRYD  #INY) #0d #3d10AU] junoury a1 gaeg uondudsa@/unoddy uondLdsa(q I/Pue) Iopusp adAy
9107/8T/TT 104
I)SISNY YD

enuadeld Jo 51D



WL Z1:TTII1

SUIYOEIA - ISUT IUBLE M 1dV <00°€> OOV IdV

:podoy

¢l :98eq
Ae(: 910Z/87/11 uosInUyY 9], :19s))
66°ShE :eI0L, YD)
Iorepm SYIT00A
910T/L1/TT 80876000 91LOIT 66°€PE 9ILITIAV S€£9-565601 SHOYVHO YALVM 1/11-LT/6 YHILVM VANIT VEIOA HO MIN
007001 [eyo L M2y
saiddng jusunreda( [eroadg LOZOTOA
910Z/LT/IT LOSZ6000 910ZSITT 007001 SILITIAV 10€9-11ST0T dIHSYVTOHOS AVA SNVIALAA NVHLVN ‘1M HO MIN
00°618 :[EI0], }9Y)
S30IAIDS [eUOTIINISUL SI8600A
910T/LT/TT 90876000 9107 TIVd 00°618 9ILII1dV 0909-1L0+01 AOLOMILSNI SSVID TIVd NATIAT ‘SITTIM HO MIN
95" 8Fb 6 LN BEL )
SureIS014 AJUNUWIWOo) 08T800A
9T0Z/LT/IT SO8T6000  LS601d 0v9T'T 05°801°F SILITIAV T0V9-8€S6L / T0¥9-1L0v31 NOILVI¥OdSNVYIL ¥S 100 LISNVYL NYALSIM HO MIN
suresold Arunumuo) 08T800A
9I0Z/LT/IT S08T6000  LS601d €€97°C 00°CTIT 91LITIdY 10v9-8€S6L / T0V9-SLOVOT I SIIINIVA LddS LISNVIL NJALSAM HO M
sweIgoid Aunuimor) 087800A
910T/LT/IT S08T6000  LS601d 9797 90°81TY 9ILITIdY 10+9-8€S6L / 10V9-1L0t81 NOILVLYOdSNVYL ¥S LdAS LISNVIL NYALSAM HO MIN
¥y 8IS qEIOL WD
[eyuay] Juowdinby 20150 9L0010A
910T/L1/1T $0826000 €SPRIE9E106 PH81S SILITIAV SL19-565601 1NOANE JAIdOO Md NI JONTA ODOUVA STTEM HO MIN
00°0S1T [0 YD
SureI130I1J UoneaIoay L6TOTOA
910Z/LT/TT £08T6000 T00°8LET100Z 00°0ST 9ILITIAV OVEP-8HE6L / OV E-000001 NALLIHM - ANNATT LIS0dad VIAONV ‘SOId 4d VAA HO MIN
70909°C HqEIOL HIPYD
H/M SYV/SUVd 224oidwyg 18L800A
910T/L1/1T Z08Z6000 191H1IT L8'1 SILITIAV 9Z12-L£00 11/11 dd $/11 4/d SYV/SYVd 00¥T2097L9# SAVI JINVE SN HO M
H/M SUV/SYVd d24ojduy 18L800A
9T10Z/LT/IT TORZ6000 I9THITT $T10€1 9ILITIdV 9Z1Z-0100 I1/1T ad $/11 A/d SUV/SAVA 00v7209vL9% SIV JINVE SN HO MIN
o[qeded SYV/SUVd foAojdwy 18L800A
910T/L1/T1 Z08T6000 I9THITL L8'T 9ILITIAV 1€12-L£00 I1/11.Ad §/11 9/d SYV/SIVd 00¥Z7097L9% SAVA JINVE SN HO M
Ae@ HRYD #AWYD #0d #3210AU] junowry 1 9ynegq uondLs3@AuneddYy wondLdsaq @1/5WeEN 10puap adLy,
9T07/8Y/TL 104
JI3ISI39Y HY)

enuade[d Jo A1)



duny: 71:¢T9l

SUIYDEBAL - ISI'T WELEM, 1V :<00°¢> 0OV IdV

poday

91 :a8ed
3jed: 9107/8T/11 uosoy 1191, :I3s()
910Z/17/11 S18T6000 SSL8T 06°L8I 911Z11dV 09£9-S00S / 09€9-LF0€0T SINMOJINN ad SINIOJINN ANOLSATI HO MW
SULIOJIU[) 8LI600A
9T0T/1T/1T S18Z6000 LELBT ST°E8 91ICI1dV 09€9-0+00< / 09£9-010€01 SINJOAIN(1 dd SIWIOJINN ANOLSATA HO M
SULIofIuy 8LT600A
910Z/1Z/11T S18T6000 6V98C 9TtV 91ICIIdV 09¢9-0+005 / 09£9-010£01 SINJOAINN dd SINIOAINN ANOLSAHAT HO MIA
SULIOJTU() 8L1600A
910Z/1Z/11 S18T6000 8€98C 96°C1 911Z11dV 09£9-01700S / 09£9-0+0£01T SINMOAINN ad SIWJOAINN ANOILSATI HO M
suuoyIuy 8L1600A
910Z/1Z/IT ST18T6000 988 80109 911Z11dV 09£9-000S / 09€9-0+0£01T SINYOAINN ad SINIOAINN ANOLSATT HO MIN
suogIun 8LI600A
9T0T/TT/TT SI18T6000 12¥8C 1£°¢8 9TITIIdV 09€9-080065 / 09€9-£+0£01 SINYO4INN dd SINIOJINN ANOLSATY HO MIN
86°09L'S [e10L H29Y)
saprunuo)) a8episy 881010A
9T0T/TZ/1T +18T6000 ¥S601d 668L8 86°09L°C SIICIIdV L90T-T6E6L / LIOT-HY00 STVINAYA TOYLINOD DIddViL SHIIAYAS OI44AVEL TOf HO MIN
sSSP ‘8101, H9Y)
UoNEnSIUNUPY Alred PIIy], 81S800A
910T/1T/TT £1826000 P666LEVE S8 PI ITICTIdV §209-020201 Sddd FONVHIYHLNI T/d 100 SId HO MIN
8TTET B0 YD
Sururexy, grels 080+00A
910Z/1Z/11 TIBZ6000 9ILTIT 8T1€T 9IIZIIdV 0S79-LY0€0T ADOVATIN ‘STVIAN ONINIVYL ad HJASOr “TTANNOD HO MIN
6L°0ST J[€J0L HRY)
eusy Juswdinbyg 2130 608300A
910Z/1Z/IT 11826000 LSEVLIOTOY 6L70ST 911Z11dV SL19-565601 ADVSN Y4140 LIYOTANY SNOLLNTOS NONVD HO MIN
¥6°88T [E10L, YY)
auoydayay, 60L800A
910T/1Z/TT 01826000 9T0TSITIX ¥6'88C 9TIZI1dV S179-56S601 SHOAVHO AVdI L/T1-8/01 ALI'TTHOW L % LV HO MIN
00°09LT ‘[e10L H9YD
SOOIAIOG UOTONLSUOD) YSI0TOA
910T/1/TT 60826000 1€601d LOOT 00°09L°C 9TIZIIdV S8T9-THS6L / §819-S5SEEE SHOIAYAS DNILTIM LNVID SSANISNE AIIONVAQV HO MIN
e YYD  #WYD #0d #adl0AU] Junowy a1 yareg wondiiassqAuneddy wondunsaq AL/AWeEN I0PudA adAy
9107/87/11 104
I3ISIZY NI

enudeLd Jo A1)



dW]: 71:7T9l

SUIYIRIAl - ISIT IMEIR M 1dV :<00'e> WO0PIdV

;proday

L1 :a8egq
Aed: 910T/87/11 uosinuy 197 :Ias()
rroTy'e ([BIOL HI¥YD
sopruo)) afejusy £96000A
910Z/1T/1T 818T6000 0960Id  T00-6£0TvL9 17109 9TITIIdV L90T-TEE6L / LOOT-¥Y00  STVINTI INHWJINOG ADVIINEH "00 LNIWAINOd ALVLSNAS HO MIN
Qamuro)) a3eyIoH £96000A
ST0T/TT/TT 81826000 09601d  100-6£0THL9 OL'81S STIZIIdV L90T-T6E6L / LI0T-HF00  STVINTI INFWIINOH AOVINAH ‘0D INFINAINOTA ALVISNNS HO MW
sopIuo)) a8ejey £96000A
910T/1T/1T 81876000 09601d  T100-T0TIVL9 8T'L6 STICIIdV L90T-T6E6L / L90T-¥P00  STVINTY INTWJIINOHT ADVIRIAH "00 INTWJINOT ALVISNAS HO MIN
sonrunuo)) agejay] £96000A
910¢/1T/1T 81826000 09601d  T00-T180%L9 TT6LT 91IZIIdV L90T-TEE6L / LOOT-v¥00  STV.INTA LNFNLINOG IOVINNAH ‘00 INHINAINOT ALVISNNS HO MW
sonuo)) 98eILIsy] £96000A
910Z/1T/1T 81876000 09601d  T00-6080VvL9 T6'8FS 91IZIIdV L90T-T6E6L / LOOT-VP00  STV.INTY LNFWAINOT ADVLIIMAH ‘0D INTNIINOT ALVISNNS HO MIN
sonIuIo)) 28 IS £96000A
910T/TT/TT 818T6000 09601d 100-6080¥L9 0 €LOT S1ICIIdV L90T-T6E6L / L9OT-PP00  STVINTY INAWJINOA dDOV.LINAH "00 LNAWAINOT ALVISNAS HO MIA
sapumo)) 28eIIoy £96000A
910¢/1T/1T 81826000 0960Id  100-+6L0tL9 8T'L6 91ICIIdV L90T-T6E6L / LIOT-¥F00  STVINTE LNTNAINOT dOV.IIMAH ‘0D LNAJINOA ALVISNNS HO MIN
somuo)) a3e)Isy £96000A
9102/17/11 818T6000 09601d  100-£6L0VL9 8T'L6 9TITIIdV L90T-T6E6L / LIOT-vF00  STVINAA INIWNAINOT ADVIINAH ‘00 INTNIINOT ALVISNNS HO M
sapIuwo)) d8eILIsH £96000A
910Z/1T/1T 818T6000 09601d  100-86L01L9 8T'L6 9IITIIdV L90T-T6E6L / LIOT-v¥00  STVINTE INTNAINOT IOVIIMTH ‘0D INFNAINOT ALVISNAS HO MIN
6T'96¥'sE :[€I0L YD
SIOIAISG UOIIONIISUOD) 6310T0A
910T/1¢/1T L18T6000 $S601d 65S0T 67°96F°SE 91IZIIdV S819-€6019 / S8T19-HSSEECE SAS NOLLOMILSNOD D04 FTIVANIdIA I HO MIN
00'S0LL EIOL HIIGD
SIVIAISS [BUOTSSJOI] S6S600A
9102/1¢/1T 91826000 TL801d 9L89T1 00°SOLL 911C11dV 6609-02070T SAS YIOVNVIN HONVNIA 6/11-1£/01 SANALINNIN HO MIA
0L'TET ‘B0l RY)
SULIOJTU ) 8LI1600A
910%/1T/1T S1826000 6887 +0°80¢ STIZIIdV 09€9-0100S / 09¢9-1+0€01 SIIOJINN ad SINJOAINN ANOLSAHIN HO MIN
SULIOJIU() 8LT600A
Ae YYD  # MY #0d #ODI0AU] JUNOWY a1 ey uondiIdsa(Hunody uonpdrLIdsa( dI/PWeN 10pusp adAy,
9107/8Z/TT 104
JI)SIZNY HIPY)

enuade[d Jo A1)



awmy: Z1:TT:91

SUIYOBI - ISUT WELe M JV -<00'¢> INOOV IV

spodoy

81 :a8eq
aed: 9107/87/11 UoSINUY [19], 43S}
910Z/8T/11 €T8T6000 PZ0T091/S19C S¥'6C Y2091 Ad 9L1Z-0100 L/STY/TT HLVA Ad 91/6 /1T HED FONVIO HLYION 0/D vADd HO MIN
L8'LIY ‘[e10L HI3YgD
H/MA\ SIUSUIYSIUIBL) LOOSO0A
9102/8T/11 TT8T6000 PTO109T/¥1LT L8 LTV Y091 Ad 9612-0100 O/STYIT AILVA Ad 91/6T/1T T/d JATIHHS ALINNOD HONVIO HO MIN
IP°LIE HULAR CLl o)
san( 90ssy VADO/VAId 669000A
910Z/8¢/1T 1T8T6000 ¥201091/019C 960 YCO91Ad 9LIZ-LEOO 91/ST/TT ALVA dd 91/61/11 A/d AINNOD HONVIO HO MIN
son( 20ssy VADO/VIDd 669000A
910Z/8T/11 1286000 ¥201091/019C 6¥°ST Y2091 Ad 9L1Z-8%00 SLI/ST/TT ALVA dd 91/61/11 A/d AINNOD FONVIO HO MIN
san( 20ssy VADO/VAId 669000A
910T/8T/11 1T8T6000 ¥20T091/019C T€€8T ¥2091Ad 9L1Z-0100 91/ST/IT ALVA Ad 91/61/11 A/d AINNOD HONVIO HO MIN
sanq 2088y VHDO/VAId 669000A
910Z/8T/T1 128T6000 $201091/019C 69°L YC091Ad 9L1Z-6200 OL/ST/IT HLVA Ad 91/61/11 d/d AINNOD HONVIO HO MIN
00709 TEIOL RYD
H/A\ SIUSUIYSTUIRL) YOr000A
9102/8T/1T 0T8T6000 ¥201091/0TLT 009 $Z09TAd 9612-8700 OL/STYITALVA Ad ST/61/IT H/d @IVOd XV.L ASITHONVIId HO MIN
H/M SIUSUIYSTUIEL) ¥0000A
910Z/8T/11 0Z8T6000 PTOT09T/01LT 00°9 $2091Xd 961Z-6200 /ST HLVA Ad 91/61/11 d/d @IVOLd XVI SIHONVId HO MIN
H/M syusurysturery Y0r000A
910Z/82%/11 0786000 ¥TOT091/0TLT 00°8Y YZ091Ad 961Z2-0100 SU/SUYTTHLVA AL 91/6T/ITd/d  @IVOLd XV.IL HSTHONVId HO MIN
90°8PI‘1 ‘[BI0L YD
H/M siusurysiures) €18700A
9102/8T/T1 61876000 ¥T01091/00LT ST'9Y Y2091 Ad 961C-L£00 91/ST/TT HLVA Ad 91/61/11 d/d HLIVLS VINIOII'TVD HO MW
H/M\ Siusurysturesy €18700A
9102/8T/11 61826000 PCOT091/00LT 88'LEI Y2091 Ad 961T-8100 91/ST/1T A1LvVA Ad 91/61/11 A/d HLVLS VINJOAITVO HO MIN
H/M STUSUIYSTUIES) £18+00A
910Z/87/11 61826000 tZ0T1091/00LT €S 1v6 ¥Z091Xd 961Z2-0100 SL/ST/TT ALVA Ad 91/61/11 9/d dLVIS VINIOAITVD HO MW
H/MA\ siusurysturery £[8Y00A
910Z/8T/11 61876000 ¥ZOT091/00LT 0S°TT Y2091 Ad 9612-6200 SI/ST/1T ALVA Ad 91/61/11 H/d dLIVLIS VINJOAI'TVD HO MIN
e YWY  #A9YD #0d #9d10A0] jUnowy ail yneq uondusaqaunoddy oy dunssq I/oue) I0pus A ad4y,
910T/8T/11 104
II)SISNY HIYD)

enuade[d Jo A



dmy: ZI1:TT91
.- 9107/8T/11

61 :98eg

SUIYIRIA - ISI'T IWELBA dV <00€> INOOF 1dV odayy
UOSINUY 1197, :13S()

0T°000°LLE ‘[Byox yRq)H
07°000°LLE [er0L A4y,
LY 06€'T ‘[B10L HI3YD
VINDI - 2[qeded dwo)) pauaja(q 16TL00A
9107/8T/T1 9T8T6000 ¥201091/909T 69°6S Y091 Ad 0LIZ-8%00 91/ST/TIT ALVA Ad 91/61/11T T/d YHASNV AL LNIOdADVINVA HO MIN
VINOI - elqeAeq dwo)) paxsayoq I61L00A
910T/82/11 9TBT6000 ¥T01091/909C 90°L1 V091 Ad 0LIT-LEOO OL/STYTT AILVA Ad 91/61/11 H/d JHASNVILL INIOdIOVINVA HO M
VINOI - 2IqeAed dwio) pariajaq I61L00A
910T/8T/1T 92876000 YZ01091/909C +9°v1 Y2091Ad 0L12-6200 /ST HLVA Ad 91/61/11 H/d JHASNVIL LNIOdIDOVINVA HO M
VIADI - o1qefed duio) pawaja(g [61L00A
9T0T/8C/11 9T8T6000 ¥201091/909C 80°667°C YCO9TAd 0L1C-0100 OU/STY/IT A1VA Ad 91/6 /11 H/d HASNVIL LNIOdIDVINVA HO M
(U 20A (4 BL2AA R Ll
san(q 00ssY a010J BRUOE]J 61SE00A
9102/8T/1T $TRT6000 ¥201091/029C Ov'L16°C Y2091 Ad 8LIT-0100 91/ST/IT ALVA Ad 91/6 /11 A/d dII'TOd VIINGOVId HO MIN
(£ 444 eI0L H9YH
san(y ussy SN 991104 6£8000A
9102/8¢/11 7876000 YT0T091/629C TS'Th6 Y2091 Ad 0812-0100 SI/ST/IT HLVA Ad 91/61/11 A/d HOI'TOd VILNADVId HO M
00°€e [810L HI3qD)
sen(y 208sY VADO/VADd 6L9000A
9102/8T/1T £T8T6000 YT01091/S19C S9°C Y091 Ad 9L1T-8100 9L/ST/11 d1VA Ad 91/6 /11 HGED AONVIO HLION 0/0 vdDd HO MW
Sen( 20SSY VHOO/VADd 6L9000A
910¢/8¢/11 £78T6000 v201091/519C 01°0 YC091Ad 9LTT-LEOO 9L/SYTT ALVA dd 91/61/1T HRD HONVIO HLYON 0/0 vadd HO MIA
SeN(J 20SSY VADO/VADd 6L9000A
910¢/8T/11 €T8T6000 ¥Z0T091/S19C 080 Y2091 Ad 9L1T-6200 91/STYTT ALVA Ad 91/61/1T RD FONVIO HLION 0/0 VIDd HO MIN
sen( 2088y VHOO/VADd 6L9000A
A YY) #MPYD #0d #9010AU] JUnowry a1 yaeg uondusa@aunodrdy uondLiasaq dI/SWEN I0PU3IA adAy
910T/8T/11 104
I9)SISNY M)

enuadR[{ Jo A1)



duWmL: €0:S1:91

JMUORIS[H - ISIT IUBLIRM :dV <[0°€> AOOF IV Moday
Neq: 910¢/87/11 UoSINIY 191, 43S}
6b°LOT 0SS (€10, JUDWASINGSI( U0
SO'LYS‘ELT :91/87/01 X105 ysoda( 32211 [joided HOV
PH09€9LZ IS[E10 ], qNS JUIWISINGSI(] NUWOLIIH
99°6Z¢€ (100) ssodaq [eroads-10L
S6vEL'D- (6£00) >\ % PIesH 24o[dwg-109
7L°08S (L£00) uopenSITWPY 3SNJ3Y-10S
86°SSIT (€££00) s3afoxg rende) HID-10p
20°€TI'S (8100) 3dUBT)UIEN IOMIS-GLT
IL°6T9°T (6700) 2>uenauiely 2dedspurT-s97
\\\ 009€€ (8500) pung HAJ-112
9 09€°9LT ey Iad 0€°0€6PLT (0100) puny [e13UWD-TQT
000 :EIOL PIOA T PUITATSERO L Td aweN puny
000 do
000 I
PP 09€°9LT da
000 dv
Aq S[E) a
¥y 09€9LT :[B)0L, purls)
aeq 3oy #30d #0d #9d10AU] Junoury a1 yaeg uondLIdss(AuUN0DY wondudsaq dr/owme)N Jopusp ad4y,

9102/90/Tk 104
JI)SISOY JUSWASINGSI(Y NUOIFIIY

enuadeld Jo AN



qumy: £0:S1:91
ABd: 910C/8¢/11

1 :98egq

OTUON2A[T - ISIT JURIR A 1V <[0°€> FOOP 1AV Hodoy

uosinuy o], :I19s))

910Z/91/11 TEL30000 91 4dd0LD0 98°0Z1 9ISTIIHOV 10£9-100101 ANOV1d ALVIIILLIAD VORIAAY 40 JNVE dd
S2OUBIJUOY) 29 STUNSIN 1¥LS00A

910T/9T/1T TEL8O000 91 J4d01LD0 91°¢€9 9ISTITHOV SYC9-100101 SAI'TddNS TIONNOD VOV 40 NV dd
S9OUSIRJUOY) 29 STUNSIA [¥L800A

9T0Z/9T/IT TELSOOOO 91 Y4dOLD0O 8S°LI 9ISITTHOV SPT9-100101 SHI'TddNS TIDONNOD VOIdNYV 40 JANVI dd
S9OUSISJUO)) 79 STUNIN 1¥LS00A

9T0Z/9T/IT TELB0000 91 4dOLDO0O £8°9¢ 9ISTITHDV S¥T9-100101 SAI'TddNS TIONNOD VOTIdNV 40 JNVE dd
SO0URIRJUO)) 79 SSuneS 1HL800A

9T0T/91/11 TELS0000 91 YddOLD0 00001 9ISITTHOV S¥Z9-100101 DHY LSV LIVIId JHGINVHD VORIdIAV 40 JINVd dd
S90UIAJUO)) 29 SSUNISA I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELBO00O 91 YHdOLD0O 96 ¥£S 9ISTTTHOV $¥29-100101 HANVA - DIVIITY D0-00V VORIV 40 JINVE dd
S90UQI9JUO)) 29 SSUNSIA I+LS00A

910Z/91/T1 TELRBO0O 91 Y490LD0 00956°T 9ISTITHOV S¥T9-10010T DY ADVIOAQV D0-00V VORIV 40 ANV dd
$30U2I2JU0)) 29 SSUNSAN 1¥L300A

910¢/91/11 TELSD00O 91 d4d0LD0 9£°59 9ISITIHOV SYT9-100101 SHITddNS TIONNOD VOGNV 40 JNVd da
SOOULIAJUO)) 29 STUNASA I+L800A

910Z/9T/11 TELS0000 91 Y4dOLD0O 8S°LI 9ISTITHOV $¥Z9-100101 SAI'TddNS TIONNOD VORIdIAV 40 YNV dd
sonIuIIo)) a3e)sy 1¥L800A

910C/91/TT TELBO0O0O 91 Y4d0LD0 05°L91 9ICTIITHOV L90T-T6E6L / LIOT-¥H00 SNOIS HavVivd dOVINdH VOTJdINV 40 JINVE dd
QAUIUWO)) AIOSIAPY JOIUSG IVL800A

9102/9T/T1 TELS0000 91 ¥4dOLI0O TL6v 9ISTITHOV ¥90C-++00 SAI'TddNS YLINID dS VORIAINYV 40 JINVd dd

08'069°TI (8101 294D

VIADI - ojqeded dwo) pairajeq 967000A

STOZ/VT/TIT 1€L30000 €20T091/566C 0S°L €2091Ad 0LIT-LEOO II/T/IT HIVA Ad 91/5/1T dd  LSNIL INFNTILLTI VINOI dd
VINDI - 21qeAed dwo) pausje(q 9617000A

9T0T/PT/TT 1€£L80000 £20T091/566C ST90¢€ €209TAd 0L12Z-8+00 I/I/IT HIVA Ad 91/¢/11 dd  LSNUL INTIWNTILLTT VIADI d3
VIADI - S1qeAed dwo) pawdfa(q 96v000A

9102/¥T/IT T1€L30000 €201091/S66T 0506 €2091Ad 0L17-6200 IV/IT/IT ALVA Ad 91/5/11 dd  LSNEL INIWTILLAT VINDI dd
VINDI - dlqeded dwo) pasaje(q 96%000A

9T0T/YI/IT 1€L80000 €201091/S66T SS'98TTL £C091Ad 0L1Z-0100 /TI/IT HLvVA dd 91/5/1T dd  LSOEL INFWTILLTA VINDI dd

e Jou #J19d #0d #9910AU] JUNOWY a1 yareq uondiIasa(@ unoddy uonduiasa( QI/2meN IopusA adA

9T0T/8T/TT 104

J3)SI83Y JUIWISANGSI(] dTHOIPIT

enuadeld Jo A1)



auwmLy: ¢0:61:91
ABA- 9107/3¢/11

7 :98eg

OIIONO3[H - ISIT MBI A 1V '<[0°€> H00YIdY :3rodoy
UOSINIY 3], :JIAS(}

910T/9T/11 TEL8O00O 91 Y44OLD0O 89'6¢ IISTITHOV STE9-TISTOT SHITddNS 01440 VORMIAV A0 JINVE dd
sarpddng 90110 1vL800A

910T/91/11 CTEL80000 91 4440100 L8191 S9ISTITHOV STEO-TISIOT YHINIEd O¥d LHMIASV] VORMHAYV 40 JINVE da
sariddng 991530 IvL800A

910T/91/1T TEL8000O 91 ¥H90LD0 €T°¢ 9ISTITHOV STE9-TISIOT SHI'TddNS AD1I40 VORIANY J0 JINVd dd
S90ULIRJUO)) 29 SBUIIAN IVL800A

910T/9T/IT T¢L80000 91 44d0LD0 ¥0'6L 9ISTITHOV SYTo-T1S101 HINNTONILTAN SSINISNd VODIANY 40 JNVE dd
SOIURISJUO)) 29 STUNIIA IvL800A

910Z/91/1T TEL8DO00 91 JHIOLDO S1°8F 9ISTITHOV SYTO-TISIOT HIONNTONILHFAW SSEANISNE VOV 40 3NV da
S9OUIOJUOY) 29 STUNRIN [7L800A

910Z/9T/1T C€L80000 91 YHIOLDO $S°18 9ISTTTHOV SPTO-TISTOT HONNTHONILHHN SSANISNE VOIIdNYV 40 MINVE dd
S9JURIJUOY) 29 SSUIIOA 1vL800A

910Z/9T/1T TELB0000 91 Y440LDO0 €709 9ISTITHOV SHPTO-TISTOT HONNTONILIFHN SSANISNE VORMAY d0 JINVE da
S9OULISJUOD) 29 STUNLIN 17L800A

910T/91/11 TE€L8000O 91 4440100 86’89 9ISIITHOV SYTO-TIS101 HONNTONILIHN SSINISNd VORIdY 40 NV dd
S0USISJUOY) 29 STUNIN I¥L800A

910T/91/T1T TEL8000O 91 4440LD0 T¥'SE S9ISTITHOV SYTO-TISIOI STVAN ONILIAW SSANISNd VORIANYV dO JINVE dq
S30UQI9JUO)) 29 STUNIIN 1¥L800A

910T/9T/IT T€L80000 91 Y4d0LD0 S€'LE 9ISTITHOV SYTO-TIST0T1 HONOTONILIIW SSANISNd VOV 40 JINVd dq
S3OURIJUO)) 29 SSUTPIA 1¥L800A

910Z/9T/T1 T€L80000 91 ¥H40LD0 $6'61 9ISTITHOV SPTO-TISTOT SHI'TddNS DLW 33904 ASV.L VORANY 40 JNVE da
S90ULIJUOY) 29 STUNIIN 1¥L800A

910T/91/1T TEL80000 91 44dO0LD0 119¢T S9ISTITHOV SYTO-TISIOT VINMAV - TALOH ANOD dNOHAT VO VORIAY J0 3NV da
SOOURISJUO)) 29 STUIIA 1¥L800A

910T/91/1T TELBO00O 91 Y44O1D0 Tr'ee 9ISTTITHOV SYPTO-TIS10T SHI'TddNS DLW 30904 MSVL VORIAY d0 YINVd dd
SOOURISFUO)) 29 STUIIN 1¥L800A

910¢/9T/1T TE£L80000 91 440100 S8°'L 9ISTITHOV SYTO-TISIO0T V4 VD ANOD dNOVAT VD VIORIANY 40 JINVE dd
$90U2I0JU0)) 29 SSuNPaN 1¥L800A

9T10T/9T/IT T€L80000 91 YHIO01O0 89°6S 9ISTITHOV SPTO-TISIOT HONNTONILII SSANISNE VORIV J0 JINVE d4d
sor[ddng jusunreda(y ewads T¥L800A

aeq oA #Jd #0d #9910AU] JUROWY al yareg uonduidsa(q3unoddy uondrLIdsa(g (I/5meN Jopudp adA L

910¢7/8T/TT 104

JI)SISY JUIUIISINGSI(Y HTOIPIIF

enuadEld Jo A)D



amiy: €0:61:91
A'(: 910T/8T/T1

¢ :a8eg

Iuonoa[q - ISTT eI M 1V <[0°e> 00K 1V Modoy
uosINUY L3, :JI3S()

9T0T/9T/1T TEL0000 91 ¥49dO0LDO0 8¥001 9ISIITHOV 10€9-TIST0T STVAN TANVd MATAIILINI VOV 40 JNVE dd
sorpddng jueunreds( [eads T¥L800A

9T0Z/91/T1 TELBO0OOO 91 499d0LDO0 00°9¢ 9ISITIHOV [0€9-TISTO0T STVHN TANVd MHIAYALINI VOTIdINY J0 JINVY dd
sarfddng juounreda( [eradg T¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TEL8O000 91 4990100 1T°8C 9ISITIHDV 10€9-CIS101 STVIN TANVd MATAYAINI VOIddAY 40 JINVE dd
Surure1], geis 1¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TELB0000 91 499d0LDO0 00709 SISITTHOV 0629-TISIO0I SAI'TddS ONINIVIL VOIIdAY 40 ZINVd dd
Surure1], geis IVL800A

9T0Z/91/IT TEL80000 91 ¥4d0LIO0 0TIV 9ISTITHOV 0ST9-TIST0I STVAN ANOD S¥ddIVD VOIJIAY 40 JINVY dq
Surure1], yei§ [PL800A

9TOZ/91/IT TELS0000 91 4940100 008 SISTTTHDV 0$79-C1S101 ONIEVd ANOD SYddTVO VOTJHNV d0 JINVE dd
Suture1} gels [¥L800A

9T10Z/91/TT T£L80000 91 ¥4d0LD0 008 9ISTITHOV 0ST9-CISTOT DNV ANOD SYAdTVO VOIIdINV 40 JINVE dd
Surure1], ye1s IvL800A

9102/91/11T TEL0000 91 ¥H9OLI0 SL606 9ISITTHOV 0529-CIS101 SHI'TddNS ATIM SSHNTTAM VORIAAY 40 JINVE dd
Surure1] geis [vL800A

910T/91/T1 TELB000O 91 44d0LD0 00°€E SISTITHOV 06Z9-TIS10T SAI'TddNS ITdM SSENTTIM VOV 40 JINVE dd
Surure1], geis I¥7L800A

910T/91/TT TEL8OOOO 91 ¥4dOLDO 00°€€ 9ISTITHOV 0529-TIST01 SAI'TddNS ITAM SSINTTIM VOIIIAY 40 JINVE dq
Buiurer], gerg 1vL800A

910Z/91/TT TELB0000 91 ¥d9d0OLDO0 ¥vL'L 9ISTTTHOV 0ST9-CISTOL SdI'lddNS JFdM SSANTTAM VORIV 40 JINVE dq
Suturer] ge1s 1L800A

910T/91/1T TEL80000 91 44dOLD0 0¥'61 9ISITTIHOV 0829-TIS101 SAI'TddNS AFIM SSANTTIM VORIV 40 JINVd dd
Surure1], Jei1§ 17L800A

910T/91/1T TELBO00O 91 4gd0LI0 S0°'6 9ISIITHOV 0S29-T1S101 SHI'TddNS JTHM SSINTTIM VOIIANY J0 JINVH dd
Surure1y, geig T¥L800A

910T/91/1T TE€LY0000 91 49d0LI0 6t°S6 SISTITHOV 0529-CIST01 SAI'TddNS IFIM SSANTTIM VOIJdNV 40 JINVd dd
$30UBIOJUO)) 2 SUNSIA 1¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TEL]OO0O 91 ¥9490LD0 008 SISTITIHDV SYTo-TI1S101 DNV ANOD S¥ddTVO VOTJdNYV 40 JINVE dd
serrddng 20130 17L300A

e Jo #J¥ #0d #9d10AU] JUDOWY a1 gveq uondLidsa(Aunedy uwoydLrasaq QI/2WIEN 10PUS A adKJ,

9107/87/11 104

J9)SI39Y JUUIISINGSI(] JTTOXIIIY

enuddRId Jo A1)



ammyy: €0:61:91
18- 9107/8¢/11

p :a8eq

OTUONDAYT - ISTT JWRLBA 1V <10°€> 00y IdV :Moday
uosjnuy 0] :Iasn)

9TOT/91/11 TELBOOOO 91 YddOLDO0O 00°0S 9ISTIITHOV 9€19-€CS101 NOILdTIDSENS FIVMILIOS 11 VORIV 40 INVd dd
SOUBUSIUIEIA] SIEMIJOS 1¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TEL8OO00 91 94dO0LD0O $6'9¢C SISTITHOV 9¢19-£TSI101 NOILdIOSENS VIOANVd VOIIdINYV 40 NV d3
SOUBUDJUIRIA] 9TEMOS I¥L800A

910T/91/TT TELB0000 91 JHIOLIO0 8T8LI 9ISTITHOV 9€19-€7ST0L SANIT TTVD dONTITAINOD VORIV 40 MNVH dd
sorrddng jusunreda( eoads I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELB000O 91 YFI0LO0 06'vy 9ISTITHOV 10£9-¥1ST01 SAI'TddNS a0d VOTIdINYV 40 JINVd dq
sariddng jusunreds( reroadg 1¥L800A

9107/91/1T TELB0O000 91 4990100 95°1C 9ISTITHOV 10€9-+1ST10T SATTddNS AOd VOIIANY d0 JINVd dd
sorddng jusunreda(g [eroadg [¥LSO0A

910¢/91/11 TEL8000O 91 Y490LD0 $8°S1 9ISTITHOV [0€9-vIS101 SAI'TddNS 214410 AOd VORIV 40 JINVE dd
sorjddng yusunreda(y feroads I7L800A

910Z/91/IT TELZ0000 91 49490120 9861 SISTITHOV T10€9-¥1STOL dod ¥O4d Saxod 9114 VOTIdINYV 40 JINVd dq
sayddng juounreda( fewadg 1¥L800A

910TZ/9T/TT TELR/D0DO 91 499d01D0 ¥L'16 9ISITIHOV 10€9-¥1ST01 SdI'TddNS 21440 Aod VOIIdINY 40 JINVH dq
SOOULIRJUO)) 79 SSUNPSA I¥L800A

9102/91/11 TEL80O00O 9T 4HdOLD0 86’6 SISTITHOV SYTo-v1S101 SHAI'TddNS DNILFAN SOV VOV 40 JINVH dd
SOUSISJUOY) 79 STUNIA IPL800A

9T0T/9T/TT TEL8OOOO 91 49d0LD0 +8'66¢ 9ISTITHOV SYTO-vISIOl THLVd - THLOH ANOD VSd0 VORIV J0 JINVE dd
SIOUAIIUOY) 29 SSUNSIN 1VL800A

9102/91/T1 TELB0000 91 ¥q901LO0 0TI SISTITHOV SYTO-V1S101 TALVd - TVAN ANOD VSHD VOIIdINY 40 JINVE dq
S9OULISJU0)) 29 STUNSSN 1¥L800A

910T/91/1T TELB0OO0O 91 4490100 89°9¢ SISTITHOV SYT9-¥1S101 TALVd - STVAN ANOD VSHD VORIAY A0 JINVd dd
saijddng soy30 [7L800A

910T/91/11 TELB0000 91 4490100 00°00¢ SISITIHDV ST1E€9-€IST0T YO.LINOW VORIHAV 40 JINVd dd
sariddng 991330 IvL800A

9T0Z/91/1T TELB0000 91 4490100 98°0CL 9ISITIHDV S1€9-€1S101 AN0V1d ALVOIIILIAD VOTIdNYV 40 JINVA dq
sorddng 291330 I¥L800A

910T/91T/IT T£L80000 91 FdOLD0 8€+9¢€ S9ISITIHDV SIe9-CISION SHI'TddNS 01440 VOIMHINY 40 JNVY dd
sarddng juounredad [eroads T¥L800A

e JPY #3194 #0d #3210AW] jJunoury a1 yMeyg uondLdsagaunoddy uonduidsa( QI/5We)N 10pudA ad{1,

910¢/8¢7/11 104

J9)SIS9Y] JUSUIISINGSI(Y JIUOXIIIY

enuade[d Jo A1)



awmL: €0:61:91
Ae(q: 9107/8¢/11

¢ :98eg

[uONAd[ - ISIT MRLeM dV :<10°€> H00F1dV Modoy
uosINUY 19], IS}

910Z/91/11 TELS0000 91 YHIOLDO SL'8L 9ISTITHOV SI€9-1€5T01 SAI'Tdd0S 01140 VORIANY 40 JINVE dd
soriddng 201130 IvL800A

9107/91/11 TELY0OOO 91 YHOLOO LI'E€E 9ISTIITHOV ST€9-1£5201 SAI'TddNS 01440 VORIANY 40 JINVE ad
juowdmby 2 Krouryoeiy I¥L800A

910T/91/11 TELS0000 91 YAIOLOO 79655 9ISIIIHOV 0+89-€7ST01 JIOLINOW VOTIANY 40 JINVE da
juowdimbyg 2 Arouryoejy [¥L800A

910T/91/IT TELYDO0O 91 YAFOLDO L96 9ISTITHOV 0189-£2ST101 YHLIVAY JAMOd VORIANY 40 JINVE dad
surdinbg 2 Arouryoejy I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELS0000 91 4AFOLIO 9T+8 9ISTTTHOV 0189-£2ST01 SYOLOALOUd NATIDS VORIIAY J0 JINVE dd
jusurdinbg 2p Aouryory [¥LS00A

910Z/9T/1T TELYDO0O 91 YAFOLOO TS'891 9ISTITHOV 0189-€2ST01 SNAHIIS ADVARId VORMAAY 40 JNVd da
juowdinbyg 2 Areuryoey 1¥L800A

9T0Z/9T/1T TELS0000 91 YHIOLDO LO'9S 9ISTITHOV 0789-£TSTOT YHANALXT IONVY [41M VORMAINY 40 JNVE dq
juswdinby 2p Arduryoeiy [¥L800A

9T0T/9T/IT TELS0000 91 4490LIO L8191 9ISTIIHOV 0+89-£TST0T JHINTId JASV'1 VOTIANY 40 JINVE dq
sarpddng justnureds(q [eradg [¥L800A

9T0Z/91/IT TELS0000 91 YAFOLIO £8'96S 9ISIIIHOV 10£9-€ZS 101 SOV LASSY TvOISAHd VORANY 40 NV da
sor[ddng jusunreda(] [e1oadg T¥L800A

910Z/9T/1T TELRO00O 91 YFGOLI0O 91°90£C 9ISTITHOV 10£9-€ZSTOL Savdl VOQMAAY 40 JINVE dq
serpddng jusunreda( reroadg T¥LS00A

910Z/9T/IT TELS0000 91 YHIOLDO 00°61 9ISTITHOV 10€9-€ZSTOX savdl VOQIAAY 40 JINVE a3
sar[ddng jusunreda(q rewads [¥L800A

9T0Z/9T/1T TELS000O 91 YHIOLOO 050€€ 9ISTITHOV 10£9-€TSTOT SMIVOIAT DOVZ VOIIANY 40 JINVE da
sorpddng jusunreda( reroadg T¥L800A

910Z/9T/1T TELS0000 91 YHFOLOO 85'8L 9ISTITHOV 10£9-€ZSTOT SANALLYE'NOISNALXA 14V SINI VOQIdNY 40 JINVE 3
soriddng jusunreds(q eroadg [¥L800A

910Z/91/LT TELS000O 91 ¥IIOLIO ¥0'+b 9ISITTHOV 10£9-€2ST01 NI IELNDId VOTMANY 40 JINVE dq
sdryszaquisy 79 san(q [7L800A

910Z/91/11 TELROO0O 91 YHIOLOO 00°091 9ISIITHOV $$T9-£TS10I TALVd - dIHSYTINTN DV SIN VORIANY A0 JINVE d3
SOUBUSUIRIA] STeM1OS T¥LS00A

e(q A #3134 #0d HIOI0AU] JUNOWY a1 ymeg uondusaqiunoddy wondurasaq @I/AWeEN I0pus A adAy,

9T0T/8T/TL 104

J9)SI39Y] JUIWISINGSI(T NUOLIINY

enuadeld Jo A1)



dumy: €0:S1:91
Aeq: 9107/8Y/11

9 :o8eqd

DUONOA - ISIT BRI A\ 1dV 1<[0°€> FOOPTAV Hoday
uosINUY 9], :13s()

910T/91/1T TELY0000 91 YA40OLO0 19Ty 9ISTITHOV 0SZ9-170£01  TTANNOO - THLOH ONINIVIL dd VORIAAY 10 NV dd
Surmurel] geis [VL800A

9107/91/11 TELBOO0O 91 YA90LOO 91°0Er 9ISTTIHOV 05T9-T+0€0T VZYVD - TALOH DNINIVYL dd VOQJAINY J0 NV dd
SULIOJIU(} [¥L800A

9T0T/91/11 TELY0000 91 Y40LOO 0S'Ly 9ISITTHOV 09€£9-0+0€0T SINOLINN dd VORMAWY 40 JMNVE a4
sa1iddng juounzeda(] reroads I¥L800A

9T0T/91/11 TELS0O0O 91 YIIOLIO 86'61 9ISIIIHOV 10€9-0+0£01 SAI'1ddNs X0d MOTVHS VODIAY J0 JNVe dd
sofrddng juounreda(] [eroadg I¥L800A

9T0T/91/11 TELIDOOO 91 YA4OLOO 0188 9ISTITHOV 10£9-0+0£01 SAI'lddNS ad VOIMANWY J0 NV a4
sorjddng jusunredo( [eroadg [7L800A

910T/91/11 TELS000O 91 ¥A4OLOO I+'E1T SISIIIHOV 10£9-0v0£01 X0d MOAVHS VOMANY J0 JINVE a3
sarpddng juounreda(y [eroadg T¥L800A

9T0Z/91/11 TELSOOOO 91 YFIOLIO TSthe 9ISIIIHOV 10£9-0v0£0T DIIN OON - SAS ONTIALVD VORIAWY J0 NV e
Sumure] eIs IvL800A

9102/91/T1 TELZ0000 91 YAAOLIO T6'LbE'T 9ISTIIHOV 0579-0v0£01  VTITIVISVd - TALOH INOD dOVI VORMANY 40 JNVE ad
S9OUISJUO)) 29 SSUNIN 1PL800A

910T/91/11 TELY0000 91 AALOLDO 98°9C 9ISIITHOV SYT9-0¥0£01 HONO'T ONLLATN SSANISNE VOIMANY 40 JINVE da
$92UISJU0)) 29 SBUNOIN 1¥.800A

910Z/91/11 TELZ0000 91 YFFOLOO 00°0b1 9ISTITHOV SPT9-0Y0E0IVTITIVOSYd - ONDIVJ ANOD dOVI VOQMANY J0 JINVE da
soriddng so130 L¥L800A

9T0Z/91/1T TELY0000 91 YHFOLDO 8S°L 9ISTITHOV S1£9-2€5201 SAI'TddNS FO1410 VOMAWY J0 JINVE dd
sarddng 291130 [¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELY0000 91 YAFOLOO +L'SL 9ISTITHOV S1€9-T€5701 SAITddNS D140 VORMANWY 40 JINVE dd
Suurery, geis [¥L800A

910T/91/11 TELZ00O0O 91 ¥FIOLI0O 00°06€ 9ISIITHOV 0$29-7€S201 DAY ONINIVIL HOFL LINJAd OATd VORIANY 40 JNVd dd
Suturer], geis [vL800A

9T0T/91/11 TEL30000 91 YA9OLIO 00°SEE 9ISTITHOV 0579-T€ST0T DI ONINIVIL YOLDIISNI DAT1d VOTIdY 40 MNVE dd
sarjddng 20130 [4L800A

910Z/91/11 TELSO000 91 YAHOLOO 60'69- 9ISTITHOV S1€9-1£5201 LIa=LAd VOTJANY 40 NV dd
sarddng 20430 I¥L800A

33e(q Jou #3954 #0d #3910AU] jUNOWY a1 yoreq uondrIdsd(AUNoDY uondruiasaq AI/oWe) Iopud A adAy,

9107/8T/1T 104

J9)S159Y JUSWASINGSI(] HTUOIJIAT

enuade[d Jo A1)



AUWL: €0:S1:91
Aeq: 910T/8T/11

L d8eg

OTUOROSJT - ISV eI (dV :<[0'€> OOYIdV Moday
uosINUY ) IS}

910Z/91/1T ZELB0000 91 YFIOLOO 8£'S6T 9ISTIIHOV 10£9-0010S / [0€9-£+0£01 YALVM ‘SAVMS AV JATIVE VORIAAY 40 JINVE dd
sa1[ddng juounreds(] [e1oadg I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELZ0000 91 YALOLIO 6591 9ISTIIHOV 10£9-$800S / 10£9-€+0€01 SAI'TddNS ad VORIV A0 JINVE 44
sarjddng jusunreda(y feroedg [L800A

910Z/91/11 TEL0000 91 dAFOLIO 8L'+09 9ISTIIHOV 10£9-£70€01 SYHAATIHS T VOTIdNY 40 3NV da
Sumure1], ge1s IvL800A

910Z/91/L1 TELS0000 91 IALOLI0 00°0T- 9ISTITHOV 0529-£70€0T LIALID VOTIdIYV J0 JINVd dd
Suturer] afuey IvL800A

910Z/91/1T TELBO00O 91 YAFOLIO 0¢P SISTTIHOV T919-£40€01 S1IDYVL AONVI VOTIINY 40 JINVE dd
soriddng jusunreda( [eradg [7L800A

910Z/91/1T TELO00O 91 YAE0LI0 L8'L 9ISTITHOV 10£9-TH0€01 A¥ALLYE VOTIANY 40 JINVE dd
sorddng jusunreda(q [e10adg T¥L800A

910Z/9T/IT TELSOO0O 91 ¥ILOLI0 SI'9 9ISTITHOV 10£9-T+0£01 A¥ALLYVE VORANY A0 JINVd dq
sarrddng usunreda( jeroedg I¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TEL0000 91 YALOLOO 9’8 9ISTITHOV 10£9-TH0£01 SAMNMALLYE VOTIAINY J0 JINVd dd
sdrqsiaquia]y] 79 san(q T¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELSV000 91 YAFOLOO 00°0€ 9ISTITHOV $$T9-TH0E0T JdHSYHIWAN FAIDINOH VO VOTIdIV 40 JNVd a4
Surure1], geis 1vL800A

910Z/91/1T TEL80000 91 YHFOLO0 00°069 9ISIIIHOV 0S79-TK0E0T  VAIDN “SYATTIA - ONINIVIL dd VOTIdINY 10 JNVE dd
soriddng jusunyreds(q reroedg I¥L800A

910Z/9T/TT TELB0000 91 YA4OLOO 89151 SISTITHOV 10£9-0+00S / 10£9-T+0€01 SANIALLYE VOTIANY J0 JINVE dd
sorpddng jusunreda( [eradg I¥L800A

9TOZ/9T/1T TELB0000 91 YAFOLIO 6665 SISTITHOV 10£9-T+0€01 HOIAYAS 19VO ADN VOIIANY J0 JINVE dq
sorjddng jusunreda( [e1osds 1¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELSDO0O 91 YFLOLIOO ST°0F 9ISTIIHOV 10€9-170£01 SATY MAVd ALID ML VOTIHNY 40 JINVd ict
Sururely, jyeis [vL800A

9107/91/11 TELS000O 91 YA90II0 00'9LT 9ISTITHOV 0ST9-TY0€0T  TVOTV ‘ADTIE - DT ONINIVYL dd VOIdANY J0 ANV a
Surure1y, 1jeis I¥L800A

9T0Z/91/I1 ZELS0000 91 ¥HFGOLD0 00°5C1 9TISTITHOV 0579-1#0€01 JOTO - OFY ONINIVIL ad VORIV A0 JINVE da
Sururexy, yyels T¥L800A

e JoY #33d #0d #3210AU] JunowWy a1 yareg uonduassAuneddy uondurasa( AI/5UIBN I0pUs A adLy,

9107/8T/11 104

J9)SIS0Y JUIWASANGSI(] O

enuadeid Jo A1)



umL: ¢0:SI:91
Aeq: 910Z/8T/11

g :98egd

aruonoad - ISIT eI M 1dV <10°€> A00PIdV odsy
uosjnuy 18], :Ias()

9T0T/9T/1T TELB000O 91 4d90LD0 LO'VPE 9ISTITHOV LET9-PS9E0T SHI'TddNS AIVITI NHHOLIN Md VOIJHAV 40 JINVE dd
SaNIIoRAUTRIA 29 Treday] 1VL800A

910T/91/IT TEL80000 91 JH490LD0 00°0vE SISITTHOV 0€19-¥S9¢01 SLANIIVO NHHDOLTY Md VOIIANY 40 XINVE dd
saniRAuey 7 redoy [vL800A

9T0T/9T/IT TEL8O000 91 49d0LD0 $S9L1 SISITTHOV 0€T9-¥S9¢01 SAITddNS ATVdTI NHHOLIT Md VORMANY 40 3INVE dq
sanIoeJAuely 29 Jredoy [¥L800A

910Z/91/T1T TEL80000 91 YHdOLIO 91'€66 9ISTITHOV 0€19-+S9¢0T SIANIEVO NFHOL Md VOIddNY J0 JINVE dq
sanioejAue 29 redoy 1vL800A

910Z/91/11 TELBOO0O 91 ¥440LD0O 86'CL SISITIHOV 0ET9-$S9¢0T  STVIMHLVIN YIVJITI WAD SANAL VOIdAWY 40 JINVE dd
sonipoedAutey 29 Jreday [¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TEL80000 91 ¥9d0LD0 LTI9L SISTITHOV 0€19-7$9¢0T STVIIALVIN dIVddd ALTTIOVA VOV 40 JINVE dd
sanoeAutey %9 redoy I¥L800A

9T0T/91/11 TEL80000 91 ¥dd0LD0O 60°0LT SISTITHOV 0€19-+59¢01 STVIIILVIN dIVdTd ALI'TIOVA VOTJIINY 40 JINVE dd
sugis ang 172800A

910Z/91/1T TEL80000 91 d4dOLO0 $9°CC 9ISTITHOV 01€£9-259¢01 STVIIALVIN dOHS NDIS VORIANY 40 JINVE dq
sor[ddng yusunredo(y [eroedg T¥L800A

910Z/91/1T Z€L80000 91 ¥H9OLIO 0S°Lyl SISTITHOV 10€9-T6E6L / 10€9-TS9€01 dDVITIIH JOd STAMOL TO0D VORIANYV 40 JINVd dd
sorpddng juaunreda(q [eroedg T¥L800A

910T/91/11 TELBO0OOO 91 J9dOLD0 0I'el 9ISTIIHDV 10€9-759¢€01 ASVATII LTVHASV VOIIdNY 40 JINVE dd
sar[ddng jusunreda(q Jeroads T¥L300A

910Z/91/11 TELB0O0O0O 91 4490130 OL’LL S9ISITTHOV 10€9-269¢01 dVdM DILSVId VORI J0 JINVE dq
sotddng jusunreda(] ferads I¥L800A

910Z/9T/TIT TEL80000 91 YHOLIO $0'81 9ISTITHOV 10£9-T6L6L / 10€9-TS9E0T AVIdS LNV VOV 40 JINVE dd
SOOULISJUO)) 29 STUNOIN I+L800A

910T/91/11 TELS0000 91 ¥4d0LI0 00°CI 9ISTITHOV SPT9-055¢01 ZAAILSH - ONIIVd ANOD VOGNV d0 JINVE dd
Sururer ], yye1s [7L800A

910¢/91/1T TELB0O0OO 91 4dd0LD0 910ty 9IST1THOV 0S79-L¥0L01 VZEVO - THLOH ONINIVIL dd VOGNV 40 JINVE dq
suoyIuf) [¥L800A

9T0T/9T/TIT TELS0000 91 Y4dOLIO 97'89C 9ISTITHOV 09€9-9%0€0T  SIWIOAINN INHFWHAIHOINH HA0D VORIANY 40 JINVE dq
sarpddng jueunreds( [eadg IPL800A

e Y # 34 #0d HIJN0AU] JUNOUTY a1 9areq uondunsagunodny nondusa( QI/oWeN J0pud A adAjy,

9102/8C/1T 104

J3)SISY JUAWASINGSI(] STUCIPIY

enudadeld Jo A3



AUWILL: ¢0:S1:91
Aed: 9107/8T/11

6 8eg

oTOnoo[T - ISIT eI 1V <10°€> H00pIdY :Hodey

uosInUY 113], 138}

9107/91/11 TELSO000 91 YIFOLIO L6'ET 9ISIITHOV 10£9-v59€01 SAI'1ddNS ALITIOVA VOTYAAY 40 NV dd
sotrddng jusunredaq [ewadg I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELIDO0O 91 Y9OLOO 06'66 9ISIIIHOV 10£9-7S9£01 SNDIS WOOULSHY VORMANY 10 NV dd
sorfddng jusunreds( [ewads T¥L800A

910T/91/11 TELS0000 91 YIHOLOO L89 9ISIITHOV 10£9-v$9€01 SYANIHSHAA ATV VOIIANY 40 JNVd dd
sorddng juounreda(] feroadg [¥L800A

9T0Z/9T/1T TELI0O0O 91 4AFOLOO [S'LE 9ISTITHOV 10£9-7S9€01 SYANAHSTIL ATV VORIV 40 NV dd
sa1jddng jusunredaq reroadg TvL800A

9T0Z/91/11 TELZOO0O 91 ¥A90OLIO 0L'6¢€ 9ISTIIHOV 10£9-v59£01 SYANAHSTAA U1V VORGIWY J0 JINVE dd
sorjddng yusunreda( [eroadg [¥L800A

9107/91/I1 TELSOO0O 91 YHIOLIO 97°€€ 9ISTIIHOV [0£9-75S9€01 SATA VORIFAY J0 JINVE dd
sariddng jusunreda( [eroedg TYL300A

910Z/91/11 TELS0000 91 YHFOLOO 19°S€ 9ISTITHOV 10£9-¥S9£01 SYANAHSTIA dIV VOMANY J0 JINVE dd
sorpddng jusunreda(q [eroedg 1¥L800A

9107/91/11 TELSOO0O 91 YIIOLIO 1¥99 9ISTITHOV 10£9-vS9£01 SAI'TddNS VAT OLLVd VORIANY 40 NV dd
soriddng jusunreda( [eroadg I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TEL30000 91 YIIOLIO LY'LE 9ISIITHOV 10£9-¥S9€01 SAI'IddNS AIVJTd ALITIOVA VORIANY 4O JNVd dd
sorddng yusunreda( [eroadg I¥L800A

9T0T/91/IT TELI0O0O 91 Y490LD0 ZTII 9ISTITHOV 10£9-459£01 SAI'TddNS VAT OILVd VORIANY J0 JNVd dd
jswdinbgurely medoy I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELS00O0O 91 ¥AHOLIO LY'6LT 9ISTITHOV LET9-¥S9£0T SAITddNS WIVdTI NTFHOL Md VORIV 0 JINVE dq
yuswdmbyurepy sredoy I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELI0000 91 ¥49OLIO §S°0£T 9ISTITHOV LET9-¥S9E0T SLANIEVO NIHOLIY Md VOV J0 JINVE 44
owdmbyurey sreday 1¥L300A

910Z/91/11 TELSDO00 91 YHIOLIO ST96€ 9ISIIIHOV LET9-¥S9€01 SLANIAVO NIFHOLIM Md VORIAAY 40 3NV Bic
sudinbgurepy redoy T#L800A

910Z/91/1T TELIDO0O 91 ¥4IOLI0 99°1L1 SISTITHOV LET9-1S9E0L SAI'TddNS ATVITI NIHOLI Md VORIANY 40 JINVE da
wewdinbgurey reday 17L800A

910Z/91/11 TELS0000 91 ¥FdOLIO SPSET 9ISTITHOV LET9-¥S9£01 SAI'TddNS VAT NIFHOLIY Md VORIFIAY 40 NV dd
yswdibyurejy sredoy T¥L800A

Aeq JA #J3d #0d #IJM0AU] JUNOUWy a1 9ymeg uondLIdSI(AUN0IIY uondrsa( JI/PueN IOPUIA adAg,

9T07/8T/1T 104

J9)SI30Y JUSUIISINGSI(Y HUOIJIIY

enuade[d yo 1)



duwmll: €0:61:91
aeq: 9107/8¢/11

01 :28egq

MUONOIY - ISV UBIRA 1V ‘<[0'€> FOOY IV ‘Modsy
TosINUY 9] :IIs()

9107/91/11 TEL8OO0O 91 ¥340100 00°591 91STIIHOV SSTO-ILOVOT  ZdNONIAOY - JIHSYHTINAIN SIdO VIORIANY 40 JINVE dd
S20UBIAJUO)) 79 SSUNSIA [7L800A

910Z/91/1T TEL8000O 91 ¥4d0LD0 00'S0v 9ISTITHOV SHTI-1L0V0T ZANONAOoY - OTA ANOD SddD VOIMAY 40 JINVd dd
S90ULISJUO)) 79 STUNOIA I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TEL8OO0O 91 4440100 00°S0¥ 9ISTITHOV SPTO-1L0¥01 d1LAVAoy - O ANOD S9dD VOIJdV 40 JINVE dd
S90ULIRJUOY) 79 SSUNSAIA 1¥L800A

910¢/91/11T Z£LB0000 91 Y440LD0 00°S0¥ 9ISTIIHDV SHTO-T1LOVOT Z11¥0 - O ANOD S¥dD VOV 40 JINVd dd
S0ULIJUOD) 79 STUNIIA 1vL800A

910Z/91/1T Z€LB0000 91 d4d0LD0 00°S0Y 9ISTIIHDV SPTO-1L0V01 ONVIIINVZ - OFY ANOD S¥dD VORIFIAY 40 3INVE dd
SOOULIAUOY) 79 SSUNPIN I$L800A

910T/9T/1T T€L80000 91 JF9OLD0 00°5T 9ISTIIHDV SPT9-0L0¥01 AVNIGIM NOILVAIDTT VORHAV 40 JINVE dd
soueuduIe] 29 I1eday] 2[0TYIA I¥LSO0A

910Z/91/1T T€LB0000 91 ¥440LDO TT'99 OISTITHOV PE19-869¢01 SHIIL VORHAY 10 JINVd d3
soueuUIRI 79 Jedoy] S[oIYoA 14L800A

910Z/91/1T T£L80000 91 Y4440LD0 +9°11¢ SISTITHOV P£19-859¢€01 SHIIL VORIV 40 JINVd dq
duUBUNUIRIA 29 T1eday S[IIYaA 1¥L800A

910Z/91/TI1 2€L80000 91 YHIOLDO +6°05C 9ISTIIHDV PE19-859¢01 SUIVJTd A TOIHAA dd VORAWY 40 JINVd dd
soueusjurelA 29 Iedsy S[OIYIA I¥L800A

910T/9T/1T TE£L0000 91 YHdOLDO 00°5L9 9ISTIIHDV YE19-859€01 SDIHD DONS ST VORIANY 10 NV dd
SoUBUSIUTEA %9 Tedoy] S[OTYaA I7L800A

910Z/91/1T TEL80000 91 34010 v9'6Th 9ISTTIHDV 7E€19-859€01 STAILL VORIAY 40 JINVH dd
saryddng jusunredo(q feroadg [vL800A

910Z/91/11 TEL8O000 91 490120 81°701 9ISTIIHDV 10£9-$59¢0T SHI'TddNS Md VORIV JO JINVE dq
serpddng jusunreda(g [eroadg I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TEL80000 91 JHIOLDO 8T'IL 9ISTITHOV 10€9-¥59€01 SHITddNS ALTTIOVA VORIV 40 JINVE dq
serpddng yuourpeda( reroads 1vL800A

910T/91/11 TEL80000 91 490100 1TSII SISTITHOV 10£9-+59¢€0T SHITddNS AIVATI NFHDLI Md VOIMIAY 40 JINVd dq
soryddng yuounreds(y [eroads I¥L800A

910T/91/1T1 TEL80000 91 ¥3990100 +897L 9ISTITHOV 10€9-+59¢€01 JOLV IO ITT VORIV 10 JINVd dq
sariddng yusunreda(y [eroeds T¥L800A

aeq Joya #J3d #0d #3310AU] JUNOWY a1 yaeg uonduIssgAuNeddy uondusa(q I/5WeN 10pUdA adAy,

910Z/8Z/11 104

JI)SISY JUSWISINGSI(Y NUOIIIIY

enuade[d Jo A1)



Wil ¢0:61:91
ABd: 9107/8T/11

11 :e8eq

OUOROSYT - ISIT IUBLRA, dV <[0°€> H00PIdV 40doy

uosnuy L8], I3s)

910Z/9T/IT TELS0000 91 YAFOLOO 0801 9ISIITHOV 10€9-1L0+01 SAI'TddNS SAAV'd VORIAAY 40 JNVE a4
sa1iddng jusunreda( [eroads I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELZ0000 91 ¥440OIO0 LI°91 SISTITHOV 10£9-1L0%01 LNIVd AVHdS VOIIANY 40 JINVE A
so1iddng jusunreda( reroads I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TEL80000 91 YFE0ILO0 SL'661 9ISTITHOV 10£9-1L0¥01 SHOIAYAS ONINVATO VONIANY 40 JNVd da
serddng jusunreds( retoads 1¥L800A

9T0Z/9T/IT TEL0000 91 YAFO.LOO TETL 9ISTTTHOV 10€9-1L0+01 INIVd NAVT VORAAY 40 JINVE dd
sariddng uounreda(] [eroeds [¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TELZDOOO 91 YF40OLI0 00'8% 9ISIITHOV 10£9-1L0+01 SADIAMES ONINVATID VORAAY 40 3NV dd
sar[ddng jusunreda( reroedg 1¥L800A

910T/91/11 TELSOOOO 91 YHHOLO0O 6€£°S€E 9ISTIIHOV 10€9-1L0+0T ISV 3114 VORIFAY 40 JINVE 44
sar[ddng jusunreda( erads T¥L800A

9T0Z/91/1T TELSO000 91 YAFOLOO ¥6'9Z 9ISTITHOV 10€9-1L0+01 SAr1ddNs OTd VORIAWY 40 JNVd 44
sorddng jusunreds [eroads T¥L800A

9T0T/91/11 TELI0000 91 YH9OLO0 001 9ISTITHOV 10£9-1£0+01 SAI'TddNS OSIA VORIV 40 JINVE dd
satpddng jusunreda( [ereds I¥L300A

910Z/91/11 TELIO0OO 91 YHFOLOO 00~ 9ISTIIHOV 10€9-1L0VO1 LIATID VORIV 40 JINVE a
sariddng jusunreds( [erads I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 Z€L80000 91 YHE0LO0 9695 SISTITHOV 10€9-1L0+01 SAS YALVM YALNAD NILLIHM VORIANY 40 NV a4
sar[ddng jusunreda( [eroadg I¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TELY00OO 91 YHI0O.LIO 89°SL 9ISTITHOV T0£9-T6€6L / 10€9-1L0+01 SAI'TddNS 9OVIMAH VORIEAY 40 JINVE dd
sar[ddng jusunreda( reroads T¥L800A

9TOZ/91/1T TELYO000 91 YAGOLOO 0L 19¥ 9ISTITHOV 10€9-1L0+01 NV ONLLSIN VORIGAY 40 JINVE 44
sorjddng jusunreds( [eroadg I¥L800A

9TOT/9L/IT TELSO000 91 YFFOLO0 0L 19% 9ISTITHOV 10€9-1L0+01 NVd DNLLSIA VOQIANY 40 JNVE dq
SUOISIIXF [vL800A

9102/91/11 TELS0000 91 YFAOLOO 00498 9ISTITHOV 0LT9-1LOVOL SIAMOIL NOISUNOXA VORIV 40 JINVE d4
sdrystaquisjy 29 sen(q [¥L800A

9T0T/91/11 TELS0000 91 YAFOLOO 00°009 SISTITHOV $ST9-1LOYOT dIHSYHIWAN VAN 4IVLS 0TI VOTIANY 10 NV da
sdysioquis]y 2 senq I¥L800A

9e(q Jou #39d #0d #3210AU] jJUNOUNY 1 yareg uondLdsI(q/Iunoddy uondLIdsa(q @I/5WEN J0pud A adLy,

9107/8T/TT 104

I9)SI39Y JUAWISINGSI(] NTOLIN

eRuadELd Jo 31D



amy: €0:61:91
Av(: 9107/87/11

71 a8egq

JmondJ[ - ISV BB 1V <10°€> A00v1dV :Hodoy
uosinuy 1137, :I3S)

9T0T/91/1T TELSO000 91 YHLYOLIO LE'96 9ISTITHOV 10£9-T6€6L / 10€9-1L0VOL SAI'IddNS IOV IMIH VORIAAY 40 NV dd
soriddng jusunreds( [ersedg 1#L800A

910Z/91/11 TELYOOOD 91 YAHOLOO LLOE 9ISTITHOV 10£9-T6€6L / T0€9-1L0K0T  SADAVE YTALNNTOA IOVINAH VORANY A0 NV da
soriddng juounreda(q [eroadg [YL800A

9TOZ/9T/1T TE£L80000 91 YA9OLOO +E18S 9ISTIIHOV T0€9-T6€6L / 10£9-1L0F01 SAI'1ddNS HOV.IIIFH VOQMAAY 40 NV ad
sorddng jueunreds(T [eroedg [¥L800A

9T0T/91/1T TELS0000 91 YAIOLIO 6b'¥9€ SISTIIHOV 10£9-T6€6L / 10E£9-1LOVOT SAIIddNS IOVIMTH VOTIANY J0 SNV a4
sa1iddng yusunreda(] [erosdg T¥L800A

910T/91/11 TELSO0OO 91 YHIOLIO TT'SEL SISTITHOV T0£9-T6€6L / T0£9-1L0v01 SYANIV.ILNOD HOVIOLS AOVINAH VORIANY 40 3NV dd
sarfddng jusunseda( [eradg 17L800A

9107/91/1T TELS0000 91 YAIOLOO ST°ELT 9ISTIIHOV 10£9-T6€6L / TOE9-1L0v01 STVAN 4AVIS O OLN IDVITdaH VOIIHAY 40 NV dq
sor[ddng jusunredaq [eradg T¥L800A

910Z/9T/TT TELS000O 91 YHIOLOO ¥L'L01 9ISTITHOV T0€9-T6E6L / 10£9-1LOVOT HOV.IIIAH 404 SYALSIN VORIV 40 SNV 44
sar[ddng jueunreda(y [ewedg I¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELS0O00D 91 YHIOLOO 86'L01 91STIITHOV 10£9-T6£6L / 10£9-1L0VOT SYALSIN AJONVO AOV.LIMIH VORMANY 40 NV dq
S20IAISG 10enUO)) ‘1da(y 17L800A

9T0T/91/11 TELS0000 91 YAdOLIO 00°9¢€ 9ISIITHOV 0629-€LS18S TV MANTE ASNADIT JISAN VOTIANY 40 JINVE Fiic|
sarpddng jusunreda(q [eroads T4L800A

910T/91/11 TELSO0OO 91 ¥HIOLIO 00°S 9ISTITHOV T0£9-T6E6L / 10£9-1L0V0T DONISLLIFAQY J00dd0V4d D4 VORIAAY 40 JNVd da
2aPWWOY) LIOSIAPY I0[USS T¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELSO0OO 91 YHI0LIO +8T11 9ISTITHOV ¥90Z-v+00 SAITddNS YFLNAD ¥S VORIAAY 40 JINVE da
sorddng jusunreda(y [ewadg I¥L800A

91027/91/11 TELS0000 91 YH90OLO0 L09L 9ISTITHOV T0€9-9LE6L / 10E£9-TLOPOT SAIHJOYL 9Ad VORIANY 40 JINVE dq
sor[ddng jusunreday [eroadg [¥L800A

9107/91/11 TELY0000 91 YIIOLOO LS69 9ISTITHOV 10£9-8LT6L / 10£9-1L0VOT HOIAYAS YALVM YTLNTD ¥S VOTIANY 40 JINVE dq
seiddng jusunreda(y [eroads I¥L800A

9T0Z/91/1T TELZDOOD 91 ¥49OLO0O TH'8L 9ISTITHOV 10€9-8LT6L / 10£9-1L0VOL SAITddNS YALNAD ¥S VOQIAAY 40 NV dq
sorddng jueuneda( [eroeds T¥L300A

910Z/91/11 T£L30000 91 Y4dOLDO 0T 91 9ISTITHOV 10£9-120%01 SAI'TddNS SAA'V'd VORIANY 40 JINVE dd
sa1iddng jusunreds(q [eradg I¥L800A

e JoU #3d #0d #O010AU] jUNOUNY a1 yareq uondrs3(q/Aunoddy uondLidsaq @I/PuWeEN 10pua A AL,

9107/8T/11 10

J9)SI39Y JUSMWISINGSI(Y dTUOX)IdY

enuade[d Jo A1)



awmmy: €0:61:91
e 910T/8T/T1

¢l :a8eqg

oruonoA[g - ISIT WEIe M 1dV <[0°€> H00¥1dV :Hoeday
uosInuy U], 1I3sn)

910T/91/1T TELS0O00O 91 ¥IIOLI0 +£'601 SISTITHOV 10£9-565601  SAI'TAdNS ONILIIN OVE NMOId VORIANY J0 NV a4
sorjddng jyusunreda(y [ewadg I¥L800A

9107/91/11 TEL30000 91 YA9OLOO 08°9b 9ISTITHOV 10£9-565601 SAI'TddNS DNILIAN VORIANY J0 NV dd
ss1yddng jusunreds(g [eroadg [¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TELSO00O 91 YAI0LOO 89'S8 9ISTIIHOV 10£9-$65601 SAI'TddNS 01440 VOIIANY 10 JINVY da
sarddng so1330 1vL800A

9102/91/1T TELO00O 91 YHIOLIO 7659 9ISTIIIHOV STE9-LLOYOL SAI'IddNS AOIAI0 VORIANY J0 NV dd
sarpddng jusunreda(y [eroads TYL800A

910T/9T/11 TELS0000 91 ¥FIOLIO0 STILI SISTIIHOV 10£9-TLOVOT SAI'TdNS ONLLIIN VORMANY 10 NV a4
sarjddng jusunreda( [erpadg 1¥L800A

910T/91/IT TELYDOOO 91 YAGOLDO 08°LIIT 9ISTTTHOV T0€9-T6€6L / 10€9-1LOVOT TVINTI LIVO 410D 4DV.LIINTH VORIAWY 40 MNVE dd
sorddng jusunreda(y [ewadg I¥L300A

9T0Z/91/1T TEL0000 91 YIHOLDO ¥6'191 9ISTITHOV 10£9-Z6€6L / T0€9-1L0T0T SNOIS HOV.LTYIH VOMAWY J0 NV da
sarpddng jusunreda(y [eredg I7L800A

910Z/91/1T TELS000O 91 YAGOLOO £8'8TS 9ISTITHOV T0€9-T6€6L / L10E9-1LOVOL SADTTVL A TYM 9OVIIaH VORIdNY 40 JINVE a4
sarpddng jusunreds(g eroadg 1¥L800A

910Z/91/11 TELIOOOO 91 Y490OLOO 8808 9ISTITHOV T0£9-T6€6L / 10£9-TLOVOT SAI'IddNS IOVINAH VOQIAAY 0 NV dd
sariddng jusunreda(] [eroadg T¥L800A

9T0T/91/I1 TELYOO0O 91 Y4dOLOO 80°S8 9ISTIIHOV TO£9-T6£6L / T0£9-TLOVOT SAI'TddNS 9OV INFH VORMAY 10 JINVE aa
sarjddng jusunreda(g [eroadg I¥L800A

9T0Z/9T/IT ZTELI0000 91 YHF0LO0 00T 9ISTIIHOV 10€9-T6E6L / 10€9-1L0VOT SAI1ddNS IOVIIYAH VOIIAAY J0 JNVE dd
soriddng jusunreda(y [e1oadg I¥L800A

9TOT/9T/IT TELSD00O 91 YHIOLIO LSLEI 9ISTIIHOV T0£9-T6E6L / T0€9-1LOPOT SAITddNS 9OV.LIITH VORMANY 40 JINVE dd
sarpddng jusunredaq [ewadg T¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TELI0000 91 YHFOLIO 6£°86€ 9ISIITHOV 10£9-T6E6L / 10£9-1LOFOL STVAN YHALNNTOA 9DOV.LNIH VOIddAY 40 SNV a4
sarddng juounreda( feradg [¥L800A

9107/91/1T TELY000O 91 YHIOLIO 6919 9ISTITHOV T0£9-T6£6L / 10€9-1L0VOT SAI'TddNS FOVIIMAH VOQMAAY 40 JINVY dd
serddng jusunreda( [eradg [YLS00A

9T0Z/91/IT TELSO00O 91 YHHOLIO +T'€Tl SISTITHOV T0£9-Z6£6L / 10£9-1L0V0T SAI'IddNS AOV.LIYIH VOIMANY 10 JINVE dd
sarddng jueunreda(q [eradg I1+L800A

e A #3d # 0Od #3210AU] JUNOWY I yaeqg uondLsaAuUnoIIY uondLidsaQq dI/5wme)N 10pumap adAy,

91027/8T/11 104

J9)SI39Y] JUSUWASINGSI([ UOIIIIT

enuade[d Jo A1)



awiL: €0:ST1:91
Aaeq: 910¢/8T/11

p1 :98eg

oUOn2alT - ST eI 1V <[0°€> H00Y1dV a0doy

uosInuy 1121 :I13S[)

SUMIUIDIJ 20URINSU] [I[BSH £110004

910T/10/ZT ¥£L80000 9T YIIWHDAA STLTH'T SIIZIIHDV 1916-€8056¢  INFNASYNTNIFE TVIIATN 0dd NOOWVIN dIma1v dd

00°€7T ‘[BI0L YD)

SWMIWRIJ 20URINSU] YI[eSE] L100004

9102/10/TT £€L80000 91 dHgNFOdd 00°€CT 9LITITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNHNHSINGNITA TVIIAdN Ddd NINOVOf ‘VISOOV d4

ST°LOL'LE ‘(810 H23YD

SIOTAISS [EUOISSIJ01 I¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TEL80000 91 ¥4dOLD0 ¥5°L0L SISITTIHOV 6609-95¢c1 8y S4I'7ddNS 931440 VOMAY 40 JAINVd dd
SIOTAISG [BUOISSJOI] [¥L800A

910T/91/11 T€L80000 91 ¥3dOLD0 TL°LIT 9ISTITHOYVY 6609-9SE¥8Y SHI'TddNS IOI410 VORIAAY 40 JINVE dd
SIOTAISS UONIONIISUOL) I¥L800A

9T10Z/91/1T TE€L80000 91 490100 86'S81 S9ISTITHOV $819-LT119/ S819-TSSEEHAITAANS ATVITI NVIAIN NVINdVHD VORIV J0 MNVE dd
sayiejauRly % Iedsy IvL800A

910Z/9T/1T TLLI000O 91 J440OLD0 00°¢8¢ 9ISITTHOV 0£19-19696C MOTIOVE XA TdINOD 140dS VORHIAY 40 JINVd dd
satjddng jusunreda(y [eroadg 1¥L800A

910T/91/T1 TELB000O 91 4490120 00°STI 9ISITIHDV [0€9-565601 SHI'TddNS ONILIIN VORIV 40 JINVd dd
sarrddng jusunreda(q reroads I¥L300A

910Z/91/1T T£L80000 91 ¥4901D0 #1°08 9ISITIHOV 10£9-565601 SAI'TddNS DNILITN VOIJdIYV 40 JINVE dq
sarddng jusunreds(y [eroadg I¥L800A

910Z/91/1T TELS0000 91 94990120 LI'Z9 9ISTITHOV [0€9-565601 SdI'TddNS ONILFIN VORHY 40 JINVd dq
sa1jddng jusunseda(g reroadg I¥L800A

910T/9T/IT TEL8OOOO 91 44d0LD0 6691- 9ISTITHOV 10£9-565601 LIATad VOIAYV 40 JINVd dd
sorddng juounreds(g reoedg [¥LS00A

910Z/91/11 T£L80000 91 ¥39d0LD0 98¢ SISTITHOV 10£9-565601 SHI'TddNS ALITIOVA VOIMANY 40 JINVE dd
sariddng jueuneda( [eroadg [¥£800A

910Z/91/1T TELB0000 91 ¥4901D00 06°1C¢ S9ISTIIHDV 10€9-S65601  SHI'TddNS DNILFAN OV NMOId VOTJdIYV 40 2INVEH dd
sor[ddng juounreds(y [eroedg I7L800A

910Z/9T/11 TELSO000 91 4990100 86°C1 9ISITTHOV [0€9-S6S601  SHI'TddNS ONILFAN DVI NMOdd VOIJdINYV 40 JINVd dq
saiddng jusunreda( [eredg T¥L800A

ae( Joy #J39 #0d #9210AU] JUNOWY al yaeyq uondidsagaunoddy wondunsaq AI/PWEN 10pUa A adLy,

9107/8T/IT 104

J3)SI3aY JUAWISINGSI(] WO

ERUDR[{ Jo A1)



dWLL: €0:S1:91

OIUONOA[H - IS BB IV <10°€> 00V 1V Modoy

G :a8eg
aed: 910¢/8¢/11 wosinuy 9], XIS
9102/10/21 +¥.80000 91 YFgWEDEd 00'+0T°1 9IICITHOV I1916-€8056¢  INHNHSINTNITY TVIIAAA Ddd d NHOf Y TANVHO dd
00°TLS (101, 939D
SWINIWA1J SoUemsu] yiesyq L0000
9102/10/C1 £¥L.80000 91 dH9WdDdd 00°CLS 9TICITHOV [916-€8056¢  INHWHSIYNIWITA TVOIQIN Ddd ANHIAY WANDING dd
00°TLS ‘[EIOL HPYD
SUIMIUIdI{ 9oUeInsu] Y3esH] 7900003
910T/10/C1 L0000 91 dddNIDId 00°TLS STITIIHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNHNASYNGNITYE TVIIAdN 0dd aTVNOd “TTANNNE dd
00°€TT [BI0L }22YD)
SUMIWSI] SoUeInsu] 3[esH 0200004
9102/10/C1 1¥.80000 91 ¥9NdOdd 00°¢€TT 91ICITHDV 1916-€8056¢€  INHWNASININITYT TVIIAdN 0dd SINNAJ ‘SNVHOSANOH dd
(3 W44 T8I0 YD)
SUMIaI] dUeINSU] Y[eoH 210004
9102/10/21 0¥L80000 91 dHINHDHA €S 1¥Y 91IZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNHNISYNTGNITA TVIIAIA Dad A9V ‘Z3anNgad dq
00°€TT IBIOL MPYD)
SWNTWSI dUrensu] Y[eaq 9L00004d
9102/10/21 6£L80000 91 dHINFOHA 00°¢TT 9TIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INFINASINGNITYT TVIITAN 09d ANATIVHS ‘STvad dd
00°S6¢ ‘(€101 1RYD
Swmnitald 99ueInsu] [Ifesty $100004
9102/10/C1 8£L80000 91 dH9INIOHA 00°56C SIIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INHWNASINGNITYT TVIIAdA O3d V SHTIVHD 10004dvd dd
00°SLST ‘[BI0L 49D
suniuwsld souelnsu] yjesy $C10004
9102/10/TT LEL8000O 91 JFINTOIA 00°SLS‘T STITITHOV [916-€8056¢  INHWASINGNITYT TVOIAdA Ddd LLOJS AV ‘SSIANY dd
00°SLS'T [BIOL HIRYD
Sumniusid souemsu]y yijesy 9v00003
910T/10/2T 9£.80000 9T FINADIA 00°SLS‘T 9IIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INAWISYNIWITT TVOIATA Ddd 1 NHOfI ‘ONOYLSINIY dd
00°CLS ‘[BI0L ¥o9qD
Sumiuislg soueInsuy yesyy 1200003
9102/10/21T S£L80000 9T YHINEHDEA 00°TLS 9TIZITHOV 1916-€80S6¢  INHWHSINGWITI TVOIAIN Ddd VTIVIA ‘NOSYAANY dd
ST'LIV'T (8101 329D
e JIY #J9d #0d #3%10AU] juUROUIY al yareqg uondLsa(unody uondridsaq dI/oureN IOpud A adfy,
9T10T/8T/1T 104

J91SISY JUIWIISINGSI(Y NUOIIIIY

enuade|d Jo 1)



duWL: €0:51:91
Ae(: 910Z/8¢/11

91 :a3eg

OMIONO3[H - ISIT IURIR A JV :<[0°€> O0F1dV Miodoy
uosNwy L9y, A3s()

SUWMIWS1J 99URINSU] YI[eol] 2800004
910T/10/CT £5L80000 91 J4dINIDHA 00°CLS 9ITZITHOV 1916-€80S6¢  LNHWHSININITY TVIIAIN NV([ TOIVD ‘ANMOd dd
00°€TT ‘[BIOL {PRYD
SUINTWR1J 90URINSU] YI[edH 1100004
910Z/10/TT TSLY0000 91 ¥9gNIDdA 00°€TT 9TIZITHOV I916-€8056¢  INHWNASININITE TVIIAIN Ddd Of V1¥340Y9 ‘NOSIDId dd
00 PLIT ‘[BIOL YY)
SUMIWRIJ 9oURINSU] YI[BOH $+0000d
910T/10/CT 15L80000 91 dAGNIDFd 00'vLI‘T 9IICITHOV I916-€80S6¢  LNAWHSINENITA TVOIAIN Ddd AINV( ‘SOLNVS SOT13d dd
00°ZLS ‘(8301 HRYD
SUMIWIJ 9OURINSU] Y38 $000009
910Z/10/C1 0580000 91 44INIIdd 00°TLS 9TIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNIINASYNINITY TVOIAIA NV( NATOYVD ‘SIAVA dd
00°PLI‘T ‘TeIOL HPYD
SUWINIUSIJ QOUBINSU] YI[BIE] 110009
9102/10/C1 6¥L80000 91 YHENADAA 00'+LI‘T STIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNHWISUYNINITA TVOIAIN Odd NOISTd ‘AIAVA dd
00°€TT HLEAAR CLL
SUMIuIaLJ dUemsuy yi[esq 9500004
9T10T/10/TT 8¥L80000 91 4HIIINGOTA 00°€TT 9IITITHOV 1916-€80S6€  INHWHSINIWITA TVOIAdN Dad 199909 ‘OLVINV.a dd
00°TLS TBIOL HRYD
SUINIWRI 9oUeImsUu] Yi[es 8100009
910¢/10/C1 L¥L80000 9T dH9INIDEA 00°TLS S1ICITHDV 1915-€8056€  INHWASYNGNIFTA TVIIAIA Odd W ANATIV 00D dd
00°TLS ‘T8I0 HRY)
SUIMTWSIJ 20UBMSU] YI[ea}] L00000d
910¢/10/21 9¥L80000 91 YHINHOIA 00°TLS S9TITITHOV 1916-€8056€  INHWHSINGNIFGA TVIIAIW Odd ATIAI09D ‘119900 dd
00°#9S°T HaTA R BLl ie)
SUMIWal 9ouemsu] yjjesH L010003
9102/10/C1 S¥L30000 91 AFGNTOAA 004951 S1TZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INHWHSINGNITA TVIIAAA Ddd 19490y ‘ONVHO dd
00071 QLA R CLL e
sumiwold souemsuy yiesy 6010003
e Jo #J¥ #0d HOT0AU] JUNOWY ar geqg uondLdSI(J/AUn0ddVy uonduasag di1/omeN 10pumaA ad4y,
9107/8T/1T 104

I3)SISY JUAWASINGSI(F JTUOIPIINY

enuade|d Jo 1)



auwmy: €0:61:91

OTIONOA[ - ISIT eI A\ 1V <[0°€> AOOP[dV Hodoy

L1 :3Beg
Aaed: 910Z/8T/11 uosINUY 9], :I3s()
9107/10/C1 £9L.80000 9T YHAWHOHA 00°CLS 9TIIZITHOV [916-€80¢6¢  LNAWHSYNIWIFY TVIIAIA Odd THINVA “ZAN0D dq
00°€L8 JeI0L HI3Y)
Sumiusld sduemsu] yjesy 0800001
910Z/10/C1 T9L80000 91 YHINHDHA 00°€L8 STIZITHOV I916-€8056¢  INAWASANINITYT TVOIAIW 0dd ALLTY YANIVD dd
00°CLS ‘1€10L 939D
sumiiiald 2ouemsuy yijesaq L¥0000d
910T/10/C1 19L80000 9T JHINHOHA 00°CLS 9LIZITHOV 1915-€80S6¢  LNFHNASUNINITY TVIOIAaN 0dd NNV Of YANIVD dd
00°ZLS ‘€101 394D
SuMIuLIg oueInsuy Yiesy] 8000004
9102/10/C1 09.80000 91 J4IINHOHA 00°TLS 9TICITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INAWASYNINTTT TVIIAdN Ddd NIV INVTIVD dq
00°C1L ‘[B10L 29D
sumiwald IdUeIsuy yiesaH 1800009
9T0T/T0/CT 65L80000 9T JAIWHOHA 00°CIL STICITHOV [916-€80¢6¢  LNAWISYNINITT TVIIAIA D3d H NNATO ¥aTINA dq
00°TIL ‘[B30L YYD
Swmiurald oduemsuy yijeaq §L0000d
9102/10/CT 8SL80000 9T JIGNHOIA 00°CIL 9TIZITHOV I916-€8066¢  INIWIHSYNINITT TVIIAIA Ddd NAOIINS ‘AT dq
00°STS B0 NRY)
SumIusld soueInsuy yiesy 9100004
910Z/10/CT LSL80000 91 JHGNHOIA 00°52S STIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INAWASININIIT TVIIATA 03d VANI'TVSOY “VZONIdSH dd
00°TLS ‘€101 HIIYD)
sumiwsIq soueInsuy yi[eaq £$00004
910T/T0/CT 9SL80000 91 JHENFOFA 00°CLS 9TIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNAWASYNINITY TVIIAIW 09d NVITIIT ‘VS0d00sd dd
00°ZLS (B0 L HRYD
SUINIWaI{ 3dtreInsuy yi[esq L700004d
910T/10/2T $SL80000 91 JFINHOdA 00°CLS STIZITHOV I916-€8056¢  LNAWHSYNGNITT TVIIAIN D4d W NNV ‘0d41sT14 dd
00°ZLS ‘1eI0L HIYD
SUMISIJ 3dURINSU] YIIH 6200004
9107/10/C1 $SL80000 91 4FFNFOdd 00°CLS 9LIZITHOV I916-€8056¢  LNHWISYNINITT TVOIAIN NV NVIARON “‘AA0aNTNOH dq
00°CLS ‘[BI0L 33D
e A #Jd #0d #210AU] junowry ail yied uondLdsa(/Hunoddy uondusaq dI/PWeEN IOPUI A adAy,
9107/8T/11 104

JI}SIFOY JUIWASINGSI(] IUOIPIIY

enuaded yo A1)



WL €0:ST-91
ed: 910T/8Y/11

81 :a8eg

OMODOA - ISIT MBI A 1V *<[0°€> HO0Y1dV Modoy

uosinuy 19 X3S

SwmIwald 9oueINSuy Yyijesy 0110004
9102/10/2T TLL80000 91 YHdINHOHA 86°S61 91IZITHOV 1916-€80S6€  INHNASINGNITA TVOIQAN 0dd T @IVHITI ‘ANV TN dd
00951 18I0 97D
sumiuiald soueInsuy yesHy §110009
910Z/10/CT 1LL80000 91 YHINFDIAd 004951 SIITIIHOV 1915-€8056¢  LNHNASYNINITA TVIIAIN 0dd 1Tl ‘aant dd
86°S61 F[BIOL 329D
SWNIWL1J Souemsu] yiesHq £€50000d
910Z/10/ZT 0LLS0000 91 JHIINFOHA 86'S61 SIICITHOV [916-€80S56¢  LNINFSYNINITYT TVOIAdN 0dd L¥A90N ‘SHNOS dd
00°ZLS ‘[BI0L YD
stuniweld soueInsuy yiresy 6600004
9102/10/C1 6980000 9T JHGNFOEA 00°CLS 9ITCITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNAWHASINGNITA TVIIAIN 0dd NOYVHS ‘NOSNHOf dq
00°TIL ‘TeI0L 339D
sumiusld souemnsuy yiesy 800004
9102/10/C1 8980000 91 JIGNHOAA 00°CIL 91IZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INIWASINGWITA TVIIAIN 03 19A90d ‘SNIPINAS dd
00°TLS BL2AAR CLL 10
SUNIUSIJ SoUBINSU] YI[ESH 6100004
9107/10/T1 L9L80000 91 dH9NIOIA 00°CLS 9TIZITHDV 1916-€8056¢  LNHWHASINGNITY TVOIAAN 0dd HL1IAZNS ‘ANIAYGI dq
00°sTS ‘(B0 L HPYD)
sumruiald souemsu] yijesH 1210009
9102/10/CT 99L80000 91 dFdNEDIA 00°5TS 9TICITHOV 1916-€80S6€  ININASYNTNITY TVOITHIN Odd ANMIIHLVY ‘MVTOSLTOH dd
00°€7T [BI0L 294D
Sumitialg soueImsuy yiesHy 8.00002
9102/10/2T $9.80000 91 JFGNFOHA 00°€TT 9LIZITHOV [916-€80S6f  LNAWHSINGWITA TVIIAI Jdd W IONVHTA ‘HOOH dd
00°6¢S [BI0.L H221)D)
sumiwald oouemsuy yiesy 00004
910T/10/C1 +9.80000 91 dFINFOHA 00°6€S 9IIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNHWHSYNTNITA TVIIAAN O3d T SINNAJ ‘WATID dq
00°TLS ‘€10 L 239D
sumitiald soueInsuy yiesy 6100004
e A #3Pd #OO10AU] JUNOWTY a1 gareq uondLIdSa([AUNOIIY uondusaq (I/PUWEN I0PUd A adAy,
91027/8T/11 104

J3)SISY JUIWISINGSI( IMTOIPIIN Y

enuade[d Jo A1)



dWILL: €0:61:91

OMORIAIH - ISIT WRLE A dV *<[0°€> HO0FIdV Moday

61 :98eq
A'A: 9107/8C/11 uosInuUY 9] IS}
910¢/10/C1 T8L8000O 91 4ENIOIA 00 vLI‘T 9IIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNHNASINIGNITYA TVIIAIW DAd [ ANATIV ‘VAT0 dd
00°¢TT ‘(101 HPY)
SWINIWA1J 29URISU] [[BIE] #0000
910¢/10/C1 1880000 91 94dINTDdA 00°¢TT SIITITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNAWASINGNITT TVOIAAN 0dd M ANV ‘TI00N dd
00'+0T°T TBI0L MPAYD
Sunrursld souemsuy yifesy 9010004
910Z/10/C1 08L80000 91 YHANIDIA 00'+0T°T 9LIZITHOV 1915-€80S6¢€  LNAWNASYNIGNITY TVIIAIN DA @IVHOI aTIIN dd
00°TLS [BIOL MPYD)
SumMIwoIJ 20ouensuy yiesyq ¥$00009
910¢/10/C1 6LL80000 91 d99WHOdd 00°CLS STIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNHNASIANIGWNITA TVIIAIN Ddd SHINV( ‘ONVTIN dd
004951 [BI0L MI9Q)
sumiwolJ doueInsuy yifesy 8900004
910T/10/CT 8LL80000 91 AHGIWIDTA 004951 91IZITHOV [916-€80S6¢  LNAWHSININITY TVIIQIN Ddd 00Vd ‘OfATONIVIA dd
00°¢TT [E0L HRYD
suniuald douemsu] esty £900009
910T/10/CT LLL30O00O 91 ¥4dINIDHA 00°€TC 9IITITHOV 1916-£8056€  LNHINASANIWITT TVIIAIN Jdd W VAIA “ONINNVIN dq
00°TLS [BI0L o3
Sumitold SdueInsuy Yifesqy 2£000032
910T/10/TT 9LL80O00 91 dHENTDHA 00°CLS SIITITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INAWHSANGNITY TVIIAIN NVI TIVHIIN YT THMZLITVIA dd
00°S6T [BI0L YI97)
SUINIWIS1J SoueInsu] Yesf] 1+00003
9102/10/T1 SLLB0000 91 d9IINGOdd 00°56C 9IIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNIWASYNIWITY TVIITAN 0dd [9°ATIMOT d3
00°sTs ‘(810 MRYD
SUMIuR1d 2Juensu] yijeary T1000d
9102/10/CT ¥LL80000 91 J49dINd0dd 00°5TS 91IZITHOV 1916-£80S6¢  INAWHSINIWITT TVIIAAN 03d ANNDRIOD ‘SINOO'T dq
00°6€S [BI0L, 97D
SUuIIWL1q SdUeINSU] Yfeaf] 8600004
910¢/10/TT €LL8O00O 91 YIINIDEd 00°6£S 9IIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNAIWHSINIWITT TVIIAAW Ddd W ANVIA ‘GTLIIT dd
86°S61 18301 229D
e JoA # 1Y #0d #9210AU] JUNOWY a1 9areg uonduIdSI(I/IUN0IY uwondrsaq dI/PWeN I0pudA adAy
9107/8Z/TT 104

J9)ST33Y JUOWISINGSI(] ITTOI)IIY

enuade[d Jo 1)



auwmy: €0:61:91
Aed: 910Z/8¢/11

0C 9deg

oTONO3[ - ISIT WeIle M 1V <[0°e> H00PIdY Hodey
uosInuy UL :I3s()

SUMIUISIJ SOURINSU] YI[ESH] 200009
910Z/10/TT 16L80000 91 429WdaDdd 00°C1L 9TICITHOV 1916-£8056¢  LNIWASINGNITA TVIIAIW DAd ¥ AT ¥aJ1a9d dd
00°€TT ‘[eI0L MRYD
SWNIWSIJ 9OUBINSU] Y[eSL] 0100004
9102/10/C1 06L80000 91 dHINIDIA 00°¢TT SLIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  ININASINTWITT TVOIAdW J2dd W ANNINAF ‘GONOJ d3
8T'LLL S[EI0L Iy
SWNIWeIJ 90uemsu] YI[esg] LT10009
9102/10/TT 68L80000 91 dH9INIDAd 8T'LLL STITIIHOV [915-£8056€  LNIWHSYNINITA TVOIAIW Odd OdLVIN ‘VAdaNId dd
$0°€8T ‘[B10L PRYD
SWMIWRIJ 9oURINSU] YI[BRE] £010004
9102/10/CT 88.80000 91 dHINIOAA +0°€8T 91IZITHDV 1916-£8056¢  INHNASINIINITA TVIIAIW Ddd YALTVYM ‘NOHOId dd
86°S61 QLA R CLL e
SWINWIdIJ 9OURINSU] YI[eoH 1110009
910Z/10/CT L8L8000O 91 YHINTDEd 86°S61 OTIZITHDV [916-€8056¢  LNAWASHYNINITA TVIIAAA Oda 1949909 ‘Za49dd dd
96'91S ‘BI0L }29qD
Swniwaig oueImsuy yifesr] 5800004
9107/10/T1 98.L80000 o1 YHAWHIDId 96'91¢ 9TIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNIWASINTNITY TVOIAIN 0dd OUVHIN “TTVdSVd dd
00'v95°‘T [€10L 399D
SWINIWAIJ S0URINSU] YI[es}] v110004
910¢/10/T1 $8L80000 91 dHENFOEA 00'v95°T SIICIIHDV 1916-€8056€  LNIWASINTNITY TVOIAIA Odd QTVNAVY ‘VNOSVd dd
00°096 QLA R CLL e
suniwald SoUemsu] Y3[edf] 600004
9107/10/21 +8.80000 91 449dNIDdd 00°096 STICITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNAWISYNIWITT TVIIAIW Jdd ADYOTD YANTVI dd
00°L69 ‘T8I0 L PRYD
SUMIWAIJ 9oULINSU] YI[eoL] 0010003
9107/10/CT £8L80000 91 4HENTDIA 00°L69 OIIZIITHOV [916-€8056¢  LNAWISYNTNITA TVIIddN Ddd 3 TANNVIN ‘VOILIO dd
00 FLIT [BI0L HRYD
SUuInItld aouemsuy yjjesy 100004
e Joy #JU #0d #3210AU] JUNOWY a1 9areq uoydus3q/unoddy mondrsaq dI/PmeN Iopuap adAy,
910T/8T/TT 104

J2)SISY JUIUIISINGSI(Y JUOIJIA Y

enuade[] Jo A1)



dWL: £0:61:91

OTUODOS[H - 1SIT JURIR M dV 1<[0°€> HOOYTdV :Modey

1Z :98ed
aRed: 9102/8¢/11 UOSINUY L], :I3s[)
910¢/10/C1 10880000 91 HINHOIA 00°0T6 S91IZITHOV 1916-¢8056¢  LNIWHSININIFYT TVOIAIW DA d @IVHOMI ‘4SO dd
00°STS (8301 ¥YD
SWNIWAI doueInsu] yieey $£00004
910¢/10/C1 00880000 91 YHINGDAd 00°STS S9TITITHOV [916-€8056¢  LNINASYNINITA TVIIQIW Odd V NI “ZSOM0Y dd
8€'IPT T8I0 L 23y
SUMIWS1J 92UBINSU] YIesy £60000d
910T/10/C1 66L80000 91 YHINHOIA 3£'I¥T 9TIZIIHOV [916-€8056¢  LNHWASINIWITA TVIOIAI Odd S SHNVT ‘NOSLIdd0d dd
00°TLS ‘[EI0L HIYD
SWMIWS1J SoURINSU] YIeoH £+00004
910¢/10/CT 86L80000 91 YHINIDHd 00°TLS 9TIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNHNASININITA TVIIAAN 0dd VIANVS ‘d90d dd
00+0T'1 [€30L, HI3Y)
SUMIURS1J oUBINSU] YI[ear] $010009
910T/10/CT L6L80000 91 qAGNGOEd 00°+0T°T STIZITHOV 1916-€8056€  LNHNASININITA TVIIAIW DA TAVHOIN ‘HOVOd dd
00°€TT ‘[BI0L HRYD
sumiwsld souelnsuy @esH 9200004
910¢/10/CT 96L80000 91 d99INIOId 00°¢TT 9TIZITHOV [916-€8056€  LNIWNASYNGNITA TVIIAAIN 0dd VAV ‘VIIATY dd
00°CLS 18101 32D
sumiweif souemsuy yjjesy £100003
9102/10/C1 $6.80000 91 JHINTDdd 00°TLS 9IITITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNAWHSINTNITA TVOIAQAN DAA V SVINOHL “4aHS dd
00°PLT'Y ‘18101 3D
stniwald souemsuy [aesH 6500004
910T/T0/C1 ¥6.80000 91 IHAWNFOTd 00 LI T 91IZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNINASINEGNITY TVIIAAW D3A £ TTdSSNd ‘4ord dd
00°TLS ‘[BI0L 227D
sumiweal1q ssuemsuy presH 200004
910T/10/CT £6L.80000 91 dHHNADHd 00°CLS 9IITIIHOV 1916-¢80S6¢  LNHWNASYNEWITY TVIIAIN D3A 1949909 ‘SdAdad dq
90°800°1 QL AARCLL e
SUmMILId soueInsu] yijesH €80000d
9102/10/21 T6L80000 91 JIINFOIA 90°800°T 9TICZITHOV 1915-€8056€  INIWNASINGWITI TVIOIAIW Ddd NVDIE ‘NIaNTd dd
00°TIL ‘(810 23D
e Jod #3d #0d #9J10AU] JUROWY a1 yoreg uondLidsagAunody uvonpduiasa(y I/oWeN JI0PUdIA adLy,
9107/8T/TT 104

J9)SISoY UAWASINGSI(] MAOI)IIHY

enuadse|d Jo A1)



awiy: ¢0:61:91
Aedq: 9107/8¢/11

7T 98eg

OIONOAYT - ISIT JTRIR A\ :dV :<10°€> A00PIdV Hodoy

uosInuy ey, :I3s()

sumitIald 3ouemsu] yjesHy 6110004
9102/10/Z1 01880000 91 JFIWHDAA £1'8tH'1 9IIZITHOV [916-£8056¢  LNAWHSYNGNITA TVIIAIW Dad ATIAIA( ‘NIHIALS dd
00°SLS‘T HEI0L YD
SWMIWS1J S0URINSU] YI[esf{ 900004
910¢/10/CT 60880000 91 YFLNHOIA 00°SLS T 9IIZITHOV 1916-€8056€  INANASINGNITI TVOIAHN DA V AIVO ANOvads dq
00°TLS ‘IBI0L 3D
swniweld duensu] Yifesry 2500004
9107/10/CT 80880000 91 dHINHDOIA 00°CLS 9IICITHOV 1916-£8056¢  LNIWASINGNIFY TVIIAIW Ddd [ dI'TIHd ‘010S dd
00°7IL (B0 L IPYD
stwniural soueInsu] YiesH 6800000
910¢/10/C1 L0880000 91 YHINTO4d 00°CIL 9TICITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNANASYNGNIFA TVIIAIW Ddd d NHOI ‘VAOWOS dq
00'v9s°T [eI0L HI2YD
sumiwsid soueInsuy YiesHy 8710004
9102/10/CT 90880000 91 dIGNFOEA 00°%95°1 91ICITHOV [916-€8056¢  LNHNASYNGNITA TVOIQIN D3d @IVM ‘HIINS dd
SLIEP'T [EI0L YD)
Sumituald adueInsuy yijesy 0210004
9107/10/CT 0880000 91 YAGNEDIA SLIEYT 9LITITHOV 1915-€80S6¢  INIWASANIGNITT TVIOIATN OHA ATIIATE YAAFITHOS dd
00°€7C ‘(8301 P3YD
SUmMIwa{ souremsuy yiesH 8700004
910¢/10/C1 $0880000 91 JFINTIDIA 00°€TT STIZITHDV 1916-€8056¢  LNIWNASINTNITY TVIIAIN Ddd D VI0Z ‘VSINIODNVS dd
00°€TT ‘[BIOL }IRGD
sumiusld sduemsu] yijes 8500004
9107/10/C1 £0880000 91 dH9INI0dd 00°€TT SIICIIHDV 1916-£8056¢  INFWASIANIGNTITA TVIIAIW DAd VANV ‘ZHHONVS dq
00°TLS ‘18301 YD)
Sumiwsld sJuensuy jesHy 1£00004
9107/10/CT 20880000 91 YHIWADHA 00°TLS STIZITHOV I916-€8056¢  LNINASINTNITT TVOIAIN D3A A ddTATIVS dd
00°0¢6 [BIOL MIID
SuniuRif sduemsu] yiesH 0500004
e JP2ya #19 #3210AT] JUNOUWTY al yaeg uondiLsaqaunoddy uondusagy dI/2WEN 10pud A adLy,
910T/8T/TT 104

19)SIS9Y JUSUIISINGSI([ UL

enuadEld Jo A1)



amlL: €0-¢1-91

TN - ISIT JUeLIeM 1V :<10°E> HOOF1dY Moday

€7 98eg
Avq: 9107/8¢/11 uosINTY [13], :I3S(}
9102/10/TT 02880000 91 YHIWFOAA 00+0T°T 9TICITHOV [916-€8056¢  INAWHSANGNITYT TVIIAAN Ddd NVTId THONOVIAVX d3
90°800°T 18301 HI9YD)
swniusld sdouemsuy yijeay 9110004
910T/10/Z1 61880000 91 FINTOAA 90°800°T 9IITITHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNIWNASININITA TVIIAIN Ddd W ANIVT ‘NATIOM dd
00°TLS [€10L H3¥YD
SWNIWAIJ 20URINSU] YI[BSL] 6.00003
9102/10/C1 81880000 91 dHNHDAA 00°TLS 91ICZITHOV 1916-€8056€  LNAWHSIYNINITA TVIOIQdA DA NAHJALS ‘LSAIM dd
00°€TT ‘[BI0L H9YD
sumiualg sdueInsuy yijesy 0€00004
9102/10/C1T L1880000 91 YHINIDAA 00°€TT STICITHOV [916-€8056¢€  LNHWHSINGNITY TVOIAIN Odd V NHATHLV “THVM dq
86°S61 18101, 299D
sumruiald soueInsuy [3[esH 2600009
9102/10/C1 91880000 91 dHdINTDdd 86'S61 9TICITHOV [916-€8056€  LNAWISANIWITT TVOIAIA Odd INVITTIM ‘NANALSYIA dq
00'+0T°1 ‘[B10L }I3YD
sumniueld sduemsu] Yiesq 8110003
9107/10/CT S1880000 91 JHGWNTOAA 00°+0T°1 ITIZITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INIWISINGNITA TVOIAdW Ddd SVINOHLL ‘ANILNATVA dd
00°LOV'T [BI0L H29Y)
SNl SoUeInsu] YiresHy 010004
910¢/10/C1 1880000 91 YAGINHOAA 00°L0% T STIZITHOV [916-€8056¢  INAWHSYNINITY TVOIAIN Ddd WVITIIM ‘SOANIL dd
9L°L09 ‘[8I0L, YD
SUMIWSIJ 9oURINSU] YI[eo] 1010003
910T/10/CT £1880000 91 99T Odd 9L°L09 STITITHOV [915-£8056¢€  LNAWASINTNITY TVOIAIN O3d TTIAYVA ‘NNVWNOHL dd
SLELY *[BI0L, H9qD
sumrald soueInsuy yijesy 9210003
9107/10/CT 71880000 9T JH4dINAOIA SL¢LY STICITHOV 1916-€8056¢  INAWHSINGNITA TVIIAIN Ddd VANIT “YOTAVL dd
00°6€S ‘(€101 /YD
Sumrurald SdueImsuy yjesy 8800003
9102/10/C1 11880000 91 YFINHOAA 00°6£S SLITIIHOV 1916-€8056¢  LNAWASINTGNITY TVIIAQIN Ddd W AIAVA YOTAVL dd
€I'8hHT [BI0L HI9YD)
eq Py #3194 #3J10AU] junowry al yneqg uondusaqunodxdy uonduiasa(q I/5WeN I0pusp adA L,
910¢/8T/T1 104

J19)S183Y JUSWIASINGSI(] MUOIPII

enuadeld Jo A1)



duwiy: €0:S1:91

OTUONO3[F - ISIT MBI M (dV <[0'€> A00F 1AV Modoy

v a8eg
ed: 910¢/87/11 UOSINUY U], :A3S()
H/M SYAd 924o[duy £50010A
910Z/1Z/TT 2380000 O91PIIT STLEY 91ZZITHOV ov12-6200 11/11 dd $/11 3/d S¥dd oI19Nd VINJOAITVD dd
uuojun) SYAd €S0010A
910Z/1Z/11 $T880000 O91PI11 289T 91ZZITHOV S612-0100 I1/11 dd $/11 3/d S¥dd oI'1dNd VINJOAI'TVO dd
s[qeied Jokojdwy SYHJ £S0010A
910T/TT/TT +7880000 O91HITT 92702 91ZZITHOV $912-0100 11/11 Ad $/11 T/d S9ad or1dnd VINJOAITvO dq
a3exoed 1JOUSY JOAIAING £S0010A
910T/1Z/11 2880000 O9IPIIT ¥9°911 91ZZITHOV 0S12-0100 11/11 dd $/11 3/d S¥ad 2I'190d VINYOAITVD dd
H/M orqAed SYAd d24ojduy £500T0A
910T/1T/TT +$7380000 O9IHITT 18°8P1 91TZITHOV SY1Z-0100 I1/11dd $/11 F/d S¥dd or1dnd VINJOAITVD dd
9L OTT'T (10, 39D
VSS 2red ypesy 1T00TOA
910Z/1Z/11 £T880000 d9TvIIT 80'T 91ZZITHOV 881T-8¥00 11/11 ad $/11 &/d X314/ I0A ALI'THAI NVOIIINY dd
VSS 9IeD yiesy 1T00T10A
9107/1Z/11 £7880000 d9TVIIL 969 91ZCZITHOV 8812-L£00 TI/1T ad $/11 9/d XA T/ TOA ALI'TAAlE NVOTIINY dad
9J1] Ue[d AIEIUN[OA 1100T0A
9107/1Z/11 £T380000 d9IPIIT 96'€9% 91ZZITHOV L81T-000S6€ I1/11 dd $/11 9/d XA T/ TOA ALITAAT NVOTIINY 44
VSS 918D yiresy [100T0A
910Z/IZ/11 £T830000 d9IPTIIT 98°569 91ZZITHOV 8812-0100 11/11 Ad $/T1 A/d XTTL/TOA ALITAAQI NVOTIHNY 44
9Jr1 3dQ - weld 99§ Iad [10010A
9T10Z/1T/I1 €7380000 d9TVIIL 06Ch 91ZCI[HOV $S1Z-0100 11/11 dd $/11 9/d XTI/ TOA ALI'TAAII NVONTIAY dq
99°796 [eIOL HIRYD
sumiuweal1d adueInsu] Yiesy 6000003
910Z/10/TT TTY80000 91 YHIWNFOIA 99796 91IZITHOV 1915-€80S6¢  INFWNASININIAY TVIITIN Ddd NHOf ‘NNIZ dq
00°ZIL :[eI0L H22YD
sumiwol1g 35ueInsu] Yiesy L£0000H
91027/10/1 17880000 9T YHWHOId 00°ZTIL 911ZI[HOV 1916-€8056¢  LNANASYNTNITA TVIIATN Ddd AMIAL “VIONVZ dq
00°+0Z°1 :[e10 ], H20YD
swnjwold 35UeInsu] Yiesy £210009
e J3A #3124 #0d #3310AU] JUNOWy a1 yaeq uondLIdSa@AUN0I Y uondudsa( IPwWeN J0pusp adAy,
9T07/8T/T1 104

JO)SISY JUIWISINGSI(] JIUOIPIAY

enuade[d Jo A1)



duWlL: ¢0:ST1-91

Juonos[y - ISITuelre M, (dv <10°¢> 00V 1dV

poday

¢z :adeg
Aeq: 9107/3T/11 uosIUY HAY :I3s[)
910Z/12/11 ST830000 O9IVIIT 9L0L 91CZITHOV SE1T-6200 [1/11Ad §/T1T 9/d XVL ALV.LS INAWAOTING 44
H/M Xe], swoou] JI[e) ZS00I0A
910Z/T1Z/1T $T880000 O9THITT 818091 91ZZITHOV SE1T-0100 T/IT1Ad $/1T A/d XVL ALVILS INAWNAOTdNA da
€TESH69 EIOL YD
uuoyun SYAd £S00T0A
9107/12/11 +T830000 O9IVIIT 1H'1 91ZZITHOV S61T-8%00 1/11 dd $/11 %/d S¥ad OI'1dNd VINIOAITVO dd
s[qeAeq 1akoidug SYdd £S00T0A
910Z/12/11 $TI30000 O9IHITT LTS 9IZIITHOV S91Z-8400 T1/11Ad $/11 d4/d S¥9dd O17dNd VINJOAITVD da
egexoed Jyouag IOAIAING £500T0A
910Z/1Z/11 ¥T880000 O9IPIIT LSE 91ZTIIHOV 0S12-8+00 [L/11Qad §/11 9/d S¥dd 2174Nd VINIOAI'TVO da
H/M Yorqied SYAd sLojduy £S00T0A
910Z/12/11 +Z880000 O9IVIIT 0L 91ZZITHOV SH1Z-8400 11/11 ad $/11 2/d S¥dd oI'1dNd VINIOAITVD da
H/M S¥Ad sekojdurg £S0010A
910Z/1T/1T 7880000 O9IHITT L 99ST 91CZITHOV 0v1Z-8+00 T1/11 ad §/11 9/d S¥dd or1dNd VINIOAI'TVD dq
s[qeded 1ehoidwy Sy £S0010A
910T/1Z/1T 880000 O9IVIIT 1471 91ZZITHOV S91Z-LE00 /11 dd §/11 2/d S¥ad oI'TdNd VINIOAI'TVO dd
a8eyoed 1JaUSy IOAIAING £500T0A
910T/1Z/11 +T880000 O91VIIT 8T0 91ZZITHOV 0S12-L£00 T1/11 Ad /11 9/d S9dd orrdnd VINJIOAI'TVO d4
H/M S¥Hd s24ojdwy £500T0A
910Z/17/11 2830000 09111l TH61E 91ZZITHOV Or12-,£00 I11/11 ad §/11 2/d S¥ad O1'19Nd VINIOAITVD da
uoyun) YA £S00T0A
910Z/1¢/11 7830000 O9IVILT TH0 91ZZITHOV S612-6200 11/11ad $/11 A/d S94d oI'1dNd VINIOAI'TVD dd
adeyoe( Jyouag I0AIAING £S0010A
910Z/12/11 +T880000 O9THIIT 60°1 91CZITHOV 0S12-6700 11/11ad §/11 4/d S¥9dd oI'1dNd VINJOAITVD dd
SYAd JuswaIney £S0010A
9102/12/11 $7880000 O9IHILT vET9E' 1L~ 9IZZITHOV SYIS-£8056¢€ I1/11 Ad §/11 A/d S¥dd oI'1dNd VINIOAI'TVD a3
H/M oeqhed SYdd saKodwy £S00T0A
9102/17/11 ¥Z830000 O9IVIIL 0L 9TZZITHOV SY1Z-6200 11/11 ad $/11 9/d S¥dd or1dnd VINIOAI'TVD dd
H/M S¥Ad sekodwy £500T0A
9102/17/11 880000 O9IFIIT S8°LL6GET  9ITTITHOV 0Ov12-0100 T/1T Ad $/1T A/d S¥dd or1dnd VINJIOAIIVD 44
e JPA #J2d #0d HOOI0AU] JUNOWY a1 yaieqg uondLRsI(AUN0IIY uonduidsag I/oWeN I0pus A adiy,
9107/8T/11 104

J9)SI33Y JUSUIISINGSI(] MUCLIIHY

enudELJ Jo A1)



dwry: €0:61:91

JMUONI3[ - ISIT MBI M :dV :<[0°¢> 00V 1AV

spoday

97 :98egq
A.(: 9107/8T/T1 uosINUY 19] :I3S()
s[qeAeq ares1psjA 1okojdwy #S0010A
910Z/1T/TT 97880000 NOISTIIT 20°0C 9ITTITHOV 0TIT-L€00 LI/1T dd $/11 d/d SS/AaN/add JNNFIATT TVNIILNI dd
H/M 21e1palq 99Kojdurg ¥S0010A
910T/1T/1T 97880000 NOISITT 20°0C 9ITTITHOV STTT-LE00 I1/11 dd $/11 /d SS/AIN/AdA HANTATY TVNIILNI dq
H/M XeJ auoou] [eI1opsq YSO00T0A
910¢/1T/1T 92880000 NOISIIT Lé6V1 9ITZITHOV 0L12T-L£00 L/1T dd $/11 3/d SS/AINW/AdA HNANTATT TVNITLNI dqd
a]qede{ SIedIpay IaAojdury ¥S00T0A
910T/TT/1T 97880000 NOISTIL LT6¢E 91TCITHOV 0C12-6200 IT/1T ad $/11 3/d SS/AIN/Ad4 dANTATT TVNIALNI d4
s[qeAed 2I1edIpaA 1okojdwy ¥S00T0A
910T/1T/1T 97880000 NOISITT $8'8%1 9ITTITHOV 0T1¢-8100 LT/TT dd $/11 d/d SS/AIN/AAA JANIATE TYNIALNI dd
H/M S1891pajy daKojduuyg ¥S00T0A
910Z/TZ/TT 97880000 NOISTIT LT6¢E 91TTITHOV STIT-6700 LT/1T dd $/11 3/d SS/AIN/Add JNNTATT TVNIALNI dq
H/M Xe], woou] [219pa,] ¥S00T0A
910Z/1Z/11 9C880000 NOISTIIT $6°€0T°6¥ 9ITCITHOV 0112-0100 L/IT ad S/1T d/d SS/adW/add HANIATS TYNIALNI dd
H/M Xe], swodu] [2Iopa] ¥S0010A
9T0T/IT/IT 97880000 NOISIIT SP'09C 9ITCITHOV 0112-6200 I11/11 ad $/11 3/d SS/AaN/Ad4 JANFATE TVNIHLNI da
s|qeded 93§ 00§ 10ko[dury ¥S0010A
910¢/1T/TT 97880000 NOISTIT £€°L01 9ITTITHOV 0€12-0100 11/11 dd §/11 I/d SS/AaN/Add HANIATT TYNIFLNI da
H/M 298 [e100§ 9akordwg ¥SO00T0A
910T/1T/11T 97880000 NOTISTIT €£°L01 OITZITHOV SCIT-0100 LI/1T Ad $/11 3/d SS/AIA/AA4 HANTATT TYNIHLNI dd
o[qeied areotpajy 1akodurg ¥S00T0A
910Z/1T/1T 97830000 NOISIIT 90°609°S SITTITHOV 0Z12-0100 LI/1T1 dd $/11 d/d SS/AAN/d94 ANTATS TYNIALNI dq
H/M 21e01paA] sakodury ¥S00TOA
910T/1T/TT 97880000 NOISTIT 0L7199°S S9IZZITHOV SIIT-0100 LT/11 ad $/11 3/d SS/AN/ddd JANTATT TVNATLNI dq
0T°L8P9T TEI0 L 2D
H/M Xe], swodu] Ji[ed ¢S0010A
910T/1T/TT $T880000 O91IPIIT ve'Ly 9ITCITHOV SEI1T-LE00 /1T Ad /11 3/d XVLALVLS INANAOTINA dd
H/M Xe], Swoduf Jijed TSO0010A
910T/1¢/1T $T880000 O91IPIIT T6'+8C 9ITZITHOV SE1T-8700 11/11dd §/11 9/d XVL d1VI1S INGWAOTINA dd
H/M Xe], swoouf Jijen CS00T0A
aeq A #Jd #0d #9910AU] JUNOWY i yaregq uondLuds3qaunoddy uonduasaq dJ/omeN 10pud A adAy
9102/8T/T1 104

2915139y JUAWASINGSI(Y NTOIYIIY

enuadElJ Jo A1)



dwmiLy: ¢0:¢1-91
ABA: 910T/8T/T1

LT 98egq

OMIORIS[H - ISUT JELR M :dV <[0°€> AOOYIdV :Hodoy
uosjnuy UeJ, :I3sn

PP 09£°9LT ‘(€101 YD
PP 09€°9LT ‘[eso 2dAY,
08°060°TT ‘18101 YD)
VIANDI - d[qeAed dwo) parojsq 961000A
9102/8¢/1T LT880000 YZ01091/566C 0S°L YTO9TAd 0L1T-LEOO OI/STYTT ALvA Ad 91/61/11 d/d  LSNYL LNHWHILLTT VINDI dd
VINOI - 9qeAed duo)) pausja( 961000A
910¢/8T/11 LT8S0000 YZ01091/566C £5°66C YC091Ad 0L1¢C-8100 OI/STY/IT H1vA dd 91/61/11 3/d LSNUL INFWTILLTY VINDI dq
VINDI - 91qe4ed dwo)) pauja 961000A
910¢/8¢/TT LT880000 P201091/566T 05706 V2091 Ad 0LT12-6200 OI/STY/TT ALVA Ad 91/6 /11T T/d  LSOEL LNINTILLTT VIADI dd
VINOI - 91qedeq dwo) pausgeq 96+000A
9107/8¢/11 LT880000 ¥Z01091/S66C LT €69°T1 Y2091 Ad 0L12-0100 II/STYTTHLVA Ad 91/61/11 I/d  LSOYL INHWNHILLTI VINDI dd
¥0°LTIS‘T9 ‘el0L 94D
H/M 21ed1paJA 92Ao1dmyg ¥S00T0A
910T/TT/IT 97880000 NOISTIT S8°8%1 9IZCITHOV SI1Z-8%00 I1/11 dd $/11 d/d SS/AaN/add HONTATT TYNYHLNI dd
H/m Xe], awoou] [e13pa] YSO0TOA
910T/1T/IT 97880000 NOISIIT L6010°T 9IZCITHOV 0112-8+00 IT/11 dd S/11 4/d SS/AIN/ad4 HANTAHYT TVNIALINI dd
e oy #3904 #0d #9010AU] jJUNOWY 1 yareq uondLIdS3([/)unoddy uoydrLidsaq dI/PWeN I0pus A adf],
910Z/87/11 104

J9)SIS0Y JUSUIISINGSI(] JMUOIPIH

enuade|d Jo 510



Placentia City Council

TO: CITY COUNCIL

VIA: CITY ADMINISTRATOR

FROM: DIRECTOR OF DEVELOPMENT SERVICES
DATE: DECEMBER 6, 2016

SUBJECT. SECOND READING OF ORDINANCE NO. 0-2016-07, ADOPTING STATE
MANDATED BUILDING AND FIRE CODES

FISCAL

IMPACT: NO FISCAL IMPACTS ARE ANTICIPATED WITH THIS ORDINANCE AS ALL
COSTS WILL BE RECOVERED THROUGH THE PLAN CHECK AND
INSPECTION PROCESS.

SUMMARY:

Every three years, the California Building Standards Commission adopts a new set of State
mandated model codes to regulate development and construction projects statewide. These
model codes are effective for all local jurisdictions unless a jurisdiction adopts local amendments
to the model codes. On November 15, 2016, a public hearing was held to receive public comment
on the proposed State mandated, updated Building and Fire related codes. No public comments
were received and the City Council unanimously approved the first reading of the Ordinance with
local amendments to the model codes. The recommended action will approve second reading
and adoption of the ordinance, which will take effect January 5, 2017.

RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the City Council take the following action:

1. Waive full reading, by title only, and adopt Ordinance 0-2016-07,an Ordinance of the City
Council of the City of Placentia, California repealing Chapter 18.04 of Title 18 and Chapters
20.03, 20.04, 20.08, 20.12, 20.16, 20.20 and 20.56 of Title 20 of the Placentia Municipal
Code and adopting by reference, the California Fire Code, 2016 Edition, the California
Building Code, 2016 Edition, the California Residential Code, 2016 Edition, the California
Plumbing Code, 2016 Edition, the California Electrical Code, 2016 Edition, the California
Mechanical Code, 2016 Edition, and the California Green Building Standards Code, 2016
Edition, Including All Appendices, with Certain Amendments, Additions and Deletions
Thereto, Including Fees and Penalties.

BACKGROUND:

The California Building Standards Commission reviews and revises the model codes that regulate
development and construction projects within the State of California every three years. The new

1.C.
Decambar & 2016



City Council/Successor Agency/ICDA Agenda
December 6, 2016
Page 2 of 2

model codes are then adopted by the State. California adopted the model codes in July 2016,
with an effective date of January 1, 2017. Although the models are effective without local adoption,
local adoption permits a city to amend the codes to reflect local conditions. The State Fire Marshal
is responsible for adopting the Fire Code updates and the City, as a member of the Orange County
Fire Authority (OCFA), defers the development of local amendments to OCFA.

DISCUSSION:

The City participated with all member cities of the Orange County Fire Authority to review the
updated codes as adopted by the California Building Standards Commission and the Fire Code
as adopted by the State Fire Marshal. The seven (7) State mandated codes which have been
revised for the 2016 cycle and adopted by the State are as follows:

» 2016 California Building Code * 2016 California Plumbing Code

* 2016 California Mechanical Code * 2016 California Electrical Code

* 2016 California Green Building Standards Code ¢ 2016 California Residential Code
* 2016 California Fire Code (State Fire Marshal)

Per California Government Code § 50022.2, the model codes may be adopted by reference,
without the necessity of publishing the entirety of the model codes. Local adoption of such codes
is mandated on January 1, 2017, and requires approval of the City Council. Prior to such adoption,
jurisdictional bodies may amend said codes if such amendments are justified on the basis of a
local climatic, local geological or topographical condition which makes such amendments
necessary. The proposed local amendments reflect local climactic, geographic, or geological
conditions that are unique to Placentia.

Prepared by: Reviewed and approved:
%ﬁé&-—- e

Joseph M™ambert Damien-R-Arfula

Director of Development Services City Administrator

Attachment:

Ordinance No. 0-2016-07



ORDINANCE NO. 0-2016-07

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
PLACENTIA, CALIFORNIA, REPEALING CHAPTER 18.04 OF TITLE
18 AND CHAPTERS 20.03, 20.04, 20.08, 20.12, 20.16, 20.20
AND 20.56 OF TITLE 20 OF THE PLACENTIA MUNICIPAL CODE
AND ADOPTING BY, REFERENCE, THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE,
2016 EDITION, THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE, 2016
EDITION, THE CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE, 2016 EDITION,
THE CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE, 2016 EDITION, THE
CALIFORNIA ELECTRICAL CODE, 2016 EDITION, CALIFORNIA
MECHANICAL CODE, 2016 EDITION, AND THE CALIFORNIA GREEN
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE, 2016 EDITION, INCLUDING ALL
APPENDICES, WITH CERTAIN AMENDMENTS, ADDITIONS AND
DELETIONS THERETO, INCLUDING FEES AND PENALTIES.

City Attorney’s Summary

This Ordinance repeals existing provisions of Titles 18 and 20
of the Placentia Municipal Code and adopts new standards and
codes regulating and governing the safeqguarding of 1life and
property from fire and explosion hazards arising from the
storage, handling and use of hazardous substances, materials and
devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in
the occupancy of buildings and premises in the City as well as
prescribing regulations for erecting, construction, enlargement,
alteration, repair, improving, removal, conversion, demolition,
occupancy, equipment use, height, and area of buildings and
structures. This Ordinance adopts, by reference, the California
Fire Code, 2016 Edition, and codes adopted by the California
Building Standards Commission, including the California Building
Code, 2016 Edition, the California Residential Code, 2016 Edition,
the California Green Building Standards Code, 2016 Edition; the
California Plumbing Code, 2016 Edition, the California Mechanical
Code, 2016 Edition, the California Electrical Code, 2016 Edition
and provides for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefor and establishing penalties for violation(s) thereof.

A. Recitals.

1. WHEREAS, pursuant to California Government Code Section
50022.1 et seqg. the City of Placentia may adopt by
reference the California Building Standards Code, 2016
Edition as provided in Title 24 of the California Code of
Regulations and other model codes; and

2. WHEREAS, the California Building Standards Commission

Otdinance No. O-2016-07
Page 1 of 69



("Commission") recently adopted the 2016 Edition of the
California Building Standards Code; and

3. WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code Section 17958.7
and 18941.5 authorize cities to adopt the California
Building Standards Code with modifications determined to be
reasonably necessary because of local climatic, geological
or topographical conditions; and

4. WHEREAS, the City desires to adopt the California Building
Standards Code and other model codes with the necessary
amendments to assure the Codes are tailored to the
particular safety needs of the City as required by its
unique climatic, geological and topographical conditions;
and

5. WHEREAS, the Orange County Fire Marshall and Building
Official have recommended that changes and modifications be
made to the California Building Standards Code, and have
advised that certain changes and modifications to said Code
are reasonably necessary due to local conditions within the
City, and have further advised that the remainder of the
said changes and modifications are of an administrative or
procedural nature, or concern themselves with subjects not
covered by the Code, or are reasonably necessary to
safeguard life and property within the City; and

6. WHEREAS, the Fire Marshall and Building Official have also
recommended that changes and modifications be made to the
California Building Standards Code, which are necessary for
administrative clarification and to establish
administrative standards for the effective enforcement of
the building standards of the City and do not modify a
building standard pursuant to California Health & Safety
Code Section 17958, 17958.7, and/or 18941.5; and

7. WHEREAS, the City held a public hearing on November 15,
2016, at which time all interested persons had the
opportunity to appear and be heard on the matter of
adopting the Codes as amended herein; and

8. WHEREAS, the City published notice of the aforementioned
public hearing pursuant to California Government Code
Section 6066 on November 4, 2016 and November 11, 2016; and
of the Government Code; and

Otdinance No.
Page 2 of 69



9. WHEREAS, any and all other legal prerequisites relating to
the adoption of this Ordinance have occurred.

B. Ordinance.

The City Council of the City of Placentia does ordain
as follows:

SECTION 1. In all respects as set forth in the Recitals,
Part A., of this Ordinance.

SECTION 2. Purpose. The purpose of this ordinance is to
adopt by reference the latest edition of the 2016 California
Building Code which incorporates and amends the International
Building Code, 2012 Edition; the 2016 California Electrical
Code, which incorporates and amends the Naticnal Electrical
Code, 2011 Edition; the 2016 California Mechanical Code, which
incorporates and amends the Uniform Mechanical Code, 2012
Edition; the 2016 California Plumbing Code, which incorporates
and amends the Uniform Plumbing Code, 2012 Edition; the 2016

California Fire Code, which 1incorporates and amends the
International Fire Code, 2012 Edition; the 2016 California
Residential Code, which incorporates and amends the

International Residential Code, 2012 Edition, and the 2016 of
the California Green Building Standards Code.

SECTION 3. Authority. Pursuant to Government Code section
50022.2, the City Council adopts this ordinance adopting by
reference the California Building Standards Code (California
Code of Regulations, Title 24) as required and/or permitted by
state statutes, including Health and Safety Code sections 17922,
18938 and 18941.5.

SECTION 4. Findings. The City Council made findings that
the proposed amendments to the Codes are reasonably necessary
because of local climatic, geologic or topographic conditions.
The findings are supported and based upon the express findings
and determinations, set forth in Resolution No. R-2016-62,
adopted November 15, 2016.

SECTION 5. Amendment. Chapter 18.04 of Title 18 and
Chapters 20.03, 20.04, 20.08, 20.12, 20.16, and 20.20 of Title
20 of the Placentia Municipal Code hereby are repealed, in their
entirety; provided, however, that said repeal shall not vitiate
any permit or entitlement issued thereunder and, further, said
repeal shall not apply to or excuse any violation(s) thereof
occurring prior to the effective date of this ordinance and
provided further that the codes thereby adopted, as previously
adopted by reference and amended by ordinances of this City,

Ourdinance No.
Page 3 of 69



shall continue to be applicable to construction wherein plans
have been submitted for plan check as of the effective date of
this ordinance so long as the initial permit therefor is issued
no later than thirty (30) days after the effective date of this
Ordinance.

Section 6. A new Chapter 18.04 hereby is added to
Title 18 of the Placentia Municipal Code to read, in words
and figures, as follows:

“Chapter 18.04

“California Fire Code, 2016 Edition

“Sections:
“18.04.010 Title
“18.04.020 Purpose
“18.04.030 Adoption of Fire Code
“18.04.040 Definition of Terms
“18.04.050 Amendments to Fire Code
“18.04.060 Enforcement and Inspections
“18.04.070 Fees
“18.04.080 Copy filed

“Section 18.04.010 - Title.
“This Chapter shall be known as the ‘Placentia Fire Code.’
“Section 18.04.020 - Purpose.

“"The purpose of this Chapter is to prescribe regulations and
govern the safeguarding of 1life and property from fire and
explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of
hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from conditions
hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of buildings and
premises as herein provided.

“"Section 18.04.030 - Adoption of Fire Code.

“There hereby 1is adopted as the ‘Placentia Fire Code,’
except as otherwise provided in this Chapter, that certain code
known and designated as the California Fire Code, 2016 Edition,
based on the 2012 International Fire Code published by the
International Code Council, as set forth in Title 24, Part 9 of
the California Code of Regulations, including all appendices
thereto and including all amendments made herein, and such Code

Otdinance No.
Page 4 of 69



shall be and become the Fire Code of the City of Placentia, to
regulate and govern the safeguarding of life and property from
fire and explosion hazards arising from the storage, handling
and use of hazardous substances, materials and devices, and from
conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of
buildings and premises as herein provided.

“"Whenever the California Code of Regulations and State
Building Standards Code of Regulations differ from any provision
of the Placentia Fire Code, said State regulations shall prevail
over the provisions of the Placentia Fire Code except as
specifically modified herein.

“Section 18.04.040 - Definition of Terms.
“Whenever any of the following names or terms are used in
the California Fire Code, each such name or term shall be deemed

and construed to have the meaning ascribed to it in this section
as follows:

“(A) ‘Building department’ means the ‘building and safety
division’ of the City.

“(B) ‘Building official’ means the chief building official
of the City as appointed by the City Administrator of the City,
or his or her designee.

" (C) ‘City’ means the City of Placentia.

“ (D) ‘Fire code official’ means the Director of Fire
Services of the Orange County Fire Authority, or his or her
designee.

“(E) ‘Jurisdiction’ means the City of Placentia.

“(F) ‘Local Enforcing Agency’ means the Orange County Fire
Authority or the Building Official of City.

“(G) ‘OCFA" Orange County Fire Authority, fire
authority having jurisdiction.

“Section 18.04.050 - Amendments to Fire Code.

“"The following provisions of the California Fire Code
hereby are amended to read, in words and figures, as follows:

“Section 109.4. Violation =~ Penalties hereby revised as

Ordinance No.
Page 5 of 69



follows:

109.4 Violation penalties. Persons who shall violate a
provision of this code or shall fail to comply with any of
the requirements thereof or shall fail to comply with any
issued orders or notices or who shall erect, install,
alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved
construction documents or directive of the fire code
official, or of a ©permit or certificate wused under

provisions of this code, shall—be—guitty—of—a——[SPRCIEY
OFFENSE}—punishable—by—afine—of not—more—than—{AMOUNT}

er—both—suech—fine—and—dmprisenment shall result 1in

penalties assessed as prescribed in the OCFA Prevention
Field Services adopted fee schedule. FEach day that a
violation continues after due notice has been served shall
be deemed a separate offense.

Section 109.4.2 Infraction and misdemeanor is hereby added as
follows:

109.4.2 Infraction and misdemeanor. Persons operating or
maintaining any occupancy, premises or vehicle subject to
this code that shall permit any fire or life safety hazard
to exist on premises under their control shall be guilty of
an infraction. Persons who fail to take immediate action to
abate a fire or life safety hazard when ordered or notified
to do so by the chief or a duly authorized representative
are guilty of a misdemeanor.

Chapter 2

Definitions

Chapter 2 Definitions 1is adopted in 1ts entirety with the
following amendments:

Sections 202 General Definitions is hereby revised by adding
“OCFA,” “Sky Lantern,” and “Spark Arrester” as follows:

202 General Definitions

OCFA: Orange County Fire Authority, fire authority having
jurisdiction.

SKY LANTERN. An airborne lantern typically made of paper,

Otrdinance No.
Page 6 of 69



Mylar, or other lightweight material with a wood, plastic,
or metal frame containing a candle, fuel cell, or other
heat source that provides buoyancy.

SPARK ARRESTER. A listed device constructed of
noncombustible material specifically for the purpose of
meeting one of the following conditions:

1. Removing and retaining carbon and other flammable
particles/debris from the exhaust flow of an internal
combustion engine 1in accordance with California Vehicle
Code Section 38366. '

2. Fireplaces that burn solid fuel in accordance with
California Building Code Chapter 28.

Chapter 3

General Requirements

Chapter 3 General Requirements is adopted in its entirety with
the following amendments:

Section 304.1.2 Vegetation is hereby revised as follows:

304.1.2 Vegetation. Type, amount, or arrangement of weeds,
Weeds;—grass, vines or other growth that is capable of
being ignited and endangering property—needing to comply
with OCFA Guidelines, shall be cut dewn, thinned, and
removed by the owner or occupant of the premises in
accordance with OCFA Guideline C-05 “Vegetation Management
Guideline—Technical Design for New Construction, Fuel
Modification Plans, and Maintenance Program. Vegetation
clearance requirement in urban-wildland interface areas
shall be in accordance with Chapter 49.

Section 305.6 Hazardous Conditions is hereby added as follows:

305. 6 Hazardous conditions. Outdoor fires are not allowed
when predicted sustained winds exceed 8 MPH during periods
when relative humidity is less than 25%, or a red flag
condition has been declared or public announcement 1is made,
when an official sign was caused to be posted by the fire
code official, or when such fires present a hazard as
determined by the fire code official.

Section 305.7 Disposal of rubbish is hereby added as follows:

Ordinance No.
Page 7 of 69



305.7 Disposal of rubbish. Rubbish, trash or combustible
waste material shall be burned only within an approved
incinerator and in accordance with Section 307.2.1.

Section 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES AND PORTABLE
OUTDOOR FIREPLACES is hereby amended as follows:

SECTION 307 OPEN BURNING, RECREATIONAL FIRES, FIRE PITS,
FIRE RINGS, AND PORTABLE OUTDOOR FIREPLACES

Sections 307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or
similar devices used at Group R Occupancies is hereby added as
follows:

307.6 Outdoor Fireplaces, Fire Pits, Fire Rings, or similar
devices used at Group R Occupancies. Outdoor fireplaces,
fire pits, fire rings, or similar exterior devices used at
Group R shall comply with this section.

Exception: Barbeques, grills, and other portable devices
intended solely for cooking.

Section 307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices is hereby added as follows:

307.6.1 Gas-fueled devices. Outdoor fireplaces, fire pits
and similar devices fueled by natural gas or liquefied-
petroleum gas are allowed when approved by the Building
Department and the device is designed to only burn a gas
flame and not wood or other solid fuel. At R-3
occupancies, combustible construction shall not be located
within three feet of an atmospheric column that extends
vertically from the perimeter of the device. At other R
occupancies, the minimum distance shall be ten feet. Where
a permanent Building Department approved hood and vent is
installed, combustible construction may encroach upon this
column between the bottom of the hood and the vent

opening. Where chimneys or vents are installed, they shall
have a spark arrester as defined in Section 202.

Section 307.6.2 Devices using wood or fuels other than natural
gas or liquefied-petroleum gas is hereby added as follows:

307.6.2 Devices using wood or fuels other than natural gas
or liquefied-petroleum gas. Fireplaces burning wood or
other solid fuel shall be constructed in accordance with
the California Building Code. Fires in a fireplace shall be

Ordinance No.
Page 8 of 69



contained within a firebox with an attached chimney. The
opening in the face of the firebox shall have an installed
and maintained method of arresting sparks. The burning of
wood or other solid fuel in a device is not allowed within
15 feet of combustible structures, unless within a
permanent or portable fireplace. Conditions which could
cause a fire to spread within 25 feet of a structure or to
vegetation shall be eliminated prior to ignition. Fires 1in
devices burning wood or solid fuel shall be in accordance
with Sections 305, 307, and 308.

Section 307.6.2.1 Where prohibited is hereby added as follows:

307.6.2.1 Where prohibited. The burning of wood and other
solid fuels shall not be conducted within a fuel
modification zone. Wood and other solid fuel burning fires
in devices other than permanent fireplaces are not allowed
within Wildfire Risk Areas (WRA) and Wildland-Urban
Interface Areas (WUI) or in locations where conditions
could cause the spread of fire to the WRA or WUI unless
determined by the Fire Code Official that the location or
design of the device should reasonably prevent the start of
a wildfire.

Section 309.2.1 Indoor charging of electric carts/cars is hereby
added as follows:

309.2.1 Indoor charging of electric carts/cars. Indoor
charging of electric carts/cars where the combined volume
of all battery electrolyte exceeds 50 gallons shall comply
with following:
1. Spill control and neutralization shall be provided and
comply with Section 608.5.
2. Room ventilation shall be provided and comply with
Section 608.6.1
3. Signage shall be provided and comply with Section
608.7.1
4. Smoke detection shall be provided and comply with
Section 608.9.

Section 320 Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction
is hereby added as follows:

320 Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction.
All new structures and facilities adjoining land containing
hazardous combustible vegetation shall be approved and in
accordance with the requirements of OCFA Guideline C-05

Otrdinance No.
Page 9 of 69



“Vegetation Management Guideline — Technical Design for New
Construction Fuel Modification Plans and Maintenance
Program.”

Section 321 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from roadways
is hereby added as follows:

321 Clearance of brush or vegetation growth from roadways.
The fire code official is authorized to cause areas within
10 feet (3048 mm) on each side of portions of highways and
private streets which are improved, designed or ordinarily
used for vehicular traffic, to be cleared of flammable
vegetation and other combustible growth. Measurement shall
be from the flow-line or the end of the improved edge of the
roadway surfaces.

Exception: Single specimens of trees, ornamental shrubbery
or cultivated ground cover such as green grass, ivy,
succulents or similar plants used as ground covers, provided
that they do not form a means of readily transmitting fire.

Section 322 Unusual Circumstances is hereby added as follows:

322 Unusual circumstances. The fire code official may
suspend enforcement of the vegetation management
requirements and require reasonable alternative measures
designed to advance the purpose of this code if determined
that in any specific case that any of the following
conditions exist:

1. Difficult terrain.

2. Danger of erosion.

3. Presence of plants included in any state and federal
resources agencies, California Native Plant Society and
county-approved list of wildlife, plants, rare,
endangered and/or threatened species.

4. Stands or groves of trees or heritage trees.

5. Other unusual circumstances that make strict compliance
with the clearance of vegetation provisions undesirable
or impractical.

Section 323 Use of Equipment is hereby added as follows:

323 Use of equipment. Except as otherwise provided in this
section, no person shall use, operate, or cause to be
operated in, upon or adjoining any hazardous fire area any
internal combustion engine which uses hydrocarbon fuels,
unless the engine is equipped with a spark arrester as

Ordinance No.
Page 10 of 69



defined in Section 202 maintained in effective working
order, or the engine is constructed, equipped and maintained
for the prevention of fire.

Exceptions:

1. Engines used to provide motor power for trucks, truck
tractors, buses, and passenger vehicles, except
motorcycles, are not subject to this section if the
exhaust system is equipped with a muffler as defined in
the Vehicle Code of the State of California.

2.5 Turbocharged engines are not subject to this
section if all exhausted gases pass through the
rotating turbine wheel, there is no exhaust bypass to
the atmosphere, and the turbocharger is in good
mechanical condition

Section 323.1 Spark Arresters is hereby added as follows:

323.1 Spark arresters. Spark arresters shall comply with
Section 202, and when affixed to the exhaust system of
engines or vehicles subject to Section 323 shall not be
placed or mounted in such a manner as to allow flames or
heat from the exhaust system to ignite any flammable
material.

Section 324 Sky Lanterns or similar devices is hereby added as
follows:

324 Sky Lanterns or similar devices. The ignition and/or
launching of a Sky Lantern or similar device is prohibited.

Chapter 4

Emergency Planning and Preparedness

Chapter 4: Emergency Planning and Preparedness. Adopt only the
sections, subsections, and amendment listed below:

401

401.3.4

401.9

402

403.2

404.5 - 404.6.6
407

Ordinance No.
Page 11 of 69



Section 407.5 is revised as follows:

407 .5 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement. Where
required by the fire code official, each application for a
permit shall include—a—HazardeusMaterials Inventory
Statement—OCFA’s Chemical Classification Packet in
accordance with Section 5001.5.2.

Chapter 5

Fire Service Features

Chapter 5 Fire Service Features is adopted in its entirety with
the following amendments:

SECTION 501.1 Scope is revised as follows:

501.1 Scope. Fire service features for buildings,
structures and premises shall comply with this chapter and,
where required by the fire code official, with OCFA
Guideline B-09, “Fire Master Plan for Commercial §&
Residential Development.” Fire service features for
buildings, structures and premises located in State
Responsibility Areas shall also comply with OCFA Guideline
B-09a, “Fire Safe Development in State Responsibility
Areas.”

Section 510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage is revised as
follows:

510.1 Emergency responder radio coverage in new buildings.
All new buildings shall have approved radio coverage for
emergency responders within the building based upon the
existing coverage levels of the public safety communication
systems of the jurisdiction at the exterior of the
building. This section shall not require improvement of
the existing public safety communication systems. The
Emergency Responder Radio Coverage System shall comply with
the local authority having jurisdiction’s ordinance and
this code.

Exceptions:

A () ST e eia] ke £
‘o official L e a '

Otdinance No.
Page 12 of 69



, i } ; 1led ; . i | of

an—approved—radioco—coverage system-

2+ 1. Where it is determined by the fire code official
that the radio coverage system is not needed.

3+ 2. In facilities where emergency responder radio
coverage 1s required and such systems, components or
equipment required could have a negative impact on
the normal operations of that facility, the fire
code official shall have the authority to accept an
automatically activated emergency radio coverage
system.

This section shall not apply to the following:

1.

Existing buildings or structures, unless required by
the Building Official and OCFA for buildings and
structures undergoing extensive remodel and/or
expansion.

. Elevators.
. Structures that are three stories or less without

subterranean storage or parking and that do not exceed
50,000 square feet on any single story.

. Wood—-constructed residential structures four stories

or less without subterranean storage or parking that
are not built integral to an above ground multi-story
parking structure.

. Should construction that is three stories or less that

does not exceed 50,000 square feet on any single story
include subterranean storage or parking, then this
ordinance shall apply only to the subterranean areas.

Section 510.2 Emergency responder radio coverage in existing
buildings is deleted without replacement:

Section 510.4.2.2 Technical Criteria is revised as follows:

510.4.2.2 Technical criteria. The fire code official shall
maintain a document providing the specific technical
information and requirements for the emergency responder
radio coverage system. This document shall contain, but not
be limited to, the various frequencies required, the

Otrdinance No.
Page 13 of 69



location of radio sites, effective radiated power of radio

sites, and other supporting technical information.

1. The frequency range supported from the 800 MHz Countywide
Communications System shall be 851-869 MHz (base
transmitter frequencies).

2. The frequency range supported to the 800 MHz Countywide
Communications System shall be 806-824 MHz (radio field
transmit frequencies).

3. A public safety radio amplification system shall include
filters to reject frequencies below 851 MHz and
frequencies above 869 MHz by a minimum of 35dB.

4. All system components must be 100 percent compatible with
analog and digital modulations after installation without
adjustments or modifications. The systems must be capable
of encompassing the frequencies stated herein and capable
of future modifications to a frequency range subsequently
established by the jurisdiction.

5. Active devices shall have a minimum of -50 dB 3%¥@ order
intermodulation protection.

6. All active in-building coverage devices shall be FCC Part
90 Type Certified

Section 510.5.1 Approval prior to installation is revised as
follows:

510.5.1 Approval prior to installation. Amplification
systems capable of operating on frequencies licensed to any
public safety agency by the FCC shall not be installed
without prior plan submittal, coordination and approval
from Orange County Communications and a copy of the
approved plan provided to ef the fire and building code
officials.

Section 510.5.2 Minimum qualification of personnel is revised as
follows:

510.5.2 Minimum qualifications of personnel. The minimum
qualifications of the system designer and lead installation
personnel shall include both of the following:

1. A valid FCC-issued general radio operator’s license.

2. Certification of in-building system training issued by a
nationally recognized organization, school or a
certificate issued by the manufacturer of the equipment
being installed.

i T ol Lt

Otdinance No.
Page 14 of 69



EIE’EEE.HSSMEN“ b I’E'Elggtf&EE Sli*“;;f“? ;EEEF.EHE“EE. sd

Section 510.5.3 Acceptance test procedure item 7 is revised as
follows:

510.5.3 Acceptance test procedure. When an emergency
responder radio coverage system is required, and upon
completion of installation, the building owner shall have
the radio system tested to ensure that two-way coverage on
each floor of the building is not less than 90 percent. The
test procedure shall be conducted as follows:

7. As part of the installation a spectrum analyzer or other
suitable test equipment shall be utilized to ensure
spurious oscillations are not being generated by the
subject signal booster. This test shall be conducted at
the time of installation and subsequent annual
inspections by the FCC licensed technician hired by the
property owner and an OCSD/Communications Division FCC-
certified technician.

Section 510.6.1 Testing and proof of compliance is revised as
follows:

510.6.1 Testing and proof of compliance.
The owner of the building or their representative shall
have the emergency responder radio coverage system shall—be
inspected and tested annually or where structural changes
occur including additions or remodels that could materially
change the original field performance tests. Testing shall
consist of the following:
ir ta-buildingcoveragetest as deseribed in -Seetion
5+0-5-3-—In-building system components shall be tested to
determine general functional operability.
2. Signal boosters shall be tested to ensure that
the gain is the same as it was upon initial installation
and acceptance.
3. Backup batteries and power supplies shall be
tested under load of a period of one hour to verify that
they will properly operate during an actual power outage.
If within the 1l-hour test period the battery exhibits
symptoms of failure, the test shall be extended for
additional l-hour periods until the integrity of the
battery can be determined.
4. Other active components shall be checked to
verify operation within the manufacturer’s

Otdinance No.
Page 15 of 69



specifications.

5. If noncompliance is found, the FCC licensed
technician will assess improvements necessary and provide
such information to OCSD Communications and the fire and
building code officials.

26. At the conclusion of the testing, a certification
report, which shall verify compliance with Section
510.5.3, shall be submitted to OCSD Communications and
the fire and building code officials.

Chapter 6

Building Services and Systems

Chapter 6 Building Services and Systems is adopted in its
entirety without amendments:

Chapter 7
Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction

Chapter 7 Fire-Resistance-Rated Construction is adopted in its
entirety without amendments.

Chapter 8

Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings

Chapter 8 Interior Finish, Decorative Materials and Furnishings
is adopted in its entirety without amendments.
Chapter 9

Fire Protection Systems

Adopt Chapter 9 Fire Protection Systems is adopted in its
entirety with the following amendments:

Section 903.2 Where required is hereby revised as follows:
903.2 Where required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems

in mew—buildings and structures shall be provided when one
of the following conditions exists: in—the lecations

Otdinance No.
Page 16 of 69



geseribed—in—Seetions 9632+ through 903212~

New buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable provisions
of Sections 903.2.1 through 903.2.19, an automatic fire-
extinguishing system shall also be installed in all
occupancies when the total building area exceeds 5,000

square feet as defined in Section 202, regardless of
fire areas or allowable area, or 1s more than two
stories in height.

Exception: Subject to approval by the Fire Code
Official, open parking garages in accordance with
Section 406.5 of the California Building Code.

Existing Buildings: Notwithstanding any applicable
provisions of this code, an automatic sprinkler system
shall be provided in an existing building when an
addition occurs and one of the following conditions
exists:

a. When an addition is 33% or more of the existing
building area, and the resulting building area
exceeds 5000 square feet

b. When an addition exceeds 2000 square feet and the
resulting building area exceeds 5000 square feet.

c. An additional story is added above the second floor
regardless of fire areas or allowable area.

Exception: Additions to Group R-3 occupancies shall
comply with Section 903.2.8 (2).

Section 903.2.8 Group R is hereby revised as follows:

903.

2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed

in accordance with Section 903.3 shall be provided
throughout all buildings with a Group R fire area as
follows:

Otdinance No.
Page 17 of 69

New Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system shall be
installed throughout all new buildings.

Existing R-3 Buildings: An automatic sprinkler system

shall be installed throughout when one of the following

conditions exists:

a. When an addition is 33% or more of the existing
building area as defined in Section 202, and greater
than 1000 sguare feet within a two year period; or,




b. An addition when the existing building is already
provided with automatic sprinklers; or,

C. When an existing Group R Occupancy is being
substantially renovated, and where the scope of the
renovation is such that the Building Code Official
determines that the complexity of installing a
sprinkler system would be similar as in a new

building.

Exceptions:

1. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to Group R-3.1
occupancies and not housing bedridden clients, not
housing nonambulatory clients above the first floor, and
not housing clients above the second floor.

2. Existing Group R-3 occupancies converted to Group R-3.1
occupancies housing only one bedridden client and
complying with Section 435.8.3.3 of the California
Building Code.

3. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code, Section 13113,
occupancies housing ambulatory children only, none of
whom are mentally ill children or children with
intellectual disabilities, and the buildings or portions
thereof in which such children are housed are not more
than two stories in height, and building or portions
thereof housing such children have an automatic fire
alarm system activated by approved smoke detectors.

4. Pursuant to Health and Safety Code, Section 13143.6,
occupancies licensed for protective social care which
house ambulatory clients only, none of whom is a child
(under the age of 18 years), or who is elderly (65 years
of age or over).

When not used in accordance with Section 504.2 or 506.3 of
the California Building Code, an automatic sprinkler system
installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.2 shall be
allowed in Group R-2.1 occupancies.

An automatic sprinkler system designed in accordance with
Section 903.3.1.3 shall not be utilized in Group R-2.1 or
R-4 occupancies.

Section 903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems is hereby
added as follows:

903.3.5.3 Hydraulically calculated systems. The design of
hydraulically calculated fire sprinkler systems shall not
exceed 90% of the water supply capacity.

Ordinance No.
Page 18 of 69



Exception: When static pressure exceeds 100 psi, and when
required by the fire code official, the fire sprinkler
system shall not exceed the water supply capacity
specified by Table 903.3.5.3.

TABLE 903.3.5.3
Hydraulically Calculated Systems

Design %
75—

80—

85—

I | I L
L
100 110 120 130 140 150 PSI

90

Chapter 10

Means of Egress

Chapter 10 Means of Egress is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 11

Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings

Chapter 11 Construction Requirements for Existing Buildings.
Adopt only those sections and subsections listed below:

1103.7
1103.7.
1103.7.
1103.7
1103.7
1103.8
1107
1113
1114
1115
1116

- 1103.7.8.2
- 1103.7.9.10

3
By il
8
.9
- 1103.8.5.3

Otdinance No.
Page 19 of 69



Chapter 20
Aviation Facilities

Chapter 20 Aviation Facilities is adopted in its entirety
without amendments.

Chapter 21
Dry Cleaning

Chapter 21 Dry Cleaning is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 22
Combustible Dust-Producing Operations

Chapter 22 Combustible Dust-Producing Operations is adopted in
its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 23
Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages

Chapter 23 Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities and Repair Garages
is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 24
Flammable Finishes

Chapter 24 Flammable Finishes is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 25
Fruit and Crop Ripening
Chapter 25 Fruit and Crop Ripening is deleted in its entirety.
Chapter 26
Fumigation and Insecticidal Fogging

Chapter 26 Fumigation and Insecticidal Fogging is deleted in its
entirety.

Otdinance No.
Page 20 of 69



Chapter 27
Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities
Chapter 27 Semiconductor Fabrication Facilities is adopted in

its entirety without amendments

Chapter 28

Lumber Yards and Agro-Industrial, Solid Biomass and Woodworking
Facilities

Chapter 28 Lumber Yards and Agro-Industrial, Solid Biomass and
Woodworking Facilities is adopted in its entirety with the
following amendments:

Section 2801.2 Permit is hereby revised as follows:

2801.2 Permit. Permits shall be required as set forth in
Section 105.6 and 105.6.29.

Section 2808.2 Storage site is hereby revised as follows:

2808.2 Storage site. Storage sites shall be level and on
solid ground, elevated soil lifts or other all-weather
surface. Sites shall be thoroughly cleaned and approval
obtained from the fire code official before transferring
weed—products to the site.

Section 2808.3 Size of piles is hereby revised as follows:

2808.3 Size of piles. Piles shall not exceed 25-15 feet in
height, +#56-50 feet in width and 256-100 feet in length.

Exception: The fire code official is authorized to allow
the pile size to be increased where a fire protection
plan is provided for approval that includes, but is not
limited to, the following:

1. Storage yard areas and materials-handling egquipment
selection, design and arrangement shall be based upon
sound fire prevention and protection principles.

2. Factor that lead to spontaneous heating shall be
identified in the plan, and control of the various

Ordinance No.
Page 21 of 69



factors shall be identified and implemented, including
provisions for monitoring the internal condition of
the pile.

3. The plan shall include means for early fire detection
and reporting to the public fire department; and
facilities needed by the fire department for fire
extinguishment including a water supply and fire
hydrants.

4. Fire apparatus access roads around the piles and
access roads to the top of the piles shall be
established, identified and maintained.

5. Regular yard inspections by trained personnel shall be
included as part of an effective fire prevention
maintenance program.

Additional fire protection called for in the plan shall
be provided and shall be installed in accordance with
this code. The increase of the pile size shall be based
upon the capabilities of the installed fire protection
system and features.

Section 2808.4 Pile Separation is hereby revised as follows:

2808.4. Pile separation. Piles shall be separated from
adjacent piles by—appreved—fireapparatusacecess—roads a
minimum distance of 20 feet. Additionally, piles shall have
a minimum separation of 100 feet from combustible
vegetation.

Section 2808.7 Pile fire protection is hereby revised as follows:

2808.7 Pile fire protection. Automatic sprinkler protection
shall be provided in conveyor tunnels and combustible
enclosures that pass under a pile. Combustible conveyor
systems and enclosed conveyor systems shall be equipped
with an approved automatic sprinkler system. Oscillating
sprinklers with a sufficient projectile reach are required
to maintain a 40% to 60% moisture content and wet down
burning/smoldering areas.

Section 2808.9 Material-handling equipment is hereby revised as
follows:

2808.9 Material-handling equipment. All material-handling
equipment operated by an internal combustion engine shall

be provided and maintained with an approved spark arrester.
Approved material-handling equipment shall be available for

Otrdinance No.
Page 22 of 69



moving wood chips, hogged material, wood fines and raw
product during fire-fighting operations.

Section 2808.11 Temperature control is hereby added as follows:
2808.11 Temperature control. The temperature shall be

monitored and maintained as specified in Sections 2808.11.1
and 2808.11.2.

Section 2808.11.1 Pile temperature control is hereby added as
follows:

2808.11.1 Pile temperature control. Piles shall be rotated
when internal temperature readings are in excess of 165
degrees Fahrenheit.

Section 2808.11.2 New material temperature control is hereby
added as follows:

2808.11.2 New material temperature control. New loads
delivered to the facility shall be inspected and tested at
the facility entry prior to taking delivery. Material with
temperature exceeding 165 degrees Fahrenheit shall not be
accepted on the site. New loads shall comply with the
requirements of this chapter and be monitored to verify
that the temperature remains stable.

Section 2808.12 Water availability is hereby added as follows:

2808.12 Water Availability. Facilities with over 2500
cubic feet shall provide a water supply. The minimum fire
flow shall be no less than 500 GPM @ 20 psi for a minimum
of 1 hour duration for pile heights up to 6 feet and 2 hour
duration for pile heights over 6 feet. If there is no water
purveyor, an alternate water supply with storage tank(s)
shall be provided for fire suppression. The water supply
tank (s) shall provide a minimum capacity of 2500 gallons
per pile (maximum 30,000 gallons) for piles not exceeding 6
feet in height and 5000 gallons per pile (maximum 60,000)
for piles exceeding 6 feet in height. Water tank(s) shall
not be used for any other purpose unless the required fire
flow is left in reserve within the tank at all times. An
approved method shall be provided to maintain the required
amount of water within the tank(s).

Section 2808.13 Tipping area is hereby added as follows:

Otrdinance No.
Page 23 of 69



2808.13 Tipping areas shall comply with the following:

1. Tipping areas shall not exceed a maximum area of 50 feet
by 50 feet.

2. Material within a tipping area shall not exceed 5 feet in
height at any time.

3. Tipping areas shall be separated from all piles by a 20
foot wide fire access lane.

4. A fire hydrant or approved fire water supply outlet shall
be located within 150 feet of all points along the
perimeter of the tipping area.

5. All material within a tipping area shall be processed
within 5 days of receipt.

Section 2808.14 Emergency Contact is hereby added as follows:

2808.14 Emergency Contact. The contact information of a
responsible person or persons shall be provided to the Fire
Department and shall be posted at the entrance to the
facility for responding units. The responsible party should
be available to respond to the business in emergency
situation.

Chapter 29
Manufacture of Organic Coatings

Chapter 29 Manufacture of Organic Coatings is adopted in its
entirety without amendments.

Chapter 30
Industrial Ovens

Chapter 30 Industrial Ovens is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 31
Tents and Other Membrane Structures

Chapter 31 Tents and Other Membrane Structures is adopted in its
entirety without amendments.

Chapter 32
High-Piled Combustible Storage

Chapter 32 High-Piled Combustible Storage is adopted in its
entirety without amendments.

Chapter 33

Otrdinance No.
Page 24 of 69



Fire Safety During Construction and Demolition

Chapter 33 Fire Safety During Construction and Demolition is
adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 34
Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage

Chapter 34 Tire Rebuilding and Tire Storage is adopted in its
entirety without amendments.

Chapter 35
Welding and Other Hot Work

Chapter 35 Welding and Other Hot Work is adopted in its entirety
without amendments.

Chapter 36
Marinas

Chapter 36 Marinas is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 37
Combustible Fibers

Chapter 37 Combustible Fibers is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 48
Motion Picture and Television Production Studio Sound Stages,
Approved Production Facilities and Production Locations

Chapter 48 Motion Picture and Television Production Studio Sound
Stages, Approved Production Facilities and Production Locations
is adopted in its entirety without amendments.

Chapter 49
Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas

Chapter 49 Requirements for Wildland-Urban Interface Fire Areas
is adopted in its entirety with the following amendments:

Section 4906.3 Requirements is hereby revised as follows:

4906.3 Requirements. Hazardous vegetation and fuels around
all applicable buildings and structure shall be maintained

Otrdinance No.
Page 25 of 69



in

Section

accordance with the following laws and regulations:

1. Public Resources Code, Section 4291.

2. California Code of Regulations, Title 14,
Division 1.5, Chapter 7, Subchapter 3, Section 1299
(see guidance for implementation “General Guideline to
Create Defensible Space”).

3. California Government Code, Section 51182.

4, California Code of Regulations, Title 19,

Division 1, Chapter 7, Subchapter 1, Section 3.07.

5. OCFA Guideline C-05 “Vegetation Management Guideline -
Technical Design for New Construction Fuel
Modification Plans and Maintenance Program.”

4908 Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction

is hereby added as follows:

4908 Fuel Modification Requirements for New Construction.

All new buildings to be built or installed in a Wildfire

Risk Area shall comply with the following:

1.

Preliminary fuel modification plans shall be submitted to
and approved by the fire code official prior to or
concurrently with the approval of any tentative map.

. Final fuel modification plans shall be submitted to and

approved by the fire code official prior to the issuance
of a grading permit.

. The fuel modification plans shall meet the criteria set

forth in the Fuel Modification Section of OCFA Guideline
C-05 "Vegetation Management Guideline - Technical Design
for New Construction Fuel Modification Plans and
Maintenance Program.”

3.1 The fuel modification plan shall include
provisions for the maintenance of the fuel modification
in perpetuity.

. The fuel modification plan may be altered if conditions

change. Any alterations to the fuel modification areas
shall have prior approval from the fire code official.

. All elements of the fuel modification plan shall be

maintained in accordance with the approved plan and are
subject to the enforcement process outlined in the Fire
Code.

Otdinance No.

Page 26 of 69



Chapter 50
Hazardous Materials - General Provisions

Chapter 50 Hazardous Materials - General Provisions is adopted
in its entirety with the following amendments.

Section 5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS),
is hereby revised as follows:

5001.5.2 Hazardous Materials Inventory Statement (HMIS).
Where required by the fire code official, an application

for a permit shall include anHMIS,—suchas—theSuperfund
| - I ; : - 1086 (SARA}_Tit]

HI—Fier—II Report—or—eotherapprovedstatements Orange

County Fire Authority’s—Chemical Classification Packet,

which shall be completed and approved prior to approval of

plans, and/or the storage, use or handling of chemicals on

the premises. The HMIS Chemical Classification Packet

shall include the following information:

Product Name.

Component.

Chemical Abstract Service (CAS) number.

Location where stored or used.

Container size.

Hazard classification.

Amount in storage.

Amount in use-closed systems.

Amount in use-open systems.

WCoOoOJoUbdWNR

Section 5003.1.1.1 Extremely Hazardous Substances is hereby added
as follows:

5003.1.1.1 Extremely Hazardous Substances. No person shall
use or store any amount of extremely hazardous substances
(EHS) in excess of the disclosable amounts (see Health and
Safety Code Section 25500 et al) in a residential zoned or
any residentially developed property.

Chapter 51
Aerosols

Chapter 51 Aerosols is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 53
Compressed Gases

Otdinance No.
Page 27 of 69



Chapter 53 Compressed Gases is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 54
Corrosive Materials

Chapter 54 Corrosive materials is adopted in its entirety
without amendments.

Chapter 55
Cryogenic Fluids

Chapter 55 Cryogenic Fluids is adopted in its entirety without
amendments.

Chapter 56
Explosives and Fireworks

Chapter 56 Explosives and Fireworks is adopted in its entirety
with the following amendments:

Section 5608.2 Firing is hereby added as follows:

5608.2 Firing. All fireworks displays, regardless of

mortar, device, or shell size, shall be electrically fired.

Section 5608.3 Application for Permit is hereby added as
follows:

Section 5608.3 Application for Permit. A diagram of the
grounds on which the display is to be held showing the
point at which the fireworks are to be discharged, the
fallout area based on 100 feet per inch of shell size, the

location of all buildings, roads, and other means of

t<ns1:XMLFault xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat"><ns1:faultstring xmlns:ns1="http://cxf.apache.org/bindings/xformat">java.lang.OutOfMemoryError: Java heap space</ns1:faultstring></ns1:XMLFault>